PITTSBURG COUNTY
SIX MONTH BIDS

Crushed Stone
Road Oils
Asphalt
Concrete
Laydown Machine With & Without Crew
Grader Blades
New & Used Steel
Hauling
Spiral Pipe
Arch Pipe
Plastic Pipe
Petroleum Products
Tires
Tire Service

January 1, 2015
THRU
June 30, 2015

Please note that the lowest bid will be the first bid listed for each item.

When using someone other than the lowest bidder, please specify the reason

when calling for a purchase order.



CRUSHED STONE

3/4" #1 COVER CHIPS NO BIDS

$ /.50 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
3/8" #2 COVER CHIPS $ 11.55 |DOLESE

$ 7.50 |[YOUNGMAN ROCK
3/8" NON SPEC CHIPS $ 10.55 |[DOLESE

$ 7.50 |YOUNGMAN ROCK
1/2" CHIPS $ 11.00 [STIGLER STONE

$ 7.50 |[YOUNGMAN ROCK
5/8" #3 COVER CHIPS $ 10.50 |STIGLER STONE
$ 11.30 |DOLESE

$ 7.50 |[YOUNGMAN ROCK
5/8" NON SPEC CHIPS $ 10.30 |DOLESE

$ 10.50 |STIGLER STONE

$ 7.50 [YOUNGMAN ROCK

3/4" COVER CHIPS $ 10.00 [STIGLER STONE
$ 1110 [DOLESE
1/2* MILL RUN NO BIDS

$ 6.40 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
11/2" MILL RUN #10 $ 8.00 |STIGLER STONE

$ 6.40 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
11/2" MILL RUN $ 8.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 8.85 [DOLESE

$ 0.40 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
11/2" MILL RUN "A* $ 8.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 9.80 |DOLESE

$ 6.70 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
11/2" ODOT BASE TYPE A $ 8.00 |STIGLER STONE

$ 9.65 |DOLESE

SIX MONTH BIDS
Crushed Stone JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



CRUSHED STONE

$ 3.25 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
#4 SCREENINGS $ 5.50 |STIGLER STONE
$ 8.45 |DOLESE

$ 6.20 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
#4 GRIZZLY CRUSHER RUN $ 8.00 |STIGLER STONE

$ 8.45 |DOLESE

$ 6.40 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
1" CRUSHER RUN $ 7.50 |STIGLER STONE
$ 8.05 |[DOLESE

$ 6.00 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
11/2" CRUSHER RUN $ 7.50 |STIGLER STONE
$ 8.05 [DOLESE

$ 6.50 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
7.50 |STIGLER STONE
$ 8.05 |DOLESE

21/2" CRUSHER RUN

=2l

8.00 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
8.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 9.85 |DOLESE

& |-~

NON-SPEC SHOVEL LOADED RIP-RAP

$ 10.50 [YOUNGMAN ROCK
12" SPEC RIP RAP $ 15.00 |STIGLER STONE

$ 18.75 |DOLESE

$ 7.50 |YOUNGMAN ROCK
8' DRY SURGE $ 8.00 |STIGLER STONE

$ 9.35 |DOLESE

SIX MONTH BIDS
Crushed Stone JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



ROAD OILS

$ 2.28 |COASTAL ENERGY
SS-1 $ 2.31 |ERGON

$ 2.46 [VANCE BROS.

$ 2.03 |COASTAL ENERGY
CRS-2 $ 2.09 [ERGON

$ 2.46 [VANCE BROS.
AC-S NO BIDS

$ 3.30 |[ASPHAILT & FUEL SUPPLY
MC-30 $ 3.48 |COASTAL ENERGY
MC-250 NO BIDS
MC-800 NO BIDS

$ 3.00 | ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
MC-3000 $ 3.08 | COASTAL ENERGY
CMS-1 NO BIDS

$ 2.46 [COASTAL ENERGY
AE-P $ 2.65 |ERGON

COASTAL ENERGY - PUMP CHARGE $70.00
DEMURRAGE $70.00
SHORT FREIGHT $475.00 LESS THAN 5,500 GALLON

VANCE BROS. - PUMP CHARGE $75.00
DEMURRAGE $70.00/HR.
MINIMUM LOAD 48,000 GAL.

ERGON - FEDERAL ENVIRONMENT FEE .4424 TON FOR
ASPHAIT & POLYMER LOADS & .00133 FOR EMULSION
LOADS

SIX MONTH BIDS
Road Oils JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



ASPHALT

PRICE PER TON

$ 5600 [GLOVER & ASSOCIATES
HM/HL TYPE B $  60.00 |JOB CONSTRUCTION

$ 6620 [CUMMINS CONST,

$ 5750 [GLOVER & ASSOCIATES
HM/HL TYPE C $ 6100 [JOB CONSTRUCTION

$  69.75 |CUMMINS CONST.

$ 8500 [TULSA ASPHALT (PLANT)
HM/CL $ 9850 |JOB CONSTRUCTION

6 11200 |[ULSAASPHALT

" |(DELIVERED)

JOB CONSTRUCTION - F.O.B. HARTSHORNE PLANT

Asphalt

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



LAYDOWN MACHINE

OVER 1,000 TONS
$ 15.00 [SMITH PAVING
WITH CREW & HAULING $ 19.00 |GLOVER & ASSOCIATES
$ 9.00 [SMITH PAVING
WITH CREW WITHOUT HAULING $ 12.00 |GLOVER & ASSOCIATES
UNDER 1,000 TONS
$ 18.90 [SMITH PAVING
WITH CREW & HAULING $ 19.00 |GLOVER & ASSOCIATES
$ 12.00 |GLOVER & ASSOCIATES
WITH CREW WITHOUT HAULING $ 12.90 [SMITH PAVING

SMITH PAVING - ADDITIONAL $0.25 PER MILE AFTER FIRST 20 MILES

Laydown Machine

& TACK OIL SHOT IN PLACE $3.50 PER GALLON

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



GRADER BLADES

5/8" BOLT HOLE

$ 49.00 |KIRBY SMITH
1/2'x 6 $ 69.35 [WARREN CAT

$ 86.23 [WARREN CAT

1/2'x 8

$ 58.45 |KIRBY SMITH
5/8'x6"x7 $ 70.61 |YELLOWHOUSE
$ 95.87 IWARREN CAT

$ 88.11 |YELLOWHOUSE
5/8"'x8"x 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 95.03 |KIRBY SMITH

$ 11113 [YELLOWHOUSE

3/4'x 8"x 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 113.72 |KIRBY SMITH
$ 98.48 |KIRBY SMITH
3/4"x8'x7 (NON CARBON) $ 119.44 [YELLOWHOUSE

3/4" BOLT HOLES
$ 49.00 |KIRBY SMITH
1/2"x 6' $ 97.34 IWARREN CAT

1/2"x 8 NO BIDS

$ 58.45 |KIRBY SMITH
5/8'x6"x7 $ 111.94 |[WARREN CAT

$ 95.03 |KIRBY SMITH
5/8' x 8"x 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 111.44 [YELLOWHOUSE

$ 113.12 |KIRBY SMITH

3/4'x 8" x 7' (HIGH CARBON)

$ 98.48 |KIRBY SMITH
3/4"x8"x 7 (NON CARBON) $ 14479 |WARREN CAT

SIX MONTH BIDS
Grader Blades JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



NEW AND USED STEEL

STEEL BEAMS

$ 0.51 |[SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
NEW $  0.5745 |THE RAILROAD YARD

$ 0.3140 |THE RAILTROAD YARD
USED $ 0.32 |SUNBELT EQUIPMENT

HI-PILE

$ 0.4830 |THE RAILROAD YARD
NEW $ 0.489 |SUNBELT EQUIPMENT

$ 0.35 |THE RAILROAD YARD
USED

HEAVY WALL PIPE PILING

6" NO BIDS
I NO BIDS

$ 15.90 | THE RAILROAD YARD
g

$ 2150 |[THE RAILROAD YARD
9"

DECKING

24 GAUGE NO BIDS

$ 119 |THE RAILROAD YARD
22 GAUGE $ 1.25 |[SUNBELT EQUIPMENT

$ 03500 [THE RAILROAD YARD (USED)
STRUCTURAL STEEL $ 0.51 |SUNBELT EQUIPMENT

$ 0.5125 |[THE RAILROAD YEAR (NEW)

$ 0.4800 |SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
SECONDARY STRUCTURAL STEEL $  0.4975 |THE RAILROAD YARD

$ 0.50 |[THE RAILROAD YARD
PLATE $ 0.50 |SUNBELT EQUIPMENT

New Used Steel

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



NEW AND USED STEEL

GRADE 60 REBAR

$ 0.28 |THE RAITROAD YARD
1/2' $ 0.28 |SUNBELT EQUIPMENT

$ 0.4690 |THE RAILROAD YARD
5/8'" $ 0.47 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT

GUARD RAIL

$ 8.25 |SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
NEW

$ 3.15 |THE RAILROAD YARD
USED $ 3.25 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT

SIX MONTH BIDS
New Used Steel JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



HAULING

10 WHEEFLER
HOURLY RATE $ 70.00 |GUESS TRUCKING
1 TO 50 MILES (ROUND TRIP) NO BIDS
51 TO 60 MILES (ROUND TRIP) NO BIDS
61 TO 70 MILES (ROUND TRIP) NO BIDS
71 TO 80 MILES (ROUND TRIP) NO BIDS
81 TO 90 MILES (ROUND TRIP) NO BIDS
91 TO 100 MILES (ROUND TRIP) NO BIDS
TRI-AXTLE
HOURLY RATE $ 75.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
$ 75.00 |GUESS TRUCKING
1TO 50 MILES (ROUND TRIP) $  150.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
51 TO 60 MILES (ROUND TRIP) $ 175.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
61 TO 70 MILES (ROUND TRIP) $ 200.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
71 TO 80 MILES (ROUND TRIP) $ 225.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
81 TO 90 MILES (ROUND TRIP) $ 250.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
91 TO 100 MILES (ROUND TRIP) $  275.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
18 WHEELER

HOURLY RATE 5500 PARRGTT TRUCKING
1TO 50 MILES $ 175.00 [PARROTT TRUCKING
51 TO 60 MILES $ 200.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
61 TO 70 MILES $  225.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
71 TO 80 MILES $ 250.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
81 TO 90 MILES $  275.00 |PARROTT TRUCKING
91 TO 100 MILES $ 300.00 |[PARROTT TRUCKING

SIX MONTH BIDS
Hauling JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



SPIRAL PIPE

16 GA. 2.66" (PRICE PER FOOT)

12* $ 7.68 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
15° $ 9.54 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
18" $ 11.45 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
21 $ 1312 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
24" $ 14.94 |[ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
30" $ 18.75 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
36" $ 22.24 | ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
42" $ 25.96 |[ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
48" $ 30.40 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
54" NO BID

60" NO BID

66" NO BID

72 NO BID

16 GA. 3.I"

10" NO BID

12" NO BID

15" NO BID

18" NO BID

21" NO BID

24" NO BID

30" NO BID

36’ $ 260.21 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
42" $ 32.62 |[ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
48" $ 37.12 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
54" $ 39.95 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT

SIX MONTH BIDS
Spiral Pipe JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



SPIRAL PIPE

16 GA. 3.1" - CONTINUED
60" $ 43.17 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
66" $ 46.21 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
72 $ 50.71 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
78" NO BID
84" $ 59.71 |[ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
90" $ 63.84 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
96" NO BID
102" NO BID
108" NO BID
14 GA. 2.6"
12° NO BID
15" $ 11.58 |[ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
18" $ 13.76 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
21" $ 16.00 |[ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
24" $ 18.56 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
30" $ 23.32 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
36" $ 27.86 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
42" $ 32.48 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
48" $ 36.71 |[ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
54" $ 40.92 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
60" $ 4547 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
66" NO BID
72 NO BID

SIX MONTH BIDS
Spiral Pipe JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



SPIRAL PIPE

14 GA.3.1"
24" NO BID
30" NO BID
36" NO BID
42" NO BID
48" $ 41.48 |[ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
54" $ 47.87 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
60" $ 58.33 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
66" $ 60.87 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
72" $ 64.00 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
78" NO BID
84" $ 74.33 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
90" $ 79.57 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
96" $ 85.18 |ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
102" $ 89.71 |[ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
108" NO BID
114" NO BID

Spiral Pipe

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



ARCH PIPE

16 GA. 2.66" (PRICE PER FOOT)

15 $ 1015 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
18’ $  12.05 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
2l $  12.29 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
24" § 1622 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
30° $  20.37 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
36° $ 2418 [ ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
42 $ 2816 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
48" NO BID

54" NO BID

60° NO BID

14 GA. 2.6"

15' $ 1235 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
18’ $ 1503 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
2r" $ 1752 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
24" $  19.87 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
30° $  23.99 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
36" $  30.66 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
42 $ 3427 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
48" $ 4435 [ROGER KEY EQUIPMENT
54° NO BID

60" NO BID

12GA.3/I"

o NO BID

06" NO BID

114° NO BID

SIX MONTH BIDS
Arch Pipe JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



ARCH PIPE

14 GA.3.1"

36" NO BID
42" NO BID
48" NO BID
54" NO BID
60’ NO BID
66" NO BID
72" NO BID
78" NO BID
84" NO BID
90" NO BID
96" NO BID
102" NO BID
108" NO BID
114" NO BID

SIX MONTH BIDS

Arch Pipe JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



PLASTIC PIPE

BLACK (20, 24' & 30")

1 $ 3.98 |ROGER KEY

$ 438 |DUBROSS, INC.
15 $ 5.87 |ROGER KEY

$ 6.50 |DUB ROSS, INC.
18" $ 7.91 |ROGER KEY

$ 8.75 |DUB ROSS, INC.
21" NO BID
24 $ 13.57 |ROGER KEY

$ 15.35 |DUB ROSS, INC.
- $ 19.35 |ROGER KEY

$ 21.50 |[DUB ROSS, INC.
e $ 26.02 | ROGER KEFY

$ 29.35 | DUBROSS, INC.
47° $ 31.78 |ROGER KEY

$ 35.92 |DUB ROSS, INC.
48 $ 40.74 |ROGER KEY

$ 4520 |DUB ROSS, INC.
- $ 66.48 |ROGER KEY

$ 75.70 |DUB ROSS, INC.

GREY (13' & 20")

1 $ 5.28 |ROGER KEY

$ 5.50 |DUB ROSS, INC.
15" $ 7.57 |ROGER KEY

$ 7.86 |DUB ROSS, INC.
18 $ 9.91 |[ROGER KEY

$ 10.37 |DUB ROSS, INC.
o $ 15.84 | ROGER KEY

$ 16.45 | DUB ROSS, INC.
» $ 16.16 |ROGER KEY

$ 16.69 |DUB ROSS, INC.
- $ 27.29 |ROGER KEY

$ 28.30 |DUBROSS, INC.

SIX MONTH BIDS
Plastic Pipe JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



PLASTIC PIPE

GREY (13' & 20') - CONTINUED

36" $ 31.64 | ROGER KEY

$ 32.53 | DUB ROSS, INC.
oy $ 39.06 |ROGER KEY

$ 4127 |DUBROSS, INC.
48" $ 52.20 |ROGER KEY

$ 54.17 |DUB ROSS, INC.
50" $ 74.67 |ROGER KEY

$ 78.90 |DUB ROSS, INC.

Plastic Pipe

SIX MONTH BIDS

JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



PETROLEUM PRODUCTS

ENGINE OIL, DIESEL OIL

HD-11, SAE 30 SF/CC, CD

1 GALLON CAN $ 13.05 |OK TIRE & AUTO
1QT/12 CASE $ 39.95 |[OK TIRE & AUTO
55 GALLON DRUM $ 495.00 |OKTIRE & AUTO
J.D. PLUS 50 SUPREME
1 GALLON CAN $ 1713 |YELLOWHOUSE
DELO 400 (MULTI-GRADE)
SAE 40 - 1 GALLON CAN $ 12.95 |OK TIRE & AUTO
SAE 30 -1 GALLON CAN $ 12.95 |OKTIRE & AUTO
15W401GALLON CAN $ 12.95 |OK TIRE & AUTO
SAE 40 BULK/GALLON $ 12.70 |OK TIRE & AUTO
SAE 30 BULK/GALLON $ 12.70 |OK TIRE & AUTO
DELO 400
15W40 BULK/GALLON $ 12.75 |OK TIRE & AUTO
API SERV-CE/Sg
15W40 1QT/12 CASE $ 39.25 |OKTIRE & AUTO
15W40 BULK/GALLON $ 9.90 |OKTIRE & AUTO
OIL EQUIVALENT TO PENZOIL
SAE 30 $ 34.95 |(OKTIRE & AUTO

ENGINE OIL - GASOLINE ENGINE (MULTI-GRADE)

SAE 30 1QT/12 CASE 34.95|0OK TIRE & AUTO
55 GAL. DRUM SE, SF/CC $ 532.80 |OKTIRE & AUTO
15W40 1QT/12 CASE $ 34.95 |OK TIRE & AUTO
I5W40 - 1 GALLON CAN $ 11.50 |OK TIRE & AUTO
SW20 - 1QT./12 CASE $ 36.95 |OKTIRE & AUTO
5W30 - 1QT./12 CASE $ 36.95 |OK TIRE & AUTO
QUAKER STATE
10W30-1QT./12 CASE $ 40.17 |OK TIRE & AUTO
5W30-1QT./12 CASE $ 40.27 |OK TIRE & AUTO
SYNTHETIC BLEND - GASOLINE
5W20-1QT./12 CASE $ 33.96 |OKTIRE & AUTO
SW30-1QT./12 CASE $ 33.96 |OK TIRE & AUTO

Petroleum Products

SIX MONTH BIDS

JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



PETROLEUM PRODUCTS

CLEANING SOLVENT

55 GALLON DRUM NON-STAIN $

395.00

OK TIRE & AUTO

LIFT OIL (TRUCK & EQUIPMENT)

55 GALLON DRUM SERIES 3 SAE-10WT. $

481.59

OK TIRE & AUTO

HYDRAULIC OILS ANTI-WEAR TYPER & O

TRANS-DIFF HYD

5 GALLON CAN ]D-303 $ 34.95 |OK TIRE & AUTO
55 GALLON DRUM ]JD-303 $ 395.00 |[OKTIRE & AUTO
BULK/GALLON JD-303 0.97|OK TIRE & AUTO

HYDRAULIC OIL TRANSMISSION (303)

5 GALLON CAN $ 34.95 |OKTIRE & AUTO
SUPER HYDRO 32
55 GALLON DRUM+A63:C93 $ 395.00 |OKTIRE & AUTO
JOHN DEERE HY-GUARD
5 GALLON CONTAINER $ 71.61 |[YELLOWHOUSE
T04 SPEC OIL (CAT HYDRAULIC)
TRANSMISSION OIL - 30 WT.

1 GALLON CAN $ 18.90 IWARREN CAT

$ 50.84 |OK TIRE & AUTO
5 GALLON CONTAINER

$ 98.00 IWARREN CAT
55 GALLON DRUM $ 575.06 |OK TIRE & AUTO

$ 1000.66 |WARREN CAT

DRIVE TRAIN OIL - 50 WT.

1GALLON CAN NO BIDS

$ 50.84 |OK TIRE & AUTO
5 GALLON CONTAINER

$ 98.00 [WARREN CAT

$ 575.06 |OKTIRE & AUTO
55 GALLON DRUM

$ 1000.66 |WARREN CAT

CAT HYDRAULIC OIL
10 WT.

1GALLON CAN $ 20.00 [WARREN CAT

$ 50.84 |OKTIRE & AUTO
5 GALLON CONTAINER

- ON $ 98.00 [WARREN CAT

$ 575.06 |OKTIRE & AUTO
55 GALLON DRUM

$ 100149 |WARREN CAT

Petroleum Products

SIXMONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015




PETROLEUM PRODUCTS

CG-4 ENGINE OIL

15W40
| CALLON CAN $ 1249 [OKTIRE & AUTO
S 1750 [WARREN CAT
5 GALLON CONTAINER 5 5000 [OKTIRE & AUTO
$ 8858 [WARRENCAT
A $  479.00 JOK TIRE & AUTO
S 04315 |WARREN CAT
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID, TYPE F
AUTO TRANS FLUID
DEX 1L, TYPE F - 1QT/12 CASE $ 3050 JOKTIRE & AUTO
DEXTRON 3 - 1QT /12 CASE $ 3050 JOKTIRE & AUTO
DRIVE TRAIN OIL
30WT. -1GALLON CAN NO BIDS
30 WT. -5 GALLON CONTAINER $  50.84 JOKTIRE & AUTO
30 WT. - 55 GALLON DRUM S 575.06 JOK TIRE & AUTO

SIX MONTH BIDS
Petroleum Products JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



TIRES

55.90 |JET TIRE

56.00 [OKTIRE & AUTO
68.95 |BEALE TIRE

76.95 |RED HORSE TIRE

ST205/75Rx15 HY

A |A | A A

6195 [OK TIRE & AUTO
62.00 |JET TIRE

7750 |BEALE TIRE

98.95 |RED HORSE TIRE

215/60Rx16 A/S

A |H A |

94.50 |JET TIRE
94.50 |OK TIRE & AUTO
185.95 [RED HORSE TIRE
NO BID

215x85x16 A/P

A |0 |

67.95 |JET TIRE

68.50 |OK TIRE & AUTO
83.00 |BEALE TIRE

89.95 |RED HORSE TIRE

ST225/75x15 HY

5| A | |

92.95 [OK TIRE & AUTO
105.95 [JET TIRE
18195 |[RED HORSE TIRE
NO BID

225/75Rx16 A/P

A | | A

90.67 |BEALE TIRE
95.64 |OKTIRE & AUTO
95.70 |JET TIRE

279.95 |RED HORSE TIRE

225/60VRx16  A/S

o |-A | A [

122.00 [JET TIRE
125.27 |BEALE TIRE
131.98 |OK TIRE & AUTO
449.95 |RED HORSE TIRE

225/60Rx18 A/S

& |-A ||

109.10 [BEALE TIRE
163.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
164.00 |JET TIRE

196.95 |RED HORSE TIRE

LT225/75Rx17 A/P

£ |A |- A

67.00 [JET TIRE

67.25 |OKTIRE & AUTO
100.91 |BEALE TIRE
124.95 |[RED HORSE TIRE

P235/75Rx15 A/S

AR |A A

SIX MONTH BIDS
Tires JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



TIRES

90.69 [OK TIRE & AUTO
JET TIRE

107.62 |BEALE TIRE
139.95 [RED HORSE TIRE

LT235/75Rx15 HY

A |A | A |7
O
)]
u
&)

$ 9550 [JET TIRE

LT235/75Rx15  M/S $ 10120 |OK TIRE & AUTO
RED HORSE TIRE

NOBID |BEALE TIRE

RS2l
Ju—
Qo
S
\O
w

$  149.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALETIRE
NOBID |JET TIRE
NOBID |OKTIRE & AUTO

LT235/75Rx15 A/T

$  104.49 [OK TIRE & AUTO
— - $  114.80 [BEALE TIRE

$  116.00 [JET TIRE

$  169.95 [RED HORSE TIRE

$ 10449 [OK TIRE & AUTO

$  116.00 |JET TIRE
235/85Rx16 A/P

$  199.95 [RED HORSE TIRE

NOBID |BEALE TIRE

124.72 |[BEALE TIRE

JET TIRE

319.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
399.95 |RED HORSE TIRE

265/60Rx17 A/S

A |A |- |A
—
~l
o)
o
o

122.73 [OK TIRE & AUTO
00 [JET TIRE

137.39 |BEALE TIRE
224.95 |[RED HORSE TIRE

265/70Rx17 A/T

A |A|A |5
—
(O8]
o
o
O

$  150.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
265/70Rx17 TUG i 118523 '033 ?;?%E;RE

$ 25995 |RED HORSE TIRE

§  147.0 |BEALE TIRE
— e

NO BID [JET TIRE

$ 158.79 |BEALE TIRE
$ 176.95 |JET TIRE
$
$

285/75Rx16 LUG 191.50 [OK TIRE & AUTO

269.95 |RED HORSE TIRE

SIX MONTH BIDS
Tires JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



TIRES

198.00 |JET TIRE

202.36 |OK TIRE & AUTO
210.70 |BEALE TIRE
279.95 |[RED HORSE TIRE

285/70Rx17 LUG

|||~

133.40 [JET TIRE

134.63 |OK TIRE & AUTO
147.95 [RED HORSE TIRE
160.00 |BEALE TIRE

215/75Rx17.5 HY

A |H ||

R

164.95 |JET TIRE

167.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
$ 173.24 |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID [BEALE TIRE

-

225/70Rx19.5 HY

$ 157.62 |OK TIRE & AUTO

$ 179.95 |JET TIRE

$ 179.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NO BID

225/70Rx19.5 M/S

185.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
212.00 [JET TIRE

236.95 |[RED HORSE TIRE
252.00 (BEALE TIRE

225/70Rx22.5 HY

& |||

275.95 [OKTIRE & AUTO
279.95 |JET TIRE SERVICE
359.95 [RED HORSE TIRE
372.93 |BEALE TIRE

285/75Rx24.5 HY

|4 | A |

297.95 |JET TIRE

298.00 |OKTIRE & AUTO
376.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
388.01 |BEALE TIRE

285/75Rx24.5 LUG

A |O | H |~

289.95 |JET TIRE

289.95 |OK TIRE & AUTO
349.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
366.05 |BEALE TIRE

295/75Rx22.5 LUG

AL | |

119.96 |BEALE TIRE
127.95 |[OK TIRE & AUTO
138.00 |JET TIRE

222.95 |RED HORSE TIRE

235/85Rx16 M/S

A |A O |

SIX MONTH BIDS
Tires JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



TIRES

235/85Rx16 LUG

$ 127.95

OKTIRE & AUTO

$ 138.00

JET TIRE

$ 22295

RED HORSE TIRE

NO BID

BEAILE TIRE

235/40Rx18 A/S

$ 96.07

OK TIRE & AUTO

$ 127.95

RED HORSE TIRE

NO BID

JET TIRE

NO BID

BEALE TIRE

245/55Rx18 A/P

$ 125.82

BEALE TIRE

$ 157.95

RED HORSE TIRE

$ 178.41

OKTIRE & AUTO

NO BID

JET TIRE

245/75Rx16 A/P

107.95

OKTIRE & AUTO

110.11

BEALE TIRE

115.00

JET TIRE

A |||

172.95

RED HORSE TIRE

245/75Rx16 M/S

115.00

JET TIRE

115.94

BEALE TIRE

122.52

OKTIRE & AUTO

189.95

LA |A | A |

RED HORSE TIRE

245/75Rx16 LUG

133.49

A

OKTIRE & AUTO

Rl

142.00

JET TIRE

239.95

Sl

RED HORSE TIRE

NO BID

BEALE TIRE

245/70Rx17 LUG

150.73

OKTIRE & AUTO

174.39

BEALE TIRE

189.00

JET TIRE

G |4 |A |

246.95

RED HORSE TIRE

245/75Rx17 A/P

123.66

BEALE TIRE

125.95

JET TIRE

131.39

OK TIRE & AUTO

A |A ||

217.95

RED HORSE TIRE

245/75Rx17 M/S

124.66

BEALE TIRE

125.95

JET TIRE

174.91

OK TIRE & AUTO

G |A A |

219.95

RED HORSE TIRE

Tires

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015




TIRES

$  169.00 |JET TIRE
$  236.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  128.99 [JET TIRE
. $ 13550 |OK TIRE & AUTO
S 142.79 |BEALE TIRE
$  198.05 |RED HORSE TIRE
$  128.99 [JET TIRE
———— $ 13213 |BEALE TIRE
$  133.6] |OK TIRE @ AUTO
$ 20095 |RED HORSE TIRE
$ 15300 |JET TIRE
I $  169.90 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 24905 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
S 7458 [OK TIRE & AUTO
5 10x1 AT $  89.00 |JET TIRE
$  109.05 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 7458 |JOK TIRE & AUTO
$  89.00 [JET TIRE
25x100x12 A/T
x100x12 A/ S 104.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
S 23405 |RED HORSE TIRE
§ 32000 |JET TIRE
ORx22.5 HY
$  349.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
S 399.00 |BEALE TIRE
$  269.95 [JET TIRE
$ 29005 |RED HORSE TIRE
10Rx22.5 HY
S 370.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
S 380.03 |BEALE TIRE
$ 31000 [JET TIRE
S 387.86 |BEALE TIRE
225 LUG
10Rx22.5 LU S 49905 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |OK TIRE & AUTO
S 137.97 JOK TIRE & AUTO
§  139.95 |JET TIRE
5 B
S 5 S  173.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE

Tires

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015




TIRES

$ 14955 JOK TIRE & AUTO
. § 15195 |JET TIRE
$  173.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 27000 |JET TIRE
1025 M/ $  275.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  346.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
S 353.66 |BEALE TIRE
$ 24100 JOK TIRE & AUTO
a5 1Y $ 24800 |JET TIRE
$ 31695 |RED HORSE TIRE
$ 36610 |BEALE TIRE
$  322.05 |OK TIRE & AUTO
1925 [UG S 324.90 |JET TIRE
$ 35005 |RED HORSE TIRE
$ 41210 |BEALE TIRE
$ 27182 JOK TIRE & AUTO
4 s 1Y $  273.00 |JET TIRE
$  357.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 27891 JOK TIRE & AUTO
$ 289.00 [JET TIRE
11x24.5 M/S
x / $ 37205 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 27182 JOK TIRE & AUTO
Ro4s HY $  308.00 |JET TIRE
$  389.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 17150 |OK TIRE & AUTO
§  172.90 [JET TIRE
12x16.5 NHS
x S 18450 |BEALE TIRE
S 219.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
$ 31900 [JET TIRE
S 336.60 |OK TIRE & AUTO
13.6x28 Rl
3.6x $  374.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE

Tires

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015




TIRES

§  284.00 [JET TIRE
- $  285.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
' $ 33695 |RED HORSE TIRE
$  354.00 |BEALE TIRE
$  569.00 JET TIRE
& 0x34V R $  575.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  637.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  459.00 JOK TIRE & AUTO
175194 R4 $  469.00 [JET TIRE
$  492.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  607.95 |OK TIRE & AUTO
S 608.00 |JET TIRE
17.5x25 G-2
% $  699.05 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
§ 74500 JET TIRE
S 750.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
17.5x25 RL
x $  769.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  769.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
$ 117500 |JET TIRE
17.5x25 LUG
(% $ 1200.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 1248.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
205595 19 $ 1575.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
S 1580.00 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
§ 51500 [JET TIRE
$  546.88 |OK TIRE & AUTO
18.4x30 R1
= S 648.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
S 585.00 [JET TIRE
$  500.92 |OK TIRE & AUTO
4x34 RI
18.4x $  699.05 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
§ 67800 |JET TIRE
S 688.70 |OK TIRE & AUTO
18.4x38 R1
s $  798.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE

Tires

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015




TIRES

S 494.00 |JET TIRE
195524 R4 S 625.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
S 647.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
§ 84100 [JET TIRE
0838 R §  870.90 |OK TIRE & AUTO
§  1189.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
§ 8595 |OK TIRE & AUTO
750x16 TRIRIB 3 8700 JFT TIRE
$  109.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
§ 22495 JOK TIRE & AUTO
S e S 22500 |JET TIRE
§ 22895 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
§ 22995 [OK TIRE & AUTO
000x20 LUG (TUBE TYPE) > 23000 JETTIRE
$  236.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
S 247.95 |[RED HORSE TIRE
000520 LY S 294.00 |JET TIRE
§ 35972 |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 25295 |[RED HORSE TIRE
20050 ME NOBID |JET TIRE
NOBID |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
S 263.95 |[RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID [JET TIRE
0x20 LUG (MAX. TRACTION RDI.
200x20 LUG ( RACTIONRDL) NOBID |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 18500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
S 199.95 |[RED HORSE TIRE
9SORx16.5 A/P
el NOBID |BEALE TIRE
NOBID |JET TIRE

Tires

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015




TIRES

$ 14650 |JET TIRE
A p—— $ 14660 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 17495 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 25005 |RED HORSE TIRE
(00020 1Y $ 34500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 20005 |RED HORSE TIRE
00020 MIS $  353.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  194.95 [JET TIRE
1100x16 TRIRIE $ 19500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  227.95 |RED HORSE TIRE
S 24500 |BEALE TIRE
S 387.80 |RED HORSE TIRE
S 475.00 [JET TIRE
1400x24 G-2 (TBL PREMIUM
x ( ) S 475.88 |OK TIRE & AUTO
S 59500 |BEALE TIRE
5 439.80 |JET TIRE
S 468.80 |OK TIRE & AUTO
1400x24 G-2 (TBL ECONOMY
= ( ) $  562.51 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 60014 |RED HORSE TIRE
S 844.00 |BEALE TIRE
1400x24 G-2 (RADIAL TUBELESS
* ( ) S 850.00 |JET TIRE
S 902.95 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  200.00 |RED HORSE TIRE
§ 22400 [JET TIRE
11Rx22.5 (RECAPPED WITH CORE
( ) S 22000 |BEALE TIRE
NOBID |OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 200,00 |RED HORSE TIRE
§ 22400 [JET TIRE
11Rx24.5 (RECAPPED WITH CORE
+5( ) S 230.00 |BEALE TIRE
NOBID |OKTIRE & AUTO
S 250.00 |RED HORSE TIRE
$ 72500 |BEALE TIRE
ITH CORE
1400x24 (RECAPPED WITH CORE) LT i
NOBID |OK TIRE & AUTO

Tires
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JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015




TIRE SERVICE

PASS. & LT 14" - 16"

$ 7.00 |OKTIRE & AUTO
10.00 |RED HORSE TIRE
10.00 |JET TIRE

10.00 |BEALE TIRE

TIRE MOUNTS

A |H |

500 |[BEALE TIRE

7.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
10.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
10.00 [JET TIRE

TIRE CHANGES

A | A |A |

8.00 [OKTIRE & AUTO
8.00 |JET TIRE
10.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
10.00 |BEALE TIRE

WHEEL BALANCING

A A |

10.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
12.00 |RED HORSE TIRE
12.00 (JET TIRE

15.00 |BEALE TIRE

FLAT REPAIR

|4 | A |

PASS. &L T1

~

- 20"
10.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
10.00 |RED HORSE TIRE
15.00 |JET TIRE
15.00 |BEALE TIRE

TIRE MOUNTS

A | | |

8.50 [BEALE TIRE
10.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
10.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
15.00 |JET TIRE

TIRE CHANGES

RSl Ee 2l EC o B2

10.00 |[OK TIRE & AUTO
10.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
10.00 |JET TIRE

15.00 |BEALE TIRE

WHEEL BALANCING

A |A | A |

12.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
15.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
15.00 [JET TIRE

15.00 |BEALE TIRE

FLAT REPAIR

O |4 |~

SIX MONTH BIDS
Tire Service JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



TIRE SERVICE

TRUCK TIRE 20" - 24.5"

$  20.00 |RED HORSE TIRE
L RE MOUNTS $ 2500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  30.00 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  20.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
RE CHANGES $ 2500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  30.00 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  20.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
AT REPAIRS $  25.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  30.00 [JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
SPLIT RIM 20" OR SMALLER
$  20.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$ 3500 |BEALE TIRE
TIRE MOUNTS
$  40.00 |JET TIRE
$ 4500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  15.00 |BEALE TIRE
$  20.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
TIRE CHANGES
$ 2500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  40.00 [JET TIRE
$  20.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$ 3500 |BEALE TIRE
FLAT REPAIRS
$  40.00 |JET TIRE
$ 4500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
GRADER TIRES 1400x24
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$ 6500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
TIRE MOUNTS
$  70.00 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  30.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
$ 6500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
TIRE CHANGES
$  70.00 |[JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$ 6500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
T IR
FLATREPAIRS $  70.00 [JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE

Tire Service

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015




TIRE SERVICE

LOADER TIRES 17.5X25
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
TIRE MOUNTS $  75.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  80.00 [JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
TIRE CHANGES $ 6500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 8000 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
R REBAIRS $  75.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
$  80.00 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
1Lx15/11Lx16
$  10.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 1500 |JET TIRE
TIRE MOUNTS
$  20.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  10.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 1500 |JET TIRE
TIRE CHANGES
$  20.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  10.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
$  15.00 |JET TIRE
FLAT REPAIR
$  20.00 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
12x16.5 BOBCAT OR BACKHOE
$  15.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 1500 |JET TIRE
TIRE MOUNTS
$  20.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 1200 [OK TIRE & AUTO
$  15.00 |JET TIRE
EREEEHENGES $  20.00 |RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 1500 [OK TIRE & AUTO
$  15.00 |JET TIRE
FLAT REPAIRS $  20.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE

Tire Service
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JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015




TIRE SERVICE

14x17.5 BACKHOE
$  20.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
HIRE MOLNT $ 2500 |[OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 3500 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  20.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
T e $  30.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 3500 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  20.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
LT REPAIRS $  25.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  35.00 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
24" UP TO 17.51L.x24"
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$  40.00 |JET TIRE
TIRE MOUNT
$ 7500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$  40.00 |JET TIRE
TIRE CHANGES
$  40.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$ 4000 |[JET TIRE
FLAT REPAIRS
$ 7500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
19.51 x24
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
TIRE MOUNTS $  50.00 [JET TIRE
$ 7500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |BFALE TIRE
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$  40.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
TIRE CHANGES
$  50.00 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  30.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$  50.00 |JET TIRE
FLAT REPAIRS
$  75.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
NOBID |BEALE TIRE

Tire Service
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TIRE SERVICE

28" UP TO 13.6x28
$ 2500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
TIRE MOUNTS $  40.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
$  40.00 |JET TIRE
* NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 2500 [OK TIRE & AUTO
TIRE CHANGES $  40.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
$  40.00 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 2500 [OK TIRE & AUTO
FL AT REPAIRS $  40.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$ 4000 |[JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
ABOVE 13.6x28
$  30.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
TIRE MOUNTS $  40.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$ 4500 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  30.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
TR AN $  40.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
$ 4500 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 3500 [OK TIRE & AUTO
$  40.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
FLAT REPAIRS
$ 4500 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
34" ALL SIZES
$ 3500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
TIRE MOUNTS $  40.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
$  50.00 [JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$ 3500 |[OK TIRE & AUTO
$  40.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
TIRE CHANGES
$  50.00 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  40.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$ 4500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
AT REPAIRS
FL $  50.00 |[JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE

Tire Service
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TIRE SERVICE

38" ALL SIZES

$  40.00 |[RED HORSE TIRE
R E MOENTS $ 4500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 5500 [JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  40.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
TRE CHANGES $ 4500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 5500 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
$  40.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
T AT REPAIRS $  50.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 5500 |JET TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE
SERVICE CALLS
$  40.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
breneninEE $  40.00 [JET TIRE
$  60.00 |BEALE TIRE
$ 6500 |RED HORSE TIRE
$ 6500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
W\ FTER HOURS $ 7500 |BEALE TIRE
$  90.00 [JET TIRE
$  130.00 |RED HORSE TIRE
$ 2.00 [RED HORSE TIRE
$ 2.00 |JET TIRE
PER MILE
$ 2.00 |BEALE TIRE
$ 3.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$  50.00 |JET TIRE
DELAY CHARGE $ 5500 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 6500 |[RED HORSE TIRE
NOBID |BEALE TIRE

Base Charge: JET TIRE $40.00 IS THE MINIMUM CHARGE

BEALE TIRE - PLUS MILEAGE & ILABOR

After Hours: JET TIRE $90.00 PLUS MILEAGE
BEALE TIRE - PLUS MILEAGE & LABOR

JET Tire - $2.00 per running mile ($4.00 one way) from store to location.
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PET FOOD

PRICE PER POUND

$ 0.39 |TRACTOR SUPPLY
DRY DOG FOOD

$ 0.46 |TRACTOR SUPPLY
DRY PUPPY FOOD

$ 0.53 |[TRACTOR SUPPLY
DRY CAT FOOD

$ 0.75 [TRACTOR SUPPLY
DRY KITTEN FOOD

Asphalt

SIX MONTH BIDS
JANUARY 1, 2015 THRU JUNE 30, 2015



