

PITTSBURG COUNTY SIX MONTH BIDS

Crushed Stone
Asphalt Sand
Road Oils
Asphalt
Concrete
Grader Blades
Spiral Pipe
Arch Pipe
Plastic Pipe
Used Steel Pipe
New & Used Steel
Petroleum Products
Tires & Service
Hauling
Equipment Rentals
Copy Paper
Structural Gear (aka Bunker Gear)
Fire Hose
Wildland Gear

July 1, 2019
Through
December 31, 2019

Only awarded bidders are listed. If they cannot fulfill their obligation, please contact the Commissioners Office or the Purchasing Office for the next lowest bidder or in some circumstances a phone quote.

CRUSHED STONE

BID NO. 18-1

District #1	
South of Crowder-Blocker Road - Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)	
North of Crowder-Blocker Road - Stigler Stone	
All Chips awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)	
District #2	
All Materials awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)	
District #3	
All Materials awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)	
All Chips awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)	
#4 SCREENINGS	\$ 8.95 DOLESE
3/8" #2 COVER CHIPS	\$ 13.05 DOLESE
3/8" NON SPEC CHIPS	NOT AWARDED
3/8" P.U.C.M.	\$ 13.80 DOLESE
5/8" #3 COVER CHIPS	\$ 12.80 DOLESE
5/8" #3-C COVER CHIPS	\$ 12.95 DOLESE
5/8" NON SPEC CHIPS	NOT AWARDED
3/4" #1 COVER CHIPS	\$ 12.60 DOLESE
3/4" NON SPEC CHIPS	NOT AWARDED
1" TBSC TYPE A	\$ 9.50 STIGLER STONE
1" #67	\$ 11.00 STIGLER STONE
	\$ 11.45 DOLESE
1" #57	\$ 11.00 STIGLER STONE
1 1/2" #57	\$ 10.50 STIGLER STONE
	\$ 10.60 DOLESE
1 1/2" COARSE STONE	\$ 10.00 STIGLER STONE
1 1/2" CLASS B	\$ 10.00 STIGLER STONE
1 1/2" MILL RUN	\$ 9.50 STIGLER STONE
1 1/2" ODOT BASE TYPE A	\$ 9.50 STIGLER STONE
	\$ 10.40 DOLESE
1 1/2" ODOT BASE TYPE B	\$ 9.50 STIGLER STONE

CRUSHED STONE

BID NO. 18-1

1 3/4" to 1" STONE	\$	10.00	STIGLER STONE
2" MILL RUN #11	\$	9.50	STIGLER STONE
2" CLEAN ROCK	\$	10.00	STIGLER STONE
2" ASTM SIZE #4	\$	10.00	STIGLER STONE
	\$	11.05	DOLESE
2 1/2" ASTM #3	\$	10.00	STIGLER STONE
4" ODOT FILTER BLANKET	\$	10.50	STIGLER STONE
	\$	11.85	DOLESE
6" ODOT FILTER BLANKET	\$	10.50	STIGLER STONE
4" FILTER STONE	\$	10.00	STIGLER STONE
3/4" CRUSHER RUN	\$	8.00	STIGLER STONE
1" CRUSHER RUN	\$	8.00	STIGLER STONE
	\$	9.25	DOLESE
1 1/2" CRUSHER RUN	\$	8.00	STIGLER STONE
	\$	8.80	DOLESE
2 1/2" CRUSHER RUN	\$	8.00	STIGLER STONE
	\$	8.80	DOLESE
4" to 1 1/2" SPECIAL GRIZZLY	\$	10.50	STIGLER STONE
3" SURGE	\$	10.00	STIGLER STONE
	\$	10.95	DOLESE
8" SURGE	\$	10.00	STIGLER STONE
	\$	10.60	DOLESE
8" GABION STONE	\$	20.25	DOLESE
SHOT DOWN ROCK	\$	9.00	STIGLER STONE
	\$	10.35	DOLESE
6" to 8" RIP RAP	\$	15.00	STIGLER STONE
12" SELECT RIP RAP	\$	18.00	STIGLER STONE
	\$	20.25	DOLESE
18" SFT FCT RIP PAD	\$	16.00	STIGLER STONE

CRUSHED STONE

BID NO. 18-1

24" SELECT RIP RAP	\$	16.00	STIGLER STONE
	\$	20.25	DOLESE
30" SELECT RIP RAP	\$	16.00	STIGLER STONE
	\$	20.25	DOLESE
QUARRY RUN RIP RAP	\$	9.00	STIGLER STONE
NON SPEC MIXED STONE			NOT AWARDED
Decomposed Screened Granite	\$	4.00	BLESSING GRAVEL
Oilfield Rock (aka 1 to 1 1/2" Decomposed Screened Granite)	\$	6.00	BLESSING GRAVEL

Asphalt Sand	\$	8.00	MUSKOGEE SAND
--------------	----	------	---------------

STATE CONTRACT SW670

SS-1	\$	1.95	ERGON
CRS-2 (FOB) (DELIVERED)	\$	1.55 1.56	WRIGHT ASPHALT PRODUCTS
MC-30	\$	2.50	ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
MC-3000	\$	2.35	ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
AE-P	\$	2.31	COASTAL ENERGY
PG 64-22 OK ASPHALT BINDER (TON)	\$	535.00	ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
AC-20 ASPHALT BINDER (GALLON)	\$	2.25	ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY

WRIGHT ASPHALT PRODUCTS - PUMP CHARGE \$75.00

DEMURRAGE \$75.00/2 HRS. FREE

Minimum Load Charge = Less than 5,500 gal.
0.10 extra per gallon less

ADDRESS: 5 SULZER WAY
TULSA, OK 74131

ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY - PUMP CHARGE \$75.00

DEMURRAGE \$75.00/HR.

Minimum Load Charge = Less Than 5,500 gal. 0.10/gal.

COASTAL ENERGY -

PUMP CHARGE \$75.00

DEMURRAGE: \$75.00/HR. AFTER 2 HOURS

SHORT LOAD: \$425.00 LESS THAN 5,500 GALLON

ERGON - PUMP CHARGE \$70.00

DEMURRAGE: \$75.00/HR. AFTER 2 HOURS

MINIMUM LOAD: 5,600 GALLON

PLEASE NOTE:

THE LOWEST BIDDER MUST BE USED UNLESS UNAVAILABLE

STATEWIDE CONTRACT #SW690 MAY ALSO BE USED

ASPHALT

BID NO. 18-4

PRICE PER TON	
HOT MIX/HOT LAY, TYPE B	\$ 62.00 APAC CENTRAL/ARKHOLA
	\$ 60.75 CASH ENTERPRISES
HOT MIX/HOT LAY, TYPE C	\$ 64.00 APAC CENTRAL/ARKHOLA
	\$ 61.50 CASH ENTERPRISES
HOT MIX/HOT LAY S-4	\$ 58.00 JOB CONSTRUCTION
	\$ 60.75 CASH ENTERPRISES
HOT MIX/HOT LAY S-5	\$ 59.00 JOB CONSTRUCTION
	\$ 61.50 CASH ENTERPRISES
HOT MIX/COLD LAY (AT PLANT) (Delivered)	\$ 84.00 TULSA ASPHALT, LLC
	\$ 112.00
HM/CL (50 LB. BAG)MIN. 50 BAGS	\$ 10.50 LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT

STATE CONTRACT SW081

Cash Enterprises was awarded the bid for asphalt for everything north of Crowder/Blocker Road in District #1

APAC and JOB awarded for everything south of Crowder/Blocker Road in District 1

Hot Mix/Cold Lay as awarded for all Districts

APAC and JOB as awarded for Districts 2 & 3.

CONCRETE

BID NO. 18-5

3000 PSI		
TYPE A	\$ 108.00	TWIN CITIES
3500 PSI		
TYPE A	\$ 111.00	TWIN CITIES
4000 PSI		
TYPE A	\$ 114.00	TWIN CITIES

TWIN CITIES READY MIX - \$4.00/MILE IF MORE THAN 10 MILES
 Radius from plant

5/8" BOLT HOLE			
5/8" X 6" X 7'	\$	53.28	NOBLES EQUIP.
5/8" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON)	\$	76.00	NOBLES EQUIP.
3/4" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON)	\$	91.12	NOBLES EQUIP.
3/4" X 8" X 7' (NON CARBON)	\$	95.00	DUB ROSS
3/4" BOLT HOLE			
5/8" X 6" X 7'	\$	53.28	NOBLES EQUIP.
5/8" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON)	\$	76.00	NOBLES EQUIP.
3/4" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON)	\$	91.12	NOBLES EQUIP.
3/4" X 8" X 7' (NON CARBON)	\$	95.00	DUB ROSS

STATE CONTRACT SW501

SPIRAL PIPE

BID NO. 18-7

16 GA. 2.66" (PRICE PER FOOT)		
12"	\$ 7.68	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
15"	\$ 9.54	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
18"	\$ 11.45	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
21"	\$ 13.12	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
24"	\$ 14.94	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
30"	\$ 18.75	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
36"	\$ 22.24	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
42"	\$ 25.96	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
48"	\$ 30.40	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
16 GA. 3.1"		
36"	\$ 26.21	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
42"	\$ 32.62	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
48"	\$ 37.12	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
54"	\$ 39.95	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
60"	\$ 43.17	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
66"	\$ 46.21	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
72"	\$ 50.71	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
78"	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
84"	\$ 59.71	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
90"	\$ 63.84	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
14 GA. 2.6"		
12"	\$ 10.01	ALFORD METALS
15"	\$ 11.58	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
18"	\$ 13.76	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
21"	\$ 16.00	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
24"	\$ 18.56	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
30"	\$ 23.32	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
36"	\$ 27.86	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
42"	\$ 32.48	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
48"	\$ 36.71	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
54"	\$ 40.92	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
60"	\$ 45.47	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
14 GA. 3.1"		
42"	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
48"	\$ 41.48	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
54"	\$ 47.87	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
60"	\$ 58.33	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
66"	\$ 60.87	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
72"	\$ 64.00	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
78"	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
84"	\$ 74.33	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
90"	\$ 79.57	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
96"	\$ 88.18	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
102"	\$ 89.71	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
108"	\$ 104.79	WILSON CULVERTS
114"	\$ 110.54	WILSON CULVERTS

STATE CONTRACT SW0094

ARCH PIPE

BID NO. 18-8

16 GA. 2.6" (PRICE PER FOOT)		
15"	\$ 10.15	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
18"	\$ 12.05	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
21"	\$ 12.29	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
24"	\$ 16.22	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
30"	\$ 20.37	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
36"	\$ 24.18	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
42"	\$ 28.16	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
14 GA. 2.6"		
15"	\$ 12.35	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
18"	\$ 15.03	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
21"	\$ 17.52	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
24"	\$ 19.87	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
30"	\$ 23.99	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
36"	\$ 30.66	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
42"	\$ 34.27	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
48"	\$ 44.35	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
12 GA. 3/1"		
84"	\$ 111.92	WILSON CULVERTS
96"	\$ 124.45	WILSON CULVERTS
14 GA. 3.1"		
42"	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
48"	\$ 49.14	WILSON CULVERTS
54"	\$ 53.22	ALFORD METALS
60"	\$ 58.04	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
66"	\$ 63.54	ROGER KEY EQUIP.
72"	\$ 72.45	WILSON CULVERTS
78"	\$ 78.02	WILSON CULVERTS

PLASTIC PIPE

BID NO. 18-9

BLACK			
12"	\$	5.28	ROGER KEY
15"	\$	7.45	ROGER KEY
18"	\$	9.96	ROGER KEY
21"	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)		
24"	\$	16.53	ROGER KEY
30"	\$	23.68	ROGER KEY
36"	\$	31.76	ROGER KEY
42"	\$	39.63	ROGER KEY
48"	\$	52.21	ROGER KEY
60"	\$	81.96	ROGER KEY
GREY			
12"	\$	6.18	ROGER KEY
15"	\$	9.33	ROGER KEY
18"	\$	11.60	ROGER KEY
21"	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)		
24"	\$	18.58	ROGER KEY
30"	\$	29.77	ROGER KEY
36"	\$	34.44	ROGER KEY
42"	\$	41.56	ROGER KEY
48"	\$	55.91	ROGER KEY
60"	\$	81.74	ROGER KEY

STATE CONTRACT SW0094

USED STEEL PIPE

BID NO. 18-10

LOWEST BIDDER			
12"	\$	11.00	ALFORD METALS
16"	\$	19.00	ALFORD METALS
18"	\$	25.90	SUNBELT EQUIP.
20"	\$	22.00	ALFORD METALS
22"	\$	27.00	ALFORD METALS
24"	\$	26.00	ALFORD METALS
26"	\$	28.00	ALFORD METALS
30"	\$	48.06	ALFORD METALS
34"	\$	54.52	ALFORD METALS
36"	\$	57.00	RAILROAD YARD
42"	\$	67.44	ALFORD METALS
48"	\$	77.13	ALFORD METALS
54"	\$	86.82	ALFORD METALS
60"	\$	96.51	ALFORD METALS
7'	\$	202.62	ALFORD METALS
8'	\$	231.70	ALFORD METALS
8 1/2'	\$	235.00	RAILROAD YARD
9'	\$	235.00	RAILROAD YARD
9 1/2'	\$	235.00	RAILROAD YARD
10'	\$	235.00	RAILROAD YARD
2 3/8" USED DRILL TUBING (per foot)	\$	1.08	ALFORD METALS
2 7/8" USED DRILL TUBING (per foot)	\$	1.20	ALFORD METALS

If unavailable, drop to the next lowest bidder

STEEL BEAMS		
NEW	\$ 0.5445	RAILROAD YARD
USED	\$ 0.3150	RAILROAD YARD
HI-PILE		
NEW	\$ 0.5290	SUNBELT EQUIP.
USED	\$ 0.35	RAILROAD YARD
HEAVY WALL PIPE PILING		
6" - NEW	\$ 9.50	SUNBELT EQUIP.
6" - USED	\$ 7.50	SUNBELT EQUIP.
7" - USED		NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
8" - NEW	\$ 13.50	SUNBELT EQUIP.
8" - USED	\$ 10.50	SUNBELT EQUIP.
9" - NEW	\$ 16.95	RAILROAD YARD
9" - USED	\$ 15.95	RAILROAD YARD
DECKING		
24 GAUGE		NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
22 GAUGE (NEW)	\$ 1.39	RAILROAD YARD
STRUCTURAL STEEL (NEW)	\$ 0.5445	RAILROAD YARD
(USED)	\$ 0.3500	RAILROAD YARD
SECONDARY STRUCTURAL STEEL (NEW)	\$ 0.5000	RAILROAD YARD
PLATE (NEW)	\$ 0.5200	SUNBELT EQUIP.
(USED)	\$ 0.35	RAILROAD YARD
	\$ 0.35	SUNBELT EQUIP.
GRADE 60 REBAR		
1/2" (NEW)	\$ 0.3100	SUNBELT EQUIP.
5/8" (NEW)	\$ 0.4900	RAILROAD YARD
GUARD RAIL		
NEW (PER 25')	\$ 7.49	FENSCO
NEW (PER 12.5')	\$ 7.83	FENSCO
USED	\$ 2.95	RAILROAD YARD

ENGINE OIL, DIESEL OIL	
HD-1L, SAE 30 SF/CC, CD	
1 GALLON CAN	\$ 12.7077 HOOTEN OIL
1 QT/12 CASE	\$ 35.95 OK TIRE & AUTO
55 GALLON DRUM	\$ 615.47 HOOTEN OIL
J.D. PLUS 50 SUPREME	
5 GALLON CONTAINER	\$ 78.51 YELLOWHOUSE
DELO 400 (MULTI-GRADE)	
SAE 40 - 1 GALLON CAN	\$ 12.95 OK TIRE & AUTO
SAE 30 - 1 GALLON CAN	\$ 12.95 OK TIRE & AUTO
15W40 1 GALLON CAN	\$ 12.95 OK TIRE & AUTO
SAE 40 BULK/GALLON	\$ 12.85 OK TIRE & AUTO
SAE 30 BULK/GALLON	\$ 12.85 OK TIRE & AUTO
DELO 400	
15W40 BULK/GALLON	\$ 12.85 OK TIRE & AUTO
OIL EQUIVALENT TO PENZOIL	
SAE 30 / GALLON	\$ 38.34 HOOTEN OIL
SAE 30 / 1 QT./12 CASE	\$ 12.7079 HOOTEN OIL
ENGINE OIL - GASOLINE ENGINE (MULTI-GRADE)	
SAE 30 1 QT/12 CASE	\$ 33.50 OK TIRE & AUTO
55 GAL. DRUM SE, SF/CC	\$ 352.95 OK TIRE & AUTO
15W40 1 QT/12 CASE	\$ 33.50 OK TIRE & AUTO
15W40 - 1 GALLON CAN	\$ 12.95 OK TIRE & AUTO
5W20 - 1 QT./12 CASE	\$ 33.57 HOOTEN OIL
5W30 - 1 QT./12 CASE	\$ 33.57 HOOTEN OIL
QUAKER STATE	
10W30 - 1 QT./12 CASE	\$ 39.95 OK TIRE & AUTO
5W30 - 1 QT./12 CASE	\$ 42.50 OK TIRE & AUTO
SYNTHETIC BLEND - GASOLINE	
5W20 - 1 QT./12 CASE	\$ 33.57 HOOTEN OIL
5W30 - 1 QT./12 CASE	\$ 33.57 HOOTEN OIL
DEXOS FULL SYNTHETIC	
1 QT./12 CASE	\$ 48.50 OK TIRE & AUTO
MOTORCRAFT FULL SYNTHETIC	
1 QT./12 CASE	\$ 84.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
CLEANING SOLVENT	
55 GALLON DRUM NON-STAIN	\$ 316.25 HOOTEN OIL

LIFT OIL (TRUCK & EQUIPMENT)		
55 GALLON DRUM SERIES 3 SAE-10WT.	\$ 675.00	OK TIRE & AUTO
HYDRAULIC OILS ANTI-WEAR TYPERS & O		
TRANS-DIFF HYD		
5 GALLON CAN	\$ 29.95	OK TIRE & AUTO
55 GALLON DRUM	\$ 325.00	OK TIRE & AUTO
BULK/GALLON	\$ 8.6226	HOOTEN OIL
HYDRAULIC OIL TRANSMISSION (303)		
5 GALLON CAN	\$ 29.95	OK TIRE & AUTO
SUPER HYDRO 32		
55 GALLON DRUM	\$ 325.50	OK TIRE & AUTO
JOHN DEERE HY-GUARD		
5 GALLON CONTAINER	\$ 48.65	HOOTEN OIL
T04 SPEC OIL (CAT HYDRAULIC)		
TRANSMISSION OIL - 30 WT.		
1 GALLON CAN		NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
5 GALLON CONTAINER	\$ 53.32	HOOTEN OIL
55 GALLON DRUM	\$ 510.00	OK TIRE & AUTO
DRIVE TRAIN OIL - 50 WT.		
1 GALLON CAN		NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
5 GALLON CONTAINER	\$ 69.95	OK TIRE & AUTO
55 GALLON DRUM	\$ 525.00	OK TIRE & AUTO
CAT HYDRAULIC OIL		
10 WT.		
1 GALLON CAN		NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
5 GALLON CONTAINER	\$ 53.32	HOOTEN OIL
55 GALLON DRUM	\$ 525.00	OK TIRE & AUTO
CG-4 ENGINE OIL		
15W40		
1 GALLON CAN	\$ 11.9878	HOOTEN OIL
5 GALLON CONTAINER	\$ 52.98	HOOTEN OIL
55 GALLON DRUM	\$ 593.73	HOOTEN OIL
AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID, TYPE F		
DRIVE TRAIN OIL		
30 WT. - 5 GALLON CONTAINER	\$ 53.32	HOOTEN OIL
30 WT. - 55 GALLON DRUM	\$ 556.01	HOOTEN OIL

If tire is unavailable, drop to the next bidder.

LOWEST BIDDER

ST205/75Rx15 HY Special Trailer	
Tire	\$43.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
T & B TIRE	
ST225/75Rx15 HY Special Trailer	
Tire	\$52.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
T & B TIRE	
215/60Rx16 H/T Special Trailer	
Tire	\$44.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
T & B TIRE	
215/85Rx16 A/T RADIAL LT	
Tire	\$83.19
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
T & B TIRE	
225/75Rx16 A/P RADIAL LT	
Tire	\$69.43
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
JET TIRE SERVICE	
225/60VRx16 A/S POLICE PURSUIT	
Tire	\$73.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
T & B TIRE	

225/60VRx18 A/S POLICE PURSUIT	
Tire	\$118.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$11.00
265/60VRx17 A/S POLICE PURSUIT	
Tire	\$122.46
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
LT225/75Rx17 A/T LT STEEL RADIAL	
Tire	\$68.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
235/50Rx18 A/S POLICE PURSUIT	
Tire	\$68.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
P235/75Rx15 A/S STEEL RADIAL	
Tire	\$59.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
LT235/75Rx15 HY LT Steel Radial	
Tire	\$80.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
LT235/75Rx15 M&S LT STEEL RADIAL	
Tire	\$85.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

235/70Rxl6 HY STEEL RADIAL	
Tire	\$75.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
235/70Rxl6 A/T STEEL RADIAL	
Tire	\$75.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
235/80Rxl6 A/P SPECIAL TRAILER	
Tire	\$65.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
235/85Rxl6 H/T RADIAL LT	
Tire	\$91.10
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
235/85Rxl6 A/T RADIAL LT	
Tire	\$95.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Flat Repair	\$10.00
235/85Rxl6 M&S HD CUT & CHIP	
Tire	\$110.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
235/85Rxl6 LUG - MAX TRACTION RDL	
Tire	\$110.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

235/55Rx17 HY STEEL RADIAL	
Tire	\$67.95
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
235/75R17 AT Radial	
Tire	\$137.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel B	\$10.00
	\$10.00
235/80Rx17 HY Radial (10-E PLY)	
Tire	\$102.00
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
235/80Rx17 HY Radial (14-G PLY)	
Tire	\$115.37
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	
Wheel Balancing	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
245/75Rx16 H/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$88.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
245/75Rx16 A/T Radial Lt	
Tire	\$91.38
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
245/75Rx16 LUG Max Traction Radial	
Tire	\$103.64
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00

245/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$119.88
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
Tire	\$119.88
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00

245/75Rx17 H/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$96.15
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00

245/75Rx17 A/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$103.99
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00

245/75Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$125.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

245/55Rx18 HY Steel Radial	
Tire	\$114.90
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00

265/75Rx16 H/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$95.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

265/75Rx16 A/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$91.42
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
265/75Rx16 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$121.94
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
265/70Rx17 A/T Radial "P" Metric	
Tire	\$91.27
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
265/70Rx17 A/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$95.87
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
265/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$129.78
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
265/65Rx18 A/P Radial "P" Metric	
Tire	\$96.87
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
275/65Rx18 A/P Radial	
Tire	\$114.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

275/70Rx18 H/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$125.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

285/75Rx16 H/T RADIAL	
Tire	\$117.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

285/70Rx16 LUG - MAX TRACTION RDL	
Tire	\$123.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

285/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$143.14
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00

215/75Rx17.5 HY LPT Radial TBL	
Tire	\$122.90
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	
Flat Repair	\$20.00
Tire	\$122.90
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$17.95
Flat Repair	\$30.00

225/70Rx19.5 HY Radial	
Tire	\$129.90
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$17.95
Flat Repair	\$30.00

225/70Rx19.5 M/S Radial	
Tire	\$148.00
Tire Mount	\$20.00
Tire Change	\$20.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$20.00
Flat Repair	\$20.00
255/70Rx22.5 HY LPT Radial TBL	
Tire	\$205.78
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$30.00
285/75Rx24.5 HY Radial	
Tire	\$228.97
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$30.00
285/75Rx24.5 LUG Radial	
Tire	\$237.39
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$30.00
295/75Rx22.5 LUG Radial Tubeless	
Tire	\$230.58
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$25.00
Tire	\$230.58
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$30.00
315/80Rx22.5 HY Steering Radial	
Tire	\$291.87
Tire Mount	\$40.00
Tire Change	\$40.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$40.00
315/80Rx22.5 M/S RADIAL	
Tire	\$350.00
Tire Mount	\$37.50
Tire Change	\$37.50 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$37.50

25/1000x12 A/T ATV	
Tire	\$60.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
T & B TIRE	
25x11x12 A/T UTV	
Tire	\$70.35
Tire Mount	\$12.00
Tire Change	\$12.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
JET TIRE SERVICE	
28x10x12 A/T UTV	
Tire	\$85.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
T & B TIRE	
9Rx22.5 HY Radial Tubeless	
Tire	\$189.00
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
JET TIRE SERVICE	
10R22.5 HY Radial	
Tire	\$219.13
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
JET TIRE SERVICE	
10Rx22.5 LUG Radial	
Tire	\$337.20
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
OK TIRE & AUTO	
Tire	\$337.20
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
JET TIRE SERVICE	
11Lx15 F-3 Industrial TBL	
Tire	\$127.32
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
OK TIRE & AUTO	

IILx16 F-3 Industrial TBL	
Tire	\$128.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$11.00
IIRx22.5 LUG Drive LUG	
Tire	\$238.55
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
IIRx22.5 Radial - HY	
Tire	\$211.39
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
IIRx22.5 HY Premium Steering	
Tire	\$233.52
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
IIRx22.5 M&S Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$273.95
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
IIRx24.5 LUG Drive LUG	
Tire	\$256.00
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
IIRx24.5 M&S Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$294.00
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
IIRx24.5 HY Premium Steering	
Tire	\$232.11
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00

12x16 Skid Steer	
Tire	\$130.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
12x16.5 NHS Front Backhoe	
Tire	\$130.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
12.5/80X18 R-4 Backhoe	
Tire	\$223.50
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
13.6x28 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$274.93
Tire Mount	\$45.00
Tire Change	\$45.00
Flat Repair	\$45.00
14x17.5 NHS SupTrac Duplex	
Tire	\$254.95
Tire Mount	\$40.00
Tire Change	\$40.00
Flat Repair	\$40.00
16.9x34 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$512.44
Tire Mount	\$40.00
Tire Change	\$40.00
Flat Repair	\$40.00
17.5L24 R-4 Ind. LUG Tubeless	
Tire	\$344.95
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00
Flat Repair	\$50.00
340/85Rx24 R1 Front Tractor	
Tire	\$386.00
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00
Flat Repair	\$50.00

17.5x25 G-2 Grader Loader TBL	
Tire	\$470.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$75.00
Tire Change	\$75.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$75.00
17.5x25 RL Loader Rocklug TBL	
Tire	\$488.95
Tire Mount	\$85.00
Tire Change	\$85.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$85.00
17.5Rx25 LUG Radial TBL LUG	
Tire	\$769.95
Tire Mount	\$90.00
Tire Change	\$90.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$90.00
20.5x25 L2 Radial	
Tire	\$847.90
Tire Mount	\$75.00
Tire Change	\$75.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$75.00
18.4x30 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$440.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$35.00
Tire Change	\$35.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$35.00
18.4x34 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$480.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$40.00
Tire Change	\$40.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$40.00
460/85Rx34 R-1 Rear Tractor	
Tire	\$775.00
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$50.00

18.4x38 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$500.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$45.00
Tire Change	\$45.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$45.00
19.5x24 R-4 Backhoe IND LUG TBL	
Tire	\$385.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$50.00
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$50.00
20.8x34 R-1 Tractor	
Tire	\$765.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$75.00
Tire Change	\$75.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$75.00
Tire Mount	\$75.00
Tire Change	\$75.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$75.00
20.8x38 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$745.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$65.00
Tire Change	\$65.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$65.00
23.1x26 HF-1 Turf Tire	
Tire	\$769.40
Tire Mount	\$110.00
Tire Change	\$110.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$110.00
750x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless	
Tire	\$79.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Flat Repair	\$10.00
750Rx16 HY Trailer	
Tire	\$85.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00 T & B TIRE
Flat Repair	\$10.00

900x20 HW Tube Type	
Tire	\$205.49
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
900x20 LUG Tube Type	
Tire	\$275.49
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
900Rx20 HY Radial	
Tire	\$300.06
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
900Rx20 M&S Radial	
Tire	\$305.41
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
900Rx20 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$195.00
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
1000x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless	
Tire	\$115.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
1100x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless	
Tire	\$145.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$11.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00

1000Rx20 HY Radial Tube Type	
Tire	\$325.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$35.00
Tire Change	\$35.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$35.00
1000Rx20 M&S Radial Tube Type	
Tire	\$365.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$35.00
Tire Change	\$35.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$35.00
1400x24 G-2 TBL Premium 181 lbs.	
Tire	\$335.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$45.00
Tire Change	\$45.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$45.00
1400x24 G-2 TBL Economy 137 lbs.	
Tire	\$335.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$45.00
Tire Change	\$45.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$45.00
1400x24 G-2/L-2 Radial Tubeless	
Tire	\$680.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount	\$45.00
Tire Change	\$45.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair	\$45.00
RECAPPED WITH CORE	
11Rx22.5	\$157.00 BEALE TIRE
11Rx24.5	\$157.00 BEALE TIRE
1400x24 (RADIAL)	\$775.00 BEALE TIRE
State Contract SW024	
SERVICE CALLS	
\$	40.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
\$	40.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
\$	60.00 BEALE TIRE
\$	95.00 BEALE TIRE (GRADER/LOADER)
AFTER HOURS	
\$	75.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
\$	75.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
\$	75.00 BEALE TIRE
PER MILE	
\$	2.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
\$	2.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
\$	2.00 BEALE TIRE

DELAY CHARGE PER HOUR	\$	65.00	JET TIRE SERVICE
	\$	60.00	OK TIRE & AUTO
	\$	75.00	BEALE TIRE

HAULING

BID NO. 18-14

LOWEST BIDDER

18 WHEELER (BELLY DUMP)			
PER LOADED MILE			
0 - 25 MILES	\$	5.40	B & L TRANSPORT
26 - 50 MILES	\$	4.40	B & L TRANSPORT
51 - 70 MILES	\$	4.05	B & L TRANSPORT
71 - 90 MILES	\$	3.64	B & L TRANSPORT
90 - 100 MILES	\$	3.70	B & L TRANSPORT
OVER 100 MILES	\$	3.70	B & L TRANSPORT
18 WHEELER (END DUMP)			
PER LOADED MILE			
0 - 25 MILES	\$	5.25	PARROTT TRUCKING
26 - 50 MILES	\$	4.35	PARROTT TRUCKING
51 - 70 MILES	\$	4.00	PARROTT TRUCKING
71 - 90 MILES	\$	3.65	PARROTT TRUCKING
90 - 100 MILES	\$	3.70	PARROTT TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES	\$	3.70	PARROTT TRUCKING

VIBRATORY COMPACTOR	
67" SINGLE SMOOTH DRUM PADFOOT COMBINATION	
WEEKLY	\$ 1,100.00 KIRBY SMITH
	\$ 1,100.00 YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY	\$ 2,200.00 KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY	\$ 3,100.00 KIRBY SMITH
DOUBLE DRUM ROLLER	
DOUBLE DRUM ROLLER WITH WET KIT	
WEEKLY	\$ 1,650.00 KIRBY SMITH
BI-WEEKLY	\$ 3,300.00 KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY	\$ 3,000.00 NOBLES EQUIPMENT
80 HP 4WD BACKHOE	
80 HP 4WD BACKHOE WITH 36" BACK BUCKET	
DAILY	\$ 325.00 YELLOWHOUSE
WEEKLY	\$ 950.00 YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
MONTHLY	\$ 2,800.00 YELLOWHOUSE
70 HP BACKHOE	
with 550' LB. ROCK HAMMER	
DAILY	\$ 500.00 YELLOWHOUSE
WEEKLY	\$ 1,500.00 YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY	\$ 3,200.00 KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY	\$ 4,500.00 YELLOWHOUSE
MOTORGRADER	
185 HP W/REAR RIPPER & SCARIFIER	
WEEKLY	\$ 2,600.00 YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY	\$ 5,400.00 KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY	\$ 8,000.00 KIRBY SMITH
	\$ 8,000.00 YELLOWHOUSE
90 HP CRAWLER	
WITH 6 WAY DOZER	
WEEKLY	\$ 1,300.00 YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY	\$ 3,000.00 KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY	\$ 3,900.00 YELLOWHOUSE
140 HP EXCAVATOR	
45,000 LB. CLASS EXACATOR	
WEEKLY	\$ 1,700.00 KIRBY SMITH
BI-WEEKLY	\$ 3,400.00 KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY	\$ 5,000.00 KIRBY SMITH

EQUIPMENT RENTALS

BID NO. 18-15

130 HP LOADER		
25,000 LB. CLASS 3 YARD LOADER		
WEEKLY	\$ 1,500.00	YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY	\$ 3,600.00	KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY	\$ 4,500.00	YELLOWHOUSE
9 WHEEL PNEUMATIC ROLLER		
WEEKLY		NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
BI-WEEKLY		NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
MONTHLY	\$ 2,800.00	NOBLES EQUIPMENT
17,000 LB. BULLDOZER		
WEEKLY	\$ 1,000.00	YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY		NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
MONTHLY	\$ 3,000.00	YELLOWHOUSE
20,000 LB. BULLDOZER		
WEEKLY	\$ 1,300.00	YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY		NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
MONTHLY	\$ 3,800.00	YELLOWHOUSE
ROAD BROOM		
WEEKLY	\$ 900.00	KIRBY SMITH
BI-WEEKLY	\$ 1,800.00	KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY	\$ 2,500.00	KIRBY SMITH

State Contract SW0185

COPY PAPER

BID NO. 18-16

WHITE 92, 20 LB.		
8 1/2 x 11	\$ 32.95	ADA PAPER CO.
8 1/2 x 14	\$ 46.50	ADA PAPER CO.
11 x 17	\$ 46.00	PACKAGING SOLUTIONS
	\$ 46.00	ADA PAPER CO.
8 1/2 x 14 CANARY YELLOW	\$ 65.87	ADA PAPER CO.
8 1/2 x 14 GREEN	\$ 65.87	ADA PAPER CO.

STRUCTURAL GEAR (AKA BUNKER GEAR)		
JACKET	\$ 1,031.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
DUAL RADIO POCKET	INCL.	
FLASHLIGHT HOLDER	INCL.	
AMERICAN FLAG	INCL.	
DEPT. LETTERING	INCL.	
FIREFIGHTER NAME	INCL.	
TROUSERS	\$ 755.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES

State Contract SW0241

EPDM RUBBER LINED DOUBLE JACKET		
1 1/2"	\$86.50	MES
1 3/4"	\$95.00	MES
2"	\$145.00	CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
	\$145.00	MES
2 1/2"	\$134.00	MES
3"	\$190.00	MES
Dept. Name	INCL.	CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
	INCL.	MES
SERIAL NUMBER STAMPED (PER LENGTH)	\$5.00	CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
	\$6.00	MES
LDH SUPPLY LINE		
4" - 100 FT.	\$481.00	MES
5" - 100 FT.	\$540.00	MES
6" - 100 FT.	\$973.00	MES
STENCILING	INCL.	MES
SMALL DIAMETER SUPPLY LINE RUBBER COVERED		
50 FT.		
1"	\$104.00	MES
1 1/2"	\$116.00	MES
1 3/4"	\$140.00	MES
2"	\$170.00	MES
2 1/2"	\$179.00	MES
3"	\$197.00	MES
DEPT. NAME	INCL.	MES
COUPLING SERIAL# STAMPED	\$6.00	MES

FIRE HOSE

BID NO. 18-18

BOOSTER HOSE		
100 FT.		
3/4" PER FOOT	\$376.00	MES
1" PER FOOT	\$469.00	MES

State Contract SW0241

TWO PIECE SUIT	
INDURA 9 OZ. COAT	
S - XL	\$ 183.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 201.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 220.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 238.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
DEPT. NAME OF SHOULDER	\$ 20.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
INDURA 9 OZ. PANT	
SHORT - XLONG	
S - XL	\$ 211.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 230.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 248.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 267.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XLONG (36" INSEAM)	
S - XL	\$ 230.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 250.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 271.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 291.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
WILDLAND SUSPENDERS	\$ 35.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
ADVANCE 7.0 OZ COAT	
S - XL	\$ 287.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 316.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 344.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 373.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
DEPT. NAME ON SHOULDER	\$ 20.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
ADVANCE 7.0 OZ. PANT	
SHORT - XLONG	
S - XL	\$ 283.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 311.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 340.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 368.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XLONG (36" INSEAM)	
S - XL	\$ 311.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 342.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 374.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 405.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
WILDLAND SUSPENDERS	\$35.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
INDURA 9.0oz COVERALL	
S - XL	\$305.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$335.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$365.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$396.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES
DEPT. NAME ON SHOULDER	\$20.00 CASCO INDUSTRIES

TWO PIECE SUIT		
INDURA 9 OZ. COAT		
S - XL	\$ 183.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 201.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 220.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 238.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
DEPT. NAME OF SHOULDER	\$ 20.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
INDURA 9 OZ. PANT		
SHORT - XLONG		
S - XL	\$ 211.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 230.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 248.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 267.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XLONG (36" INSEAM)		
S - XL	\$ 230.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 250.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 271.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 291.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
WILDLAND SUSPENDERS	\$ 35.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
ADVANCE 7.0 OZ COAT		
S - XL	\$ 287.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 316.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 344.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 373.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
DEPT. NAME ON SHOULDER	\$ 20.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
ADVANCE 7.0 OZ. PANT		
SHORT - XLONG		
S - XL	\$ 283.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 311.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 340.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 368.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XLONG (36" INSEAM)		
S - XL	\$ 311.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 342.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$ 374.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$ 405.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
WILDLAND SUSPENDERS	\$35.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
INDURA 9.0oz COVERALL		
S - XL	\$305.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$335.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL	\$365.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL	\$396.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
DEPT. NAME ON SHOULDER	\$20.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES

TWO PIECE SUIT		
NOMEX 7.5 OZ. COAT		
S - XL	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
2XL		
3XL		
4XL		
DEPT. NAME OF SHOULDER (2") (3")		
NOMEX 7.5 OZ. PANT		
SHORT - XLONG		
S - XL	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
2XL		
3XL		
4XL		
WILDLAND SUSPENDERS		
TWO PIECE SUIT		
NOMEX 6.0 OZ. COAT		
S - XL	\$ 214.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 235.00	
3XL	\$ 257.00	
4XL	\$ 278.00	
DEPT. NAME OF SHOULDER	\$ 20.00	
NOMEX 6.0 OZ. PANT		
SHORT - XLONG		
S - XL	\$ 219.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 240.00	
3XL	\$ 262.00	
4XL	\$ 284.00	
DEPT. NAME OF SHOULDER	\$ 20.00	
NOMEX 7.5 OZ. COVERAL		
S - XL	\$ 240.00	CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL	\$ 265.00	
3XL	\$ 289.00	
4XL	\$ 313.00	
WILDLAND SUSPENDERS	\$ 35.00	
NOMEX 7.5 OZ. COVERAL		
S - XL	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
2XL		
3XL		
4XL		
DEPT. NAME OF SHOULDER		

INDURA DOUBLE DUTY PANT	
SHORT - XLONG	
S-XL	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
2XL	
3XL	
4XL	
2XLONG (36" INSEAM)	
S-XL	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
2XL	
3XL	
4XL	

State Contract SW0241

USED STEEL PIPE

BID NO. 18-10

NEXT LOWEST BIDDER		
12"	\$ 13.40	SUNBELT EQUIP.
16"	\$ 29.45	RAILROAD YARD
18"	\$ 31.50	RAILROAD YARD
20"	\$ 31.00	RAILROAD YARD
22"	\$ 32.50	RAILROAD YARD
	\$ 32.50	SUNBELT EQUIP.
24"	\$ 32.50	SUNBELT EQUIP.
26"	\$ 33.50	RAILROAD YARD
30"	\$ 48.50	RAILROAD YARD
34"	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
36"	\$ 57.75	ALFORD METALS
42"	\$ 85.00	SUNBELT EQUIP.
48"	\$ 109.00	RAILROAD YARD
54"	\$ 135.00	SUNBELT EQUIP.
60"	\$ 135.00	SUNBELT EQUIP.
7'	\$ 225.00	SUNBELT EQUIP.
8'	\$ 235.00	RAILROAD YARD
8 1/2'	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
9'	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
9 1/2'	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
10'	NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)	
2 3/8" USED DRILL TUBING (per foot)	\$ 1.59	SUNBELT EQUIP.
2 7/8" USED DRILL TUBING (per foot)	\$ 1.35	SUNBELT EQUIP.

If unavailable, must be phone quoted

NEXT LOWEST BIDDER	
ST205/75Rx15 HY Special Trailer	
Tire	\$53.67
Tire Mount	\$5.00
Tire Change	\$5.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
ST225/75Rx15 HY Special Trailer	
Tire	\$64.80
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
215/60Rx16 H/T Special Trailer	
Tire	\$52.86
Tire Mount	\$5.00
Tire Change	\$5.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
Tire	\$52.86
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
215/85Rx16 A/T RADIAL LT	
Tire	\$88.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
Tire	\$88.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
225/75Rx16 A/P RADIAL LT	
Tire	\$73.12
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

225/60VRx16 A/S POLICE PURSUIT	
Tire	\$75.35
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
225/60VRx18 A/S POLICE PURSUIT	
Tire	\$119.78
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
265/60VRx17 A/S POLICE PURSUIT	
Tire	\$129.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	BEALE TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
LT225/75Rx17 A/T LT STEEL RADIAL	
Tire	\$112.18
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	BEALE TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
Tire	\$112.18
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
235/50Rx18 A/S POLICE PURSUIT	
Tire	\$95.81
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
P235/75Rx15 A/S STEEL RADIAL	
Tire	\$62.21
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	BEALE TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00

LT235/75Rx15 HY LT Steel Radial	
Tire	\$89.95
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
LT235/75Rx15 M&S LT STEEL RADIAL	
Tire	\$85.54
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
235/70Rx16 HY STEEL RADIAL	
NO OTHER BIDS - PHONE QUOTE	
235/70Rx16 A/T STEEL RADIAL	
NO OTHER BIDS - PHONE QUOTE	
235/80Rx16 A/P SPECIAL TRAILER	
Tire	\$67.98
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
235/85Rx16	
Tire	\$92.82
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
235/85Rx16 A/T RADIAL LT	
Tire	\$95.33
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Wheel Balancing	\$15.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Flat Repair	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
235/85Rx16 M&S HD CUT & CHIP	
Tire	\$113.80
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

235/85Rxl6 LUG - MAX TRACTION RDL	
Tire	\$113.95
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
235/55Rxl7 HY STEEL RADIAL	
Tire	\$75.76
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	BEALE TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
235/75R17 AT Radial	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
235/80Rxl7 HY Radial	
Tire	\$104.60
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$15.00
235/80Rxl7 HY Radial	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
245/75Rxl6 H/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$90.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
245/75Rxl6 A/T Radial Lt	
Tire	\$93.07
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
245/75Rxl6 LUG Max Traction Radial	
Tire	\$104.22
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

245/70Rxl7 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$125.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$11.00
245/75Rxl7 H/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$97.41
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
245/75Rxl7 A/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$104.54
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
245/75Rxl7 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$125.78
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
245/55Rxl8 HY Steel Radial	
Tire	\$115.39
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
265/75Rxl6 H/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$100.55
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
265/75Rxl6 A/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$93.11
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00

265/75Rx16 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$122.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
265/70Rx17 A/T Radial "P" Metric	
Tire	\$92.97
Tire Mount	\$7.00
Tire Change	\$7.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$8.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
265/70Rx17 A/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$100.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
265/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$130.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
265/65Rx18 A/P Radial "P" Metric	
Tire	\$99.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
275/65Rx18 A/P Radial	
Tire	\$114.58
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
275/70Rx18 H/T Radial LT	
Tire	\$128.55
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00

285/75Rx16 H/T RADIAL	
Tire	\$117.62
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
285/75Rx16 LUG - MAX TRACTION RDL	
Tire	\$131.37
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
285/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$144.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Wheel Balancing	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
215/75Rx17.5 HY LPT Radial TBL	
Tire	\$146.00
Tire Mount	\$20.00
Tire Change	\$20.00
Wheel Balancing	\$20.00
Flat Repair	\$20.00
225/70Rx19.5 HY Radial	
Tire	\$140.00
Tire Mount	\$20.00
Tire Change	\$20.00
Wheel Balancing	\$20.00
Flat Repair	\$20.00
225/70Rx19.5 M/S Radial	
Tire	\$158.13
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Wheel Balancing	\$17.95
Flat Repair	\$30.00
255/70Rx22.5 HY LPT Radial TBL	
Tire	\$228.88
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00

285/75Rx24.5 HY Radial	
Tire	\$235.75
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
285/75Rx24.5 LUG Radial	
Tire	\$248.33
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
295/75Rx22.5 LUG Radial Tubeless	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
315/80Rx22.5 HY Steering Radial	
Tire	\$340.00
Tire Mount	\$37.50
Tire Change	\$37.50
Flat Repair	\$37.50
315/80Rx22.5 M/S RADIAL	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
25/1000x12 A/T ATV	
Tire	\$69.95
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
25x11x12 A/T UTV	
Tire	\$84.00
Tire Mount	\$12.00
Tire Change	\$12.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
28x10x12 A/T UTV	
Tire	\$95.10
Tire Mount	\$12.00
Tire Change	\$12.00
Flat Repair	\$12.00
9Rx22.5 HY Radial Tubeless	
Tire	\$196.20
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00

10R22.5 HY Radial	
Tire	\$225.95
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
10R22.5 LUG Radial	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
11Lx15 F-3 Industrial TBL	
Tire	\$129.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$11.00
11Lx16 F-3 Industrial TBL	
Tire	\$137.25
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
11R22.5 LUG Drive LUG	
Tire	\$250.50
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
11R22.5 Radial - HY	
Tire	\$227.57
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
11R22.5 HY Premium Steering	
Tire	\$238.32
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
11R22.5 M&S Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$278.90
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00

IIRx24.5 LUG Drive LUG	
Tire	\$276.22
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
OK TIRE & AUTO	
IIRx24.5 M&S Max Traction RDL	
Tire	\$292.14
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
OK TIRE & AUTO	
IIRx24.5 HY Premium Steering	
Tire	\$237.00
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
JET TIRE SERVICE	
12x16 Skid Steer	
Tire	\$175.46
Tire Mount	\$20.00
Tire Change	\$20.00
Flat Repair	\$20.00
OK TIRE & AUTO	
12x16.5 NHS Front Backhoe	
Tire	\$157.46
Tire Mount	\$17.50
Tire Change	\$17.50
Flat Repair	\$17.50
JET TIRE SERVICE	
12.5/80X18 R-4 Backhoe	
Tire	\$225.00
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
T & B TIRE	
13.6x28 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$280.00
Tire Mount	\$30.00
Tire Change	\$30.00
Flat Repair	\$30.00
OK TIRE & AUTO	
14x17.5 NHS SupTrac Duplex	
Tire	\$242.95
Tire Mount	\$25.00
Tire Change	\$25.00
Flat Repair	\$25.00
T & B TIRE	

16.9x34 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$517.44
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00
Flat Repair	\$50.00
17.5L24 R-4 Ind. LUG Tubeless	
Tire	\$395.65
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00
Flat Repair	\$50.00
340/85Rx24 R1 Front Tractor	
Tire	\$395.00
Tire Mount	\$35.00
Tire Change	\$35.00
Flat Repair	\$35.00
17.5x25 G-2 Grader Loader TBL	
Tire	\$479.95
Tire Mount	\$85.00
Tire Change	\$85.00
Flat Repair	\$85.00
17.5x25 RL Loader Rocklug TBL	
Tire	\$590.13
Tire Mount	\$75.00
Tire Change	\$75.00
Flat Repair	\$75.00
17.5Rx25 LUG Radial TBL LUG	
Tire	\$895.23
Tire Mount	\$75.00
Tire Change	\$75.00
Flat Repair	\$75.00
20.5x25 L2 Radial	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
18.4x30 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$457.54
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00
Flat Repair	\$50.00

18.4x34 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$491.95
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00
Flat Repair	\$50.00
460/85Rx34 R-1 Rear Tractor	
Tire	\$825.02
Tire Mount	\$40.00
Tire Change	\$40.00
Flat Repair	\$40.00
18.4x38 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$522.80
Tire Mount	\$55.00
Tire Change	\$55.00
Flat Repair	\$55.00
19.5x24 R-4 Backhoe IND LUG TBL	
Tire	\$399.00
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00
Flat Repair	\$50.00
20.8x34 R-1 Tractor	
Tire	\$788.00
Tire Mount	\$75.00
Tire Change	\$75.00
Flat Repair	\$75.00
20.8x38 R-1 Farm Tube Type	
Tire	\$768.00
Tire Mount	\$65.00
Tire Change	\$65.00
Flat Repair	\$65.00
23.1x26 HF-1 Turf Tire	
Tire	\$820.00
Tire Mount	\$50.00
Tire Change	\$50.00
Flat Repair	\$50.00
750x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless	
Tire	\$85.00
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	
Flat Repair	\$15.00

750Rx16 HY Trailer	
Tire	\$102.51
Tire Mount	\$10.00
Tire Change	\$10.00
Flat Repair	\$10.00
900x20 HY Tube Type	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
900x20 LUG Tube Type	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
900Rx20 HY Radial	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
900Rx20 M&S Radial	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
900Rx20 LUG Max Traction RDL	
NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE	
1000x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless	
Tire	\$128.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$11.00
1100x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless	
Tire	\$160.00
Tire Mount	\$15.00
Tire Change	\$15.00
Flat Repair	\$11.00
1000Rx20 HY Radial Tube Type	
Tire	\$362.72
Tire Mount	\$35.00
Tire Change	\$35.00
Flat Repair	\$35.00
1000Rx20 M&S Radial Tube Type	
Tire	\$387.13
Tire Mount	\$35.00
Tire Change	\$35.00
Flat Repair	\$35.00

1400x24 G-2 TBL Premium 181 lbs.	
Tire	\$366.00
Tire Mount	\$85.00
Tire Change	\$85.00
Flat Repair	\$85.00
1400x24 G-2 TBL Economy 137 lbs.	
Tire	\$372.29
Tire Mount	\$85.00
Tire Change	\$85.00
Flat Repair	\$85.00
1400x24 G-2/L-2 Radial Tubeless	
Tire	\$815.00
Tire Mount	\$85.00
Tire Change	\$85.00
Flat Repair	\$85.00
RECAPPED WITH CORE	
11Rx22.5	NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE
11Rx24.5	NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE
1400x24	NO OTHER BID - PHONE QUOTE

State Contract SW024

NEXT LOWEST BIDDER

18 WHEELER (BELLY DUMP)		
PER LOADED MILE		
0 - 25 MILES	\$ 6.00	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
26 - 50 MILES	\$ 4.89	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
51 - 70 MILES	\$ 4.10	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
71 - 90 MILES	\$ 3.70	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
90 - 100 MILES	\$ 3.94	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
OVER 100 MILES	\$ 3.97	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
18 WHEELER (END DUMP)		
PER LOADED MILE		
0 - 25 MILES	\$ 6.00	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
26 - 50 MILES	\$ 4.89	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
51 - 70 MILES	\$ 4.10	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
71 - 90 MILES	\$ 3.70	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
90 - 100 MILES	\$ 3.94	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER
OVER 100 MILES	\$ 3.97	JUSTIN NIMROD DOZER