CRUSHED STONE/SAND

District #1

South of Crowder/Blocker Road - Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)
North of Crowder/Blocker Road - Stigler Stone

District #2

All Materials awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)

District #3

All Materials awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)

All Chips awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)
#4 SCREENINGS | $ 10.00 |STIGLER STONE

S 11.20 |DOLESE
1" TBSC TYPE A $ 12.50 |STIGLER STONE
“ $ 15.50 |STIGLER STONE
' #67
S 16.20 |DOLESE
1" #57 S 15.50 |STIGLER STONE
LU 57 S 15.00 |STIGLER STONE
S 15.35 |DOLESE
11/2' MILL RUN $ 12.50 |STIGLER STONE
11/2' ODOT BASE TYPE A b 12.50 ISTIGLER STONE
S 12.65 |DOLESE
$
S 14.00 |STIGLER STONE
2" CLEAN ROCK
g 15.80 |DOLESE
4* ODOT FILTER BLANKET 5 .00 |STIGLER STONE
S 1510 |DOLESE
$
4" FILTER STONE
- CRUSHER RUN S 1100 |STIGLER STONE
S 1150 |DOLESE
LU CRUSHER RUN $ 1100 |STIGLER STONE
S 1105 |DOLESE
1> CRUSHER RUN $ 1100 |STIGLER STONE
S 1L.05 |DOLESE
4'TO11/2' SPECIAL GRIZZLY $ 12.50 |STIGLER STONE
3' SURGE $ 12.70 |DOLESE
S 14.00 |STIGLER STONE
S SURGE $ 12.35 |DOLESE
S 15.00 |STIGLER STONE
SHOT DOWN ROCK 5 12.10 |DOLESE
S 15.00 |STIGLER STONE
6' TO 8' RIP RAP $ 20.00 |STIGLER STONE

CRUSHED STONE/SAND
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



CRUSHED STONE/SAND

QUARRY RUN RIP RAP

DECOMPOSED SCREENED GRANITE

12" SELECT RIP RAP $ 25.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 28.25 |DOLESE

18" SELECT RIP RAP $ 23.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 28.25 |DOLESE

24 SELECT RIP RAP $ 23.00 [STIGLER STONE
$ 28.25 |DOLESE

30" SELECT RIP RAP $ 23.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 28.25 |DOLESE

$ 15.00 |STIGLER STONE
BID NOT AWARDED

OILFIELD ROCK (A KA. 1TO11/2

DECOMPOSED SCREENED GRANITE BID NOT AWARDED
CHIPS

3/4' #1 COVER CHIPS $ 20.60 [DOLESE

3/8" #2 COVER CHIPS $ 21.05 |DOLESE
5/8" #3 COVER CHIPS $ 20.80 |DOLESE
5/8" #3-C COVER CHIPS $ 20.95 | DOLESE
SAND
CLASS "A" SAND $ 10.50 [MUSKOGEE SAND
MANUFACTURED SAND $ 13.85 |DOLESE

SAND ON STATE CONTRACT SW670

[F AN ITEM IS UNAVAILABLE, PLEASE CONTACT PURCHASING FOR NEXT

AVAILABLE BIDDER OR PHONE QUOTE.

CRUSHED STONE/SAND
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



ROAD OILS

CRS+2
CRS-25
SS-1
CRS-2
MC-30

AE-P
PG 64-22 OK ASPHALT BINDER (TON)
AC-20 ASPHALT BINDER (TON)
PG 64-22 PROLINE OR EQUIVALEN

75.00 |ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY

MC-3000 5 288

PUMP CHARGE 100.00 |WRIGHT ASPHALT

125.00 [COASTAL ENERGY

RSl RSl RS2

75.00 |ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
75.00 |WRIGHT ASPHALT
100.00 |COASTAL ENERGY

DEMURRAGE (first two hours free)

A

5500{COASTAL ENERGY
MINIMUM LOAD 5500(ASPHALT FUEL & SUPPLY

PLEASE NOTE: THE
LOWEST BIDDER MUST BE USED UNTIL UNAVAILABLE

STATEWIDE CONTRACT #SW690 MAY ALSO BE USED.

ROAD OILS
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



GRADER BLADES

5/8" BOLT HOLE

5/8'" X6"X7 $ 81.71 [WARREN CAT
5/8" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 90.82 |WARREN CAT
3/4" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 122.76 |WELBORN SALES
3/4" X 8" X 7' (NON CARBON) $ 142.65 (WELBORN SALES
3/4" BOLT HOLE
5/8'X6"X7 $ 82.50 |WELBORN SALES
5/8" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 100.95 (WELBORN SALES
3/4" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 90.01 [WARREN CAT
3/4" X 8" X7 (NON CARBON) $ 131.42 [WARREN CAT

STATEWIDE CONTRACT# SW501

GRADER BLADES

1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



PLASTIC PIPE

GREY

12" $ 8.63 |FENSCO, INC.

15 $ 12.69 |FENSCO, INC.

18" $ 17.28 |FENSCO, INC.

21" NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

24" $ 27.40 |FENSCO, INC.

30" $ 36.46 |FENSCO, INC.

36" $ 48.33 |[KC FARM MACHINERY
42" $ 59.37 |KC FARM MACHINERY
48" $ 86.02 |KC FARM MACHINERY

60" $ 122.20 |KC FARM MACHINERY

Also can be purchased through State Contract SW0094

PLASTIC PIPE
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



USED STEEL PIPE

LOWEST BIDDER

o0 |5 23000 |ALFORDMETALS
s |5 42500 |THERAILROADYARD |
_
_

23/8"

USED DRILL TUBING (PER FOOT)

$

2.50

ALFORD METALS

27/8'

$

3.18

ALFORD METALS

IF UNAVAILABLE, DROP TO NEXT LOWEST BIDDER

USED STEEL PIPE
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



NEW USED STEEL

|
USED TANK CARS

1/2 TANK CAR (PER FOOT) $ 425.00 |THE RAILROAD YARD
(S e e e e e e e
FULL TANK CAR (PER FOOT) $ 425.00 [THE RAILROAD YARD

NEW USED STEEL
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

LOWEST BIDDER

Tire Mount, Tire Change, Wheel Balancing and Flat Repair should always follow the vendor who is awarded the tire, however, Direct Discout Tire has been awarded as the
lowest bidder on the majority of tires this 6 month so the Board awarded these services to all vendors who bid. Please call them in advance to make sure that they will provide
the service before getting a purchase order.
e _________________________________ |

LOWEST BIDDER

OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
TRAILER/SPECIAL TRAILER
MOUNT CHT;iEGE BALANCE REIL;;ITR MOUNT CHT/iiEGE BALANCE RE%ZITR

ST205/75Rx15 HY 8-DPLY $56.72|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2600$% 3000|% 2000(|$% 2000 (% 1500 $ 2000(|$ 2500
ST225/75Rx15 HY 10-E PLY $68.48|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000|$ 3000(|$% 2000|$% 2000[|$ 1500 $ 2000|$ 2500
235/80Rx16 A/P 8-PLY $79.45|0OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000|$% 3000|$% 2000|$ 2000 NO BID

750Rx16 HY 14-G PLY $112.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000 (|$ 3000 $ 2000 [$ 1500 $ 2500

OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
RADIALS
MOUNT | (uXgr | BALANCE | prpie [IMOUNINNE AR | BATANCE|C e

215/60Rx16 A/S 4B $68.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 |$ 3000|$ 2000|$ 2000|$ 800 $ 2000|$ 2500
235/75Rx17 A/T 10-EPLY $136.00|T & W TIRE NO BID $ 800 $ 2000 ([ $ 2500
235/80Rx17 A/T 10-E PLY $117.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000 |$ 3000|$ 2000|$ 2000|9$ 800 $ 2000|$ 2500
235/80Rx17 HY 10-E PLY $126.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000 |$ 3000|$ 2000|$ 2000|$ 800 $ 2000|$ 2500
235/80Rx17 HY 14-G PLY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID $ 800 $ 2000|$ 2500
275/65Rx18 A/P 10-EPLY $160.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE[ § 2000 [ $ 3000 ([$ 2000 (|$ 2000 [$ 800 $ 2000 $ 2500
285/75Rx16 H/T 10 $160.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 20.00 | $ 3000 |$ 2000 |$ 20.00 NO BID

245/70Rx17 A/T 10-E PLY $136.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000|$ 3000(|$ 2000|$% 2000|% 800 $ 2000 ([$ 2500
225/70Rx19.5 HY F-12 PLY $160.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID $  50.00 $ 4000 | $ 55.00
225/70Rx19.5 M&S F-12PLY $180.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID $ 50.00 $ 4000 | $ 55.00
285/75Rx24.5HY 14-G PLY $280.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 4500 | $ 55.00 $ 4500 NO BID

285/75Rx24.5 LUG 14-GPLY $268.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 4500 % 5500 % 3000|$ 4500 NO BID

315/80Rx22.5 M/S J18PLY | $400.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 4500 | § 5500 $ 4500 [$ 5000 | | [ § 5500
I0Rx22.5 HY 12-FPLY $295.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID

10Rx22.5 LUG 12-F PLY $320.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID

11Rx22.5 HY 14-G PLY $275.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 4500 | $ 55.00 $ 4500 NO BID

20.5x2512 TREAD $900.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 95.00 [ $ 115.00 $  95.00 NO BID

900x20 HY 12-FPLY $400.00({DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID

900x20 M&S 12-F PLY $430.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID

1000Rx20 HY 14-G PLY $495.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID

TIRES / TIRE SERVICE
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

LOWEST BIDDER

1000Rx20 M&S 14-G PLY $490.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 4000 $ 50.00 $  40.00 NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
RADIAL LT TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MIOINIE | v S RePAIR CHANGE LiALLENC]E REPAIR
215/85Rx16 A/P 10-E PLY $110.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000($ 3000|% 2000(% 2000 $ 8.00 $ 2000 $ 25.00
225/65Rx17 A/P 8-DPLY $238.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000|% 3000($ 2000($ 20.00 NO BID
225/75Rx16 A/P 8DPLY $110.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE[ $ 2000 [$ 3000 ([$ 2000 (|$ 2000 NO BID
235/85Rx16 H/T 10-EPLY $115.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 [ $ 30.00|$ 2000 $ 2000/ $ 8.00 $ 2000|$ 2500
235/85Rx16 A/T 10-EPLY $120.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE[ $ 2000 |$ 3000 ($ 2000(|$ 2000[$ 800 $ 2000 ([$ 2500
245/75Rx16 H/T 10-EPLY $117.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE[ $ 20.00 [ $ 30.00 [ $ 2000 (|$ 2000/ $ 8.00 $ 2000 ([ $ 2500
245/75Rx16 A/T 10-EPLY $117.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 |$ 3000|$ 2000|$ 2000 $ 800 $ 2000 ([$ 2500
245/75Rx17 H/T 10-EPLY $125.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 $ 30.00|$ 2000|$ 2000/ $ 8.00 $ 2000|$ 2500
245/75Rx17 A/T 10-E PLY $125.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE|[ $ 2000 |$ 3000|$ 2000|$ 2000 % 800 $ 2000 ([$ 2500
265/75Rx16 H/T 10-EPLY $130.00(DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 |$ 3000 (|$ 2000 ($ 20.00 NO BID
265/75Rx16 A/T 10-EPLY $133.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 | $ 3000 $ 2000 | $ 2000 NO BID
265/70Rx17 A/T 10-EPLY $140.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 | $ 3000|$ 2000 (|$ 2000 | $ 8.00 $ 2000|$%$ 2500
275/70Rx18 H/T 10-E PLY $150.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE|[ $ 2500 |$ 3500|$ 2000|$%$ 2500| %  8.00 $ 2000 ¢$ 2500
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
POLICE PURSUIT TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MIGINIE | = v LiALLANCIE RePAIR R CHANGE LiALLENCIE REPAIR
225/60VRx16 A/S 4VR $168.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000 $ 3000 $ 2000 $ 2000 % 800 $ 2000 ([$ 2500
225/60VRx18 A/S 4VR $125.92(T & W TIRE NO BID $ 800 $ 2000 $ 2500
265/60VRx17 A/S 4VR $135.00|T & W TIRE $ 2000 $ 3000 $ 2000 $ 2000 % 800 $ 2000 ([$ 2500
235/50Rx18 A/S 4VR $151.00|T & W TIRE NO BID $ 800 $ 2000 $ 2500
.|
LT STEEL RADIAL TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CRANCE BALANCE REpAR | MOUNT CRANCE BALANCE SEPATR
LT225/75Rx17 A/P 10-E PLY $169.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000|% 3000([$ 2000($ 2000 NO BID
LT235/75Rx15 HY 6-CPLY $112.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE[ $ 2000 |$ 3000 ($ 2000 (|$ 2000 NO BID
LT235/75Rx15 M&S 6-CPLY $105.91|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000 ($ 30000 (% 2000($% 2000 NO BID

OK TIRE & AUTO T& W TIRE

TIRES / TIRE SERVICE
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024




TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

LOWEST BIDDER

HD CUT & CHIP TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT | cpyanGE | BAMANCE | pepair | MOUNTE cpanGE | PARANCEL R EpAIR
235/85Rx16 M&S 10-E PLY $142.00|T & W TIRE $ 2000 $ 3000 $ 2000 $ 2000($ 800 $ 2000 % 2500
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
STEEL RADIAL TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT | cpanGE | BAMANCE | pepair | MOUNTE cpanGE | PATANCEL R EpAIR
P235/75Rx15 A/S 4-BPLY $75.48 |T & W TIRE $ 2000 ($ 3000[$ 2000([$ 2000([$ 800 $ 2000 | $ 2500
235/70Rx16 HY 10- PLY $99.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
235/70Rx16 A/T 10- PLY $99.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
235/55Rx17 HY 4BPLY $90.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 |$ 3000 |$ 2000|$ 2000[$ 800 $ 2000|$ 2500
245/55Rx18 HY 4-BPLY $105.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000 ([$ 3000[$ 2000([$ 2000([$ 800 $ 2000 | $ 2500
245/60Rx18 HY 4-BPLY $95.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000 [$ 3000[$% 2000[$% 2000 % 800 $ 2000|$ 2500
|
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
MAX TRACTION RADIAL TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT | cpyanGE | BAFANCE L pepair | MOUNTH craNGE [ PAFANCEL REpAR
10-E PLY $135.00|0K TIRE & AUTO $ 2000|$ 3000|$ 2000|$ 2000 NO BID
235/85Rx16 LUG $135.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
245/75Rx16 LUG 10EPLY | $133.00/DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE[ $ 2000 [$ 3000]$ 2000 [$ 2000 [§ 800 | | s 2000[s 2500
245/70Rx17 LUG 10-E PLY $151.00{OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000|$ 3000(|$% 2000|$ 2000 NO BID
245/75Rx17 LUG 10-E PLY $160.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000 [$ 3000[$% 2000[$% 2000|$% 800 $ 2000 ([$ 2500
265/75Rx16 LUG 10-E PLY $159.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000 ([$ 3000[$ 2000([$ 2000([$ 800 $ 2000 (|$ 2500
265/70Rx17 LUG 10-E PLY $170.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 20.00 | $ 3000|$ 2000 (|$ 2000 | $ 8.00 $ 2000|$ 2500
285/75Rx16 LUG 10-E PLY $175.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 [ $ 3000 |$ 2000[$ 2000[$ 800 $ 2000 | $ 2500
285/70Rx17 LUG 8-DPLY $165.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID $ 8.00 $ 2000 [$ 2500
11Rx22.5 M&S 14-G PLY $300.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID $ 50.00 $ 55.00
11Rx24.5 M&S 14-G PLY $310.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
O00Rx20 LUG 12-FPLY $565.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
RADIAL "P* METRIC TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT | cpyanGE | BAMANCE | pepair | MOUNTE cpanGE | PATANCEL R EpAIR
265/70Rx17 A/T 4BPLY $115.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 | $ 3000 |$ 2000|$% 2000|$% 800 $ 2000|$ 2500
265/65Rx18 A/P 4-BPLY $129.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 2000 |$ 3000 $ 2000|$ 2000 $ 800 $ 2000 ([$ 2500

TIRES / TIRE SERVICE
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

LOWEST BIDDER

OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
LPT RADIAL TBL TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
DIQIDINIE CHANGE e REPAIR | MOUNT CHANGE SN REPAIR
215/75Rx17.5 HY H-16 PLY $135.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID $  50.00 $  55.00
255/70Rx22.5 HY H-16 PLY $199.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $  45.00 $ 4500 % 50.00 $  55.00

SKID STEER

OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
RADIAL TUBELESS TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR
295/75Rx225LUG | G14PLY | $275.00[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE|[ § 4500 | $ 5500 5 4500 NO BID
ORx22.5 HY DF | $33500|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| § 4500 | § 5500 5 4500 NO BID
124x24 RITREAD | sPY | $38500[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE[ § 5000 §$ 6000 5 5000 NO BID
175Rx25 LUG $790.00{OK TIRE & AUTO 5 9500]$ 11500 5 9500 NO BID
1400x24 G2/12 ONE* | $630.00|OK TIRE & AUTO 5 9500 |$ 11500 5 9500 NO BID
OKTIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
STEERING RADIAL TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR
315/80Rx22.5 J18TREAD]  $370.00[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE 5 5500 5 4500 5 5500
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
PREMIUM STEERING TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR
1IRx22.5 HY 14GPLY | $280.00[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID 5 5000 5 5500
1IRx24.5 HY 14GPLY | $20500|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID 5 5000 5 5500

OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR

TIRES / TIRE SERVICE
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



TIRES / TIRE SERVICES LOWEST BIDDER

12x16 R4 TREAD 8-PLY $190.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
BACKHOE TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
DIQIDINIE CHANGE e REPAIR | MOUNT CHANGE SN REPAIR
12x16.5 NHS TREAD 8PLY $141.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 25.00 $ 35.00 $ 25.00 $ 50.00 55.00
12.5/80x18 R4 TREAD| 12-FPLY $225.00|OK TIRE & AUTO 30.00 40.00 30.00 50.00 5.00
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
ATV MOUNT LINE BALANCE LA MOUNT LE BALANCE LA
CHANGE REPAIR CHANGE REPAIR
25/1000x12 A/T 6-CPLY $79.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 2000|% 3000 $  20.00 NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
UTV TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
DIQIDINIE CHANGE L AN REPAIR | MOUNT CHANGE AL REPAIR
25x11x12 A/T 6-CPLY $120.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
28x10x12 A/T 8 PLY $140.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
INDUSTRIAL TBL & INDUSTRIAL LUG TBL TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
DIQIDINIE CHANGE e REPAIR | MOUNT CHANGE SN REPAIR
111.x15 F3 TREAD 8PLY $145.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
11Lx16 F3 TREAD 10-PLY $150.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
17.51.24 R4 TREAD 8-PLY $400.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
19.5x24 R4 TREAD $464.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID

OK TIRE & AUTO

T & W TIRE

TIRES / TIRE SERVICE
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



TIRES / TIRE SERVICES LOWEST BIDDER

DRIVE LUG TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR

1IRx225 LUG 14GPLY | $295.00[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID 5 5000 5 5500

1IRx24.5 LUG 14GPLY | $300.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NOBID 5 5000 5 5500

OKTIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
FARM TUBE TYPE TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR
13.6x28 R1 TREAD 6PLY |  $400.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
16.9x34 R1 TREAD 6PLY |  $700.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
18.4x30 RI TREAD 8-PLY $576.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 60.00[$ 7000 $  60.00 NO BID
18.4x34 R1 TREAD 8-PLY $606.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 6000 |$ 70.00 $  60.00 NO BID
18.4x38 R TREAD 8PLY | $599.00|OK TIRE & AUTO § 7000|$ 80.00 $  70.00 NO BID
20.8x38 R1 TREAD sPLY | $101.00/OK TIRE & AUTO $ 7000 [$ 80.00 $  70.00 NO BID
OKTIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
FARM TUBELESS TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR
750x16 TRIRIB 6-PLY $125.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
1000x16 TRIRIB 8- PLY $160.00[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE[ § 2000 [ $ 3000 | [s 2000 NO BID
1100x16 TRIRIB 8-PLY $180.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
OKTIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
TUBETYPE TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR
900x20 HY $278.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| § 5000 [ $  60.00 $ 5000 NO BID
900x20 LUG $285.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE[ $  50.00 | §  60.00 $  50.00 NO BID
OKTIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
SUPTRAC DUPLEX TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE REPAIR

TIRES / TIRE SERVICE
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

LOWEST BIDDER

14x17.5 NHS TREAD 8-PLY $300.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
TRACTOR TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CRANCE BALANCE REpAIR | MOUNT CRANCE BALANCE SEPAT
13.6x24 R-1 TREAD 8- $400.00 |[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 50.00|$  60.00 $  50.00 NO BID
280/85R24 R-1 TREAD 8- $300.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO $ 5000[% 60.00 $  50.00 NO BID
340/85Rx24 R1 8-PLY $375.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 5000|% 60.00 $  50.00 NO BID
380/85Rx24 R1 8PLY $435.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 5000 % 60.00 $ 5.00 NO BID
460/85Rx34 R1 8-PLY $760.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 6000|% 70.00 $  60.00 NO BID
480/85Rx34 R1 8PLY $1,300.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
20.8x34 R1 8-PLY $1,368.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 7000 ($ 80.00 $ 70.00 NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
GRADER/LOADER TUBELESS TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MIGINIE | e v e RePAIR CHANGE LiALLENC]E REPAIR
17.5x25 G2 12-PLY $600.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
20.5x25 G2 $850.00( DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
LOADER ROCKLUG TUBELESS TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MIGINIE | = e e RePAIR CHANGE AL LN REPAIR
17.5x25 RL TREAD 12-PLY $620.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
TURE TIRE TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MIGINIE | e e e RePAIR CHANGE AL LN REPAIR
23.1x26 12PLY | $1,000.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE NO BID NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
TUBELESS PREMIUM 181 LBS. TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
MOUNT CRANCE BALANCE REpAIR | MOUNT CRANCE BALANCE SEPAT

TIRES / TIRE SERVICE
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

LOWEST BIDDER

1400x24 G2 TREAD 12-PLY $385.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE| $ 95.00 | $ 115.00 $ 9500 NO BID
OK TIRE & AUTO T & W TIRE
TUBELESS ECONOMY 137 LBS. TIRE FLAT TIRE FLAT
LACLCIE CHANGE L REPAIR L (C1OIE CHANGE LS INELE REPAIR
1400x24 G2 TREAD 12-PLY $375.00|OK TIRE & AUTO $ 9500 |$ 115.00 $ 95.00 NO BID
RECAPPED WITH CORE
11IRx22.5 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
11IRx24.5 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

1400x24 RADIAL CG-2

NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

1400x24 RADIAL CG-3

NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

OK TIRE & AUTO
T & W TIRE

SERVICE CALLS

BASE AFTER DELAY
CHARGE | HOURS PER MILE CHARGE
$ 75.00($ 150.00 | $ 400|$ 80.00
$ 130.00|$ 275.00 |$ 250 ($ 100.00

TIRES / TIRE SERVICE
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



HAULING

LOWEST BIDDER
10 WHEELER
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 50 MILES $ 4.17 |15S DIRT WORKS
51 -70 MILES $ 3.92 |5S DIRT WORKS
71-90 MILES $ 3.77 [5S DIRT WORKS
91 - 100 MILES $ 3.72 |5S DIRT WORKS
OVER 100 MILES $ 3.63 [5S DIRT WORKS
TRI-AXLE
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 50 MILES $ 5.10 | PARROTT TRUCKING
51 -70 MILES $ 5.05 | PARROTT TRUCKING
71-90 MILES $ 5.00 | PARROTT TRUCKING
91 - 100 MILES $ 4.95 | PARROTT TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES $ 4.95 | PARROTT TRUCKING
18 WHEELER - BELLY DUMP TRAILER
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 6.35 [JUSTIN NIMROD
26 - 50 MILES $ 5.00 [JUSTIN NIMROD
51-70 MILES $ 5.00 [JUSTIN NIMROD
71-90 MILES $ 5.00 [JUSTIN NIMROD
91 - 100 MILES $ 4.95 |JUSTIN NIMROD
OVER 100 MILES $ 4.84 |58 DIRT WORKS

18 WHEELER - END DUMP TRAILER

PER LOADED MILE
0-25 MILES $ 6.75 [5S DIRT WORKS
26 - 50 MILES $ 5.56 |58 DIRT WORKS
51 -70 MILES $ 5.23 |5S DIRT WORKS
71-90 MILES $ 5.03 |58 DIRT WORKS
91 - 100 MILES $ 4.96 |5S DIRT WORKS
OVER 100 MILES $ 4.84 |5S DIRT WORKS

TRUCK & PUP TRAILER

PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 5.75 | PARROTT TRUCKING
26 - 50 MILES $ 4.85 | PARROTT TRUCKING
51-70 MILES $ 4.85 | PARROTT TRUCKING
71-90 MILES $ 4.85 | PARROTT TRUCKING
91 - 100 MILES $ 4.85 | PARROTT TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES $ 4.85 | PARROTT TRUCKING

HAULING
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024



HAULING

2ND LOWEST BIDDER
10 WHEELER

PER LOADED MILE
0 -50 MILES $ 4.65 | PARROTT TRUCKING
51-70 MILES $ 4.60 | PARROTT TRUCKING
71-90 MILES $ 4.60 | PARROTT TRUCKING
91 - 100 MILES $ 4,55 | PARROTT TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES $ 455 | PARROTT TRUCKING
|

TRI-AXLE

PER LOADED MILE
0 -50 MILES
51 - 70 MILES
71 -90 MILES NO 2ND LOWEST BIDDER
01 - 100 MILES
OVER 100 MILES

18 WHEELER - BELLY DUMP TRAILER

PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 6.75 [5S DIRT WORKS
26 - 50 MILES $ 5.56 |5S DIRT WORKS
51-70 MILES $ 5.23 |5S DIRT WORKS
71-90 MILES $ 5.03 |5S DIRT WORKS
91 - 100 MILES $ 4.96 |5S DIRT WORKS
OVER 100 MILES $ 4.95 |JUSTIN NIMROD

18 WHEELER - END DUMP TRAILER

PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 9.50 [KMB TRUCKING
26 - 50 MILES $ 8.50 |KMB TRUCKING
51 - 70 MILES $ 7.00 [KMB TRUCKING
71-90 MILES $ 6.50 |KMB TRUCKING
91 - 100 MILES $ 6.50 [KMB TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES $ 6.50 |KMB TRUCKING
...

TRUCK & PUP TRAILER

PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES
26 - 50 MILES
51 - 70 MILES
1= 90 MILES NO 2ND LOWEST BIDDER
91 - 100 MILES
OVER 100 MILES

HAULING
1/1/2024 - 6/30/2024
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