PITTSBURG COUNTY

SIX MONTH BIDS

CRUSHED STONE
ASPHALT SAND
ROAD OILS
GRADER BLADES
PLASTIC PIPE
USED STEEL PIPE
NEW & USED STEEL
HAULING
TIRES
TIRE SERVICE

January 1, 2026

THROUGH
June 30, 2026



Six Month Bid Awards
January 1, 2026 - June 30, 2026

Crushed Stone

DISTRICT 1

Everything South of Crowder - Blocker Road is awarded to Dolese

Everything North of Crowder - Blocker Road is awarded to Stigler Stone

DISTRICT 2

Everything West of Indian Nations Turnpike and South of Highway 31 is awarded to SCS Materials

All other areas and materials are awarded to Dolese

DISTRICT 3

Everything awarded to Dolese

CHIPS

All Chips awarded to Dolese, with the exception of Non-Spec Chips

Non-Spec Chips awarded to SCS Materials

DECOMPOSED SCREENED GRANITE

Not Awarded. Blessing Gravel is sole-source.

Asphalt Sand

Class "A" Sand is awarded to Muskogee Sand
Manufactured Sand is awarded to Dolese Bros Co. as the best bid, due to location and quality

Road Oils

Awarded to the lowest bidder. May be purchased through State Contract SW 690

Grader Blades

Awarded to only bidder.

Plastic Pipe

Awarded to Lowest Bidder. If unavailable to not move to next lowest bidder, if still unavailable contact
purchasing for phone quote.

Used Steel Pipe

Awarded to lowest bidder. If unavailable, move to next lowest bidder. Commissioners awarded so that
no letter is needed when not available by lowest bidder.

New & Used Steel

Awarded to lowest bidder

Tires

Awarded to Lowest Bidder.  If unavailable, move to next lowest bidder. Commissioners awarded so
that no letter is needed when not available by lowest bidder

May also purchase from State Contract. ABC Tire (Michelin), T&W Tire (Goodyear),

Jet Tire Servie (Bridgestone)

Tire Service

Awarded to All Bidders, due to availability.

Hauling

Awarded to the lowest bidder. If unavailable, move to next lowest bidder. Commissioners awarded so
that no letter is needed when not available by lowest bidder.




CRUSHED STONE/SAND

District #1

South of Crowder/Blocker Road - Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)
North of Crowder/Blocker Road - Stigler Stone

District #2

West of Indian Nations Turnpike and South of Highway 31 - SCS Materials
All other area and materials - Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)

District #3

All Materials awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)

CHIPS - All Districts

All Non-Spec Chips - SCS Materials (F.O.B. - Atoka)

All Other Chips - Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)

11.00 [STIGLER STONE
12.00 |SCS MATERIALS
12.50 |DOLESE

Sl

#4 SCREENINGS

I"TBSC TYPE A 13.50 |STIGLER STONE

16.50 |STIGLER STONE

1!]

ror 17.70 |DOLESE

1" #57 16,50 |STIGLER STONE
12" #57 16.00 |STIGLER STONE

16.85 [DOLESE

11/2" MILL RUN 13.50 |STIGLER STONE

11.50 [SCS MATERIALS
13.50 |STIGLER STONE
13.65 |DOLESE

11/2" ODOT BASE TYPE A

11/2" ODOT BASE TYPE B 13.50 |STIGLER STONE

2" MILL RUN #11 12.00 |STIGLER STONE

14.00 |SCS MATERIALS
16.00 [STIGLER STONE
17.30 [DOLESE

2" CLEAN ROCK

15.50 |STIGLER STONE

4" ODOT FILTER BLANKET 16.60 |DOLESE

6" ODOT FILTER BLANKET 15.50 |STIGLER STONE

4" FILTER STONE 15.50 [STIGLER STONE

11.50 |STIGLER STONE

1" CRUSHER RUN
12.50 [DOLESE

11.50 |SCS MATERIALS
11.50 |STIGLER STONE
12.05 [DOLESE

11/2" CRUSHER RUN

11.50 |STIGLER STONE
12.05 [DOLESE
12.50 [SCS MATERIALS

21/2" CRUSHER RUN

4" TO11/2" SPECIAL GRIZZLY 15.50 |STIGLER STONE

13.70 [DOLESE

3" SURGE 14.50 |SCS MATERIALS
16.00 [STIGLER STONE
8'SURGE 13.35 [DOLESE
15.00 [STIGLER STONE
SHOT DOWN ROCK 1310 |DOLESE
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16.00 [STIGLER STONE

CRUSHED STONE/SAND
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



CRUSHED STONE/SAND

6' TO 8" RIP RAP $ 22.00 [STIGLER STONE

12 SELECT RIP RAP $ 27.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 30.75 |DOLESE

18' SELECT RIP RAP $ 25.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 30.75 |[DOLESE

24" SELECT RIP RAP $ 25.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 30.75 |DOLESE

30" SELECT RIP RAP $ 25.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 30.75 [DOLESE

QUARRY RUN RIP RAP $ 16.00 |STIGLER STONE

DECOMPOSED SCREENED GRANITE NOT AWARDED

OILFIELD ROCK (A KA. 1TO11/2

DECOMPOSED SéREENED GRANITE NOT AWARDED

CHIPS

3/4" #1 COVER CHIPS $ 23.10 |DOLESE

3/8" #2 COVER CHIPS $ 23.55 |DOLESE

3/8" NON-SPEC CHIPS $ 15.00 |SCS MATERIALS

5/8" #3 COVER CHIPS $ 2330 |DOLESE

5/8" #3-C COVER CHIPS $ 23.45 | DOLESE

5/8" NON-SPEC CHIPS $ 15.00 | SCS MATERIALS

SAND
CLASS "A" SAND $ 12.55 |MUSKOGEE SAND
MANUFACTURED SAND $ 15.35 |DOLESE

IF AN ITEM IS UNAVAILABLE, PLEASE CONTACT PURCHASING FOR NEXT

AVAILABLE BIDDER OR PHONE QUOTE.

CRUSHED STONE/SAND
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026




ROAD OILS

CRS+2 $ 2.25 [ERGON
CRS-2S $ 2.38 |[ERGON
SS-1 $ 2.39 |COASTAL ENERGY
CRS-2 $ 2.02 [WRIGHT ASPHALT
MC-30 $ 2.74 |ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
MC-3000 $ 2.50 [ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
AE-P $ 2.56 |COASTAL ENERGY
PG 64-22 OK ASPHALT BINDER (TON) $ 560.00 [ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
AC-20 ASPHALT BINDER (TON) $ 550.00 |ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
PG 64-22 PROLINE OR EQUIVALENT| $ 2.62 WRIGHT ASPHALT
$ 75.00 [PUMP CHARGE
ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY b U008 |PENIURRACE
48 TON [MINIMUM (ASPHALT BINDER)
5500 GAL.IMINIMUM (ALL OTHERS)
$ 150.00 [PUMP CHARGE
WRIGHT ASPHALT $ 100.00 |DEMURRAGE
48,000 LB. [MINIMUM
$ 150.00 [PUMP CHARGE
ERGON $ 100.00 |DEMURRAGE
48,000 LB.|MINIMUM
$ 125.00 |[PUMP CHARGE
COASTAL ENERGY $ 100.00 |DEMURRAGE
5,500 GAL [MINIMUM

COASTAL ENERGY - $1,550.00 FOR LOADS LESS THAN 5,500 GALLON

ERGON - FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL FEE WILL BE ADDED TO ABOVE
PRICES AT RATE OF $0.49770/TON FOR ASPHALT & POLYMER LOADS OR
$0.00150/GAL FOR EMULSION LOADS

PLEASE NOTE: THE
LOWEST BIDDER MUST BE USED UNTIL UNAVAILABLE

STATEWIDE CONTRACT #SW690 MAY ALSO BE USED.

ROAD OILS
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



CONCRETE CULVERTS

GREY

12" $ 16.58 |SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
15" $ 20.15 |SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
18" $ 25.03 [SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
21" $ 59.00 FOSME, LLF

24" $ 28.00 |SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
30" $ 40.50 [SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
36" $ 62.00 |SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
42 $ 78.25 |SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
48" $ 95.00 |SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
54" $ 117.75 [SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
60" $ 138.75 |SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
66" $ 188.25 |SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
72" $ 215.00 [SCURLOCK INDUSTRIES
78" NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

84" NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

96" $ 549.00 FOSME, LLF

120" NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

FOSMF, LLC DBA OKLAHOMA PRECAST PRODUCTS

Also can be purchased through State Contract SW0094

CONCRETE CULVERTS
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



GRADER BLADES

5/8" BOLT HOLE
5/8"X6"X7 $ 92.92 |[DUB ROSS
5/8"' X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 128.60 |DUB ROSS
3/4" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 154.25 |DUB ROSS
3/4" X 8" X 7' (NON CARBON) $ 208.67 |DUB ROSS
3/4" BOLT HOLE
5/8'X6" X7 $ 92.92 |DUB ROSS
5/8" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 128.60 |[DUB ROSS
3/4" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 154.25 |DUB ROSS
3/4" X 8" X7 (NON CARBON) $ 208.67 [WARREN CAT

STATEWIDE CONTRACT# SW501

GRADER BLADES
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



PLASTIC PIPE

GREY
12" $ 8.99 |DUBROSS CO.LLC
15 $ 12.90 |DUBROSS CO.LILC
18" $ 17.41 |DUBROSS CO.LLC
21 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
24" $ 26.36 |[DUBROSS CO.LLC
30" $ 40.20 |DUBROSS CO.LLC
36" $ 52.57 |DUBROSS CO.LLC
42" $ 65.39 |DUBROSS CO.LLC
48’ $ 89.95 [DUBROSS CO.LLC
60" $ 123.57 |[DUBROSS CO.LLC

GREY
12" $ 0.05 |CORE & MAIN, LP
15 $ 12.97 |CORE & MAIN, LP
18" $ 17.50 |CORE & MAIN, LP
21" NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
24" $ 26.50 |CORE & MAIN, LP
30" $ 40.41 |CORE & MAIN, LP
36" $ 52.85 [CORE & MAIN, LP
42" $ 65.80 |CORE & MAIN, LP
48" $ 90.00 |CORE & MAIN, LP
60" $ 123.83 |CORE & MAIN, LP

Also can be purchased through State Contract SW0094

PLASTIC PIPE

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



USED STEEL PIPE

1 16.47 |THE RAILROAD YARD
16 S 21.00 |ALFORD METALS
i S 36.00 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
20" S 31.83 |THE RAILROAD YARD
22" S 28.80 |THE RAILROAD YARD
24" S 41.60 |THE RAILROAD YARD
26' S 32.40 |[ALFORD METALS
30 S 46.79 |THE RAILROAD YARD
34 S 5130 | THE RAILROAD YARD
36 S 6615 |THE RAILROAD YARD |
75y S 8220 | THE RAILROAD YARD
48" S 124.50 [ALFORD METALS
54 S 140.00 | ALFORD METALS
60" S 156.00 [ALFORD METALS
7 S 357.50 | THE RAILROAD YARD
g S 414.00 |[SUNBELT EQUIPMENT |
812 S 415.00 | THE RAILROAD YARD
] S 430.00 |THE RAILROAD YARD
0172 S 430.00 |THE RAILROAD YARD
10 S 445.00 |THE RAILROAD YARD

USED DRILL TUBING (PER FOOT)
23/8" S 1.8400 [ALFORD METALS
2 7/8° S 22500 |[ALFORD METALS

IF UNAVAILABLE, DROP TO NEXT LOWEST BIDDER

12' $ 18.95 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
16' $ 25.35 |[THE RAILROAD YARD
18’ $ 37.70 |THE RAILROAD YARD
20" $ 3250 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
22 $ 36.50 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
24" $ 41.80 |[SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
26 $ 34.98 [THE RAILROAD YARD
30" $ 68.00 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
34 $ 56.40 | SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
36' $ 85.00 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
42" $ 108.90 | ALLFORD METALS
48" $ 128.90 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
54" $ 188.00 | SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
60" $ 219.00 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
7 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
8 $ 415.00 | THE RAILROAD YARD
81/2 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
o NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
91/2' $ 450.00 [SUNBELT EQUIPMENT
10 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

USED DRILL TUBING (PER FOOT)
23/8' $ 23925 |[THE RAILROAD YARD
27/8' $ 23925 |THE RAILROAD YARD

USED STEEL PIPE
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



NEW USED STEEL

USED TANK CARS
1/2 TANK CAR (PER FOOT) $ 475.00 |THE RAILROAD YARD
FULL TANK CAR (PER FOOT) $ 445.00 |THE RAILROAD YARD

NEW USED STEEL
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



HAULING

PLEASE LOOK CAREFULLY
FORMAT HAS CHANGED

10 WHEELER
LOWEST BIDDER

PER LOADED MILE
0- 50 MILES 5 400 [PARROTT TRUCKING
51- 70 MILES S 3.87 |5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
71- 90 MILES 5 3.72 |5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
o1 - 100 MILES S 3.67 |55 DIRT WORKS, LLC
OVER 100 MILES 5 3.58 |55 DIRT WORKS, LLC
SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

PER LOADED MILE
0- 50 MILES S 412 [5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
51- 70 MILES S 3.95 |PARROTT TRUCKING
71- 90 MILES S 3.00 [PARROTT TRUCKING
o1 - 100 MILES S 3.80 |PARROTT TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES S 3.80 |PARROTT TRUCKING
TRI-AXLE
LOWEST BIDDER

PER LOADED MILE
0- 50 MILES 5 510 | PARROTT TRUCKING
51- 70 MILES S 5.00 | PARROTT TRUCKING
71- 90 MILES 5 495 | PARROTT TRUCKING
o1 - 100 MILES 5 495 | PARROTT TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES 5 490 | PARROTT TRUCKING
TRI-AXLE
SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

PER LOADED MILE
0- 50 MILES
51 - 70 MILES NO SECOND LOWEST BIDS
/1-90 MILES PHONE QUOTE
o1 - 100 MILES
OVER 100 MILES

HAULING
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



HAULING

18 WHEELER - BELLY DUMP TRAILER

LOWEST BIDDER

PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 6.70 [5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
26 - 50 MILES $ 5.51 |5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
51 - 70 MILES $ 5.18 |5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
71-90 MILES $ 4.98 [5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
91 - 100 MILES $ 4.91 |5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
OVER 100 MILES $ 4.79 |5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
18 WHEELER - BELLY DUMP TRAILER
SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 6.75 |KMB TRUCKING, LLC
26 - 50 MILES $ 6.00 |[KMB TRUCKING, LLC
51 - 70 MILES $ 5.50 |KMB TRUCKING, LLC
71-90 MILES $ 5.50 |KMB TRUCKING, LLC
91 - 100 MILES $ 5.50 [KMB TRUCKING, LLC
OVER 100 MILES $ 5.50 |KMB TRUCKING, LLC

18 WHEELER - END DUMP TRAILER

SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 6.70 |5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
26 - 50 MILES $ 5.51 |5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
51-70 MILES $ 518 [5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
71-90 MILES $ 4.98 [5S DIRT WORKS, LLC
91 - 100 MILES $ 4.91 |58 DIRT WORKS, LLC
OVER 100 MILES $ 4.79 |58 DIRT WORKS, LLC
18 WHEELER - END DUMP TRAILER
SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 6.75 |KMB TRUCKING. LLC
26 - 50 MILES $ 6.00 |KMB TRUCKING. LLC
51 - 70 MILES $ 5.50 |KMB TRUCKING. LLC
71-90 MILES $ 5.50 [KMB TRUCKING. LLC
91 - 100 MILES $ 5.50 |KMB TRUCKING. LLC
OVER 100 MILES $ 5.50 [KMB TRUCKING. LLC

HAULING
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



HAULING

TRUCK & PUP TRAILER
LOWEST BIDDER

PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 6.40 | PARROTT TRUCKING
26 - 50 MILES $ 5.40 | PARROTT TRUCKING
51-70 MILES $ 5.35 | PARROTT TRUCKING
71-90 MILES $ 5.00 | PARROTT TRUCKING
91 - 100 MILES $ 5.00 | PARROTT TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES $ 4.90 | PARROTT TRUCKING
TRUCK & PUP TRAILER
SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

PER LOADED MILE
0-25 MILES
26 - 50 MILES
51 -70 MILES NO SECOND LOWEST BID
71-90 MILES PHONE QUOTE
91 - 100 MILES
OVER 100 MILES

HAULING
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

PLEASE LOOK CAREFULLY
FORMAT HAS CHANGED
RADIALS
LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE
VENDOR BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT VENDOR BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNTTIRE [SAMSON | $550 | $195.00 [T3 TIRE & WELDING [FIRESTONE [  $5.00 | $419.29
ORY2.5 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
' LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [SOUTHERN TIRE MART | | $550 | $511.56 [T3 TIRE & WELDING GOODYEAR | $5.00 [ $744.00
10RX22.5 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
' LUG TYPE |SOUTHERN TIRE MART | | $550 | $44153 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [T3 TIRE & WELDING SUPERCARGO|  $5.00 $324.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART | |  $550 | $360.45
LIRS ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE SUPERMAX $5.50 $365.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
' LUG TYPE |SOUTHERN TIRE MART $5.50 $379.50 |DOWLESS SERVICE |suPpERMAX | $550 | $556.00
MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE SUPERMAX $5.50 $365.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE PERCHERON $5.50 $365.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART | 75|  $550 | $385.00
11Rx24.5 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE PERCHERON $5.50 $380.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
14 PLY LUG TYPE  |SOUTHERN TIRE MART $5.50 $390.50 |DOWLESS SERVICE | | 3550 | $605.00
MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE PERCHERON $5.50 $380.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY [DOWLESS SERVICE [MRL | $550 | $685.00 |[T3 TIRE & WELDING |MRL |  $5.00 | $693.41
17 5RY2S ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
' LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |MAXAN | $550 | $1,075.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART |FIRESTONE | | $1,370.25
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [T3 TIRE & WELDING |[TRAILERMSTR|  $250 | $143.94 |DOWLESS SERVICE | | $290 [ s160.00
750Rx16 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
14 PLY, TRAILER LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE |V-RUBBER | $2.90 | $315.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
900RX20 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
X LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [DOWLESS SERVICE | |  $550 | $327.00 |[T3TIRE & WELDING |GALAXY | $5.00 | $467.00
1000Rx20 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |T3 TIRE & WELDING |GALAXY [ $5.00 | $1,243.41 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
1400Rx24 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
*ONE LUG TYPE [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |westiake/apvancef  $5.50 | $875.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  |FIRESTONE | | $1,195.11
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
TIRE TYPE
TIRE SIZE VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY [SOUTHERN TIRE MART | | $2.90 [ $88.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE [TRAILERMSTR|  $2.90 | $90.00
ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
>T205 75Rx15 LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE |BLACKHAWK [ $2.90 | $69.00 [T & W TIRE |GOODYEAR | $2.90 [ $80.00
215 60RX16 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
X LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE [SAMSON | $550 | $145.00 |[T3 TIRE & WELDING [SUPERMAX | $500 | $170.66
ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
215 75Rx17.5 a a
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $115.00 |T & W TIRE |GOODYEAR | $2.90 | $120.96
215 85Rx16 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $137.35 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
X LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [SOUTHERN TIRE MART |FIRESTONE | $290 | $96.40 [T & WTIRE |[GOODYEAR | $290 | $110.00
ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
225 60VRx16 LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

VENDOR | BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT

HIGHWAY [T & W TIRE |GOODYEAR | $290 | $125.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART |FIREHAWK [ $290 | $127.00
ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
225 60VRx18 LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |SOUTHERN TIRE MART  |FIRESTONE $2.90 $113.20 |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BFG $2.90 $250.00

295 65Rx17 ALL TERRAIN [T3 TIRE & WELDING GOODYEAR $2.50 $175.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE GOODYEAR $2.90 $181.00
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE SUPERMAX $2.90 $185.00 |SOUTHERN TIRE MART  |FIRESTONE $5.50 $319.00

995 70RX19.5 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE SUPERMAX $2.90 $190.00 |T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $5.50 $328.98
X33 LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY [T3 TIRE & WELDING [TRAVELSTAR| $250 | $92.72 [DIRECT DISCOUNTTIRE |WESTLAKE | $290 | $95.00

ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
ST225 75Rx15 LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $110.00 |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $144.00

295 75Rx16 ALL TERRAIN [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $122.00 |SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $134.34
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR [ BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |WESTLAKE $2.90 $95.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART | |  $290 | $193.60
295 75Rx17 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $194.80 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
X LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [WESTLAKE $2.90 $95.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART | |  $2.90 | $193.60
L7295 75Rx17 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $194.80 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [T & W TIRE [GOODYEAR | $290 | $148.00 |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART |FIREHAWK [ $2.90 | $186.94
235 50Rx18 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
X LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK | $2.90 | $90.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART [FIREHAWK | $2.90 | $113.00
235 55RY17 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART  |FIRESTONE | $2.90 | $108.80 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
235 70RX16 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

VENDOR [ BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT

HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $100.00 |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $110.83

235 75RX15 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $118.95 |DOWLESS SERVICE MASTERCRFT $2.90 $175.00
X LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $100.00 |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $110.83

LT235 75Rx15 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $118.95 |T3 TIRE & WELDING MASTERCRFT $2.50 $162.15
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $89.00  [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $110.83

P235 75Rx15 ALL TERRAIN [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $78.72  |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $96.00

X LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |SOUTHERN TIRE MART | |  $290 | $180.40 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
235 75R17 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY [T3 TIRE & WELDING [MASTERCRFT | $2.50 | $125.00 [DOWLESS SERVICE [TRAILERMSTR|  $2.90 | $130.00
235 S0RX16 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

VENDOR [ BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT

HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $135.00 [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $152.28

235 80Rx17 ALL TERRAIN [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $140.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $180.40
10 PLY LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
235 80Rx17 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
14 PLY LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |T3 TIRE & WELDING [MICHELIN | $2.50 $433.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
535 SORX18 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
X LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |TRAVELSTAR $2.90 $115.00 [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $128.52

235 85Rx16 ALL TERRAIN [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $159.92 [DOWLESS SERVICE MASTERCRFT $2.90 $232.00
10 PLY, HD CUT/CHIP LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |WESTLAKE $2.90 $135.00 |[T3 TIRE & WELDING COOPER $2.50 $220.05

235 85RXx16 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE $2.90 $182.40 |[T3 TIRE & WELDING COOPER $2.50 $224.68
10 PLY, MAX TRACTION LUG TYPE [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $153.36 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE COOPER $2.90 $265.00 |73 TIRE & WELDING [COOPER [ 5250 | $272.00

TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR | BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY [T & W TIRE |GOODYEAR | $290 | $132.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART |FIREHAWK [ $290 | $137.20
245 S5RX18 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
X LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $98.00 |SOUTHERN TIRE MART  |FIRESTONE $2.90 $108.00
245 GORX18 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $148.00 |T3 TIRE & WELDING COOPER $2.50 $217.00
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $105.00 |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $176.00
245 70Rx17 ALL TERRAIN |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $125.00 [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $172.66
10 PLY LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW|T3 TIRE & WELDING [MASTERCRFT|  $2.50 [ $242.00 [DOWLESS SERVICE [MASTERCRFT| $2.90 | $250.00
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
245 70Rx17 ALL TERRAIN |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE $2.90 $193.20 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
10 PLY, MAX TRACTION LUGTYPE |T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $184.91 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE ~ [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $140.00 |[T3 TIRE & WELDING [MASTERCRFT|  $2.50 [ S242.00
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $120.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $153.60
245 75Rx16 ALL TERRAIN |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $130.00 |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $146.06
10 PLY LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW|[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK |  $2.90 [ $140.00 [T3 TIRE & WELDING [MASTERCRFT| $2.50 [ $179.00
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR | BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY |T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $125.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
245 75Rx16 ALL TERRAIN [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $163.28 |SOUTHERN TIRE MART | |  $2.90 | $194.00
10 PLY, MAX TRACTION LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW|[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK |  $2.90 $140.00 |[T3 TIRE & WELDING [COOPER [ S250 [ $265.00
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $115.00 [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $150.00
245 75Rx17 ALL TERRAIN |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $125.00 |SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $154.77
10 PLY LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE [ [ S2.90 $297.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $180.00 [T3 TIRE & WELDING COOPER $2.50 $199.00
245 75Rx17 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE $2.90 $214.80 [T3 TIRE & WELDING COOPER $2.50 $224.00
10 PLY, MAX TRACTION LUG TYPE [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $190.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $130.00 |[T3 TIRE & WELDING [COOPER [  S250 [ $275.00
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE [SAMSON |  $5.50 $205.00 T3 TIRE & WELDING [SUPERMAX | $7.50 | $245.99
ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
255 70Rx22.5 a a
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $132.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART | |  S$290 | $132.20
265 60VRX17 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $173.16 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $122.00 [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $162.91
P265 E5RX18 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $202.00 [DOWLESS SERVICE MASTERCRFT $2.90 $209.00
X LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $130.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $146.90
265 70Rx17 ALL TERRAIN |T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $177.37 |SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $179.22
10 PLY LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW|T3 TIRE & WELDING [MASTERCRFT|  $2.50 | $252.00 [DOWLESS SERVICE IMASTERCRFT | $2.90 | $261.00
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
265 70Rx17 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE $2.90 $223.20 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
10 PLY, MAX TRACTION | LUGTYPE [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $206.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW/|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |[BLACKHAWK $2.90 $150.00 T3 TIRE & WELDING [COOPER [ $250 | $285.00
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $120.00 |T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $127.72
P265 70Rx17 ALL TERRAIN [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $130.00 |[DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $145.00
4pLY LUG TYPE [DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $154.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $115.00 [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $144.72
265 75Rx16 ALL TERRAIN [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $125.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $2.90 $155.44
10 PLY LUG TYPE |[DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $170.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $279.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
TIRE TYPE
TIRE SIZE VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
265 75Rx16 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE $2.90 $213.60 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
10 PLY, MAX TRACTION LUGTYPE |T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $220.56 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW/|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $145.00 |[T3 TIRE & WELDING [COOPER [ [ $281.00
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $140.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $177.00
275 65RY18 ALL TERRAIN [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $155.00 |[DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $174.00
X LUG TYPE |[DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $184.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW/|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $170.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE [ [ 290 [ $199.00
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $150.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $208.00
275 70RX18 ALL TERRAIN [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $160.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $186.00
LUG TYPE [DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $194.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $290.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |PETLAS |  $290 | $380.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
580 85R24 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE |[DOWLESS SERVICE [STORMAXX | $8.00 | $440.00 |SOUTHERN TIREMART |[FIRESTONE | $5.50 [ $634.28
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $160.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
285 70RX17 ALL TERRAIN [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BLACKHAWK $2.90 $175.00 |[DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $183.00
LUG TYPE [DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $190.00 [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $242.83
MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $349.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR [ BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
285 75Rx16 ALL TERRAIN |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BLACKHAWK $2.90 $145.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE | |  $290 | $305.00
10 PLY LUGTYPE [T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $229.55 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $305.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
285 75Rx16 ALL TERRAIN [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE $2.90 $234.80 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
10 PLY, MAX TRACTION LUGTYPE (T & W TIRE GOODYEAR $2.90 $229.55 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BH $5.50 $285.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE $5.50 $370.00
285 75RX24.5 ALL TERRAIN |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [SAMSON $5.50 $290.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $5.50 $390.50
' LUG TYPE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BH/SAMSON $5.50 $270.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE | |  $550 | $365.00
995 75R%22.5 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE $5.50 $375.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
' LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |BH/SAMSON $5.50 $280.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART | | $550 | $379.50
MUD & SNOW/|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BH/SAMSON $5.50 $290.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [SOUTHERN TIRE MART $5.50 $548.71 |T & W TIRE |GOODYEAR | $5.50 | $570.57
315 80RX22.5 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE HANKOOK $5.50 $700.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
Xee. LUG TYPE |SOUTHERN TIRE MART $5.50 $841.44 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

RADIALS
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR | BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY |[DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $540.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
340 85RY24 ALL TERRAIN |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BKT $5.50 $470.00 |[DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $540.00
LUG TYPE |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $540.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE $8.00 $684.35
MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $540.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $445.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
380 85Rx24 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $445.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $445.00 [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [BKT/PETLAS | $550 | $580.00
MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $445.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |[DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $1,054.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
460 85R34 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $1,054.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |PETLAS $5.50 $1,030.00 [DOWLESS SERVICE [STARMAXX |  $8.00 | $1,054.00
MUD & SNOW|DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $1,054.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
480 85Rx34 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [PETLAS |  $550 | $1,100.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

BIAS TIRES
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR [ BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $2.90 $177.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
11Lx15 ALL TERRAIN |[DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $2.90 $177.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
IFSJS?RDIAT PLY LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |ATF $2.90 $130.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART [REGENCY | $8.00 | $163.62
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $2.90 $177.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
11LX16 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $2.90 $177.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
rjgjgfmo PLY LUG TYPE |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [REGENCY $8.00 $154.25 |DOWLESS SERVICE [MRL | s290 | $177.00
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $368.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
12.4x24 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $368.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
R1TREAD LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [SAMSON $2.90 $280.00 [DOWLESS SERVICE [STARMAXX | $8.00 | $368.00
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $5.50 $376.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
12.5/80x18 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $5.50 $376.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
R4 TREAD, BACKHOE LUG TYPE |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [REGENCY $8.00 $258.55 |DIRECT DISCOUNTTIRE [SAMSON | $2.90 | $325.00
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY
12x16 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
R4 TREAD, SKID STEER LUG TYPE
MUD & SNOW
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

BIAS TIRES
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

VENDOR | BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT

HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $2.90 $195.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

12x16.5 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $2.90 $195.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
NHS TREAD, 12 PLY LUG TYPE |[DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $2.90 $195.00 [SOUTHERN TIREMART |REGENCY [ $8.00 | $220.94

MUD & SNOW NO, BID PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $5.50 $421.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

13.6x24 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $5.50 $421.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
R1TREAD, 8 PLY, TRACTOR | LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |ATF $5.50 $320.00 [DOWLESS SERVICE [sTARMAXX | 3550 | $421.00

MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $5.50 $461.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

13.6x28 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $5.50 $461.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
_';SJ;‘EAD' 6 PLY, FARM LUG TYPE [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [SAMSON $5.50 $325.00 [DOWLESS SERVICE [STARMAXX |  $5.50 | $461.00

MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $2.90 $296.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

14x17.5 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $2.90 $296.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
NHS TREAD, 8 PLY LUG TYPE |DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $2.90 $296.00 [SOUTHERN TIREMART [REGENCY | 3$8.00 | $334.61

MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $736.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

16.9x34 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $736.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
R1 TREAD LUG TYPE [DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [SAMSON $5.50 $615.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE [sTARMAXX |  $8.00 | $736.00

MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

BIAS TIRES
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR | BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $5.50 $615.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
17.5x24 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $5.50 $615.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
IR;DTLTSETAR'?Af PLY, LUG TYPE |DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $5.50 $615.00 |SOUTHERN TIRE MART [FIRESTONE | $8.00 | $624.83
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |[DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $5.50 $703.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
17.5x25 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $5.50 $703.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
G2, 12 PLY LUG TYPE |DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $5.50 $703.00 |[SOUTHERN TIRE MART [FIRESTONE | 3800 [ $822.24
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
17.5x25 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
E;gﬁfﬁg 12PLY, LUG TYPE [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE | $8.00 | $822.55 |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE [MAXAM | $550 | $1,075.00
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |[DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $697.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
18.4x30 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $697.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
%;EEAD' 6 PLY, FARM LUG TYPE |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $697.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART [FIRESTONE | $8.00 | $823.99
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $794.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
18.4x34 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $794.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
_';SJ;‘EAD' 6 PLY, FARM LUG TYPE |[DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $794.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE | $8.00 | $1,074.40
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

BIAS TIRES
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER

VENDOR [ BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT

HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $861.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

18.4x38 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $861.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
_';SJ;‘EAD' 6 PLY, FARM LUG TYPE |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $861.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE | $8.00 | $958.52

MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $5.50 $676.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

19.5x24 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $5.50 $676.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
FQ‘DT:;T/;%Z PLY, LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [GALAXY $5.50 $505.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE [STARMAXX | 3550 | $676.00

MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $5.50 $995.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

20.5x25 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE MRL $5.50 $995.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
L2 TREAD LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |GALAXY $5.50 $960.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE |MRL |  $550 | $995.00

MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

20.5x25 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

G2 TREAD LUGTYPE |[SOUTHERN TIREMART [FIRESTONE | $8.00 [ $1,366.12 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

20.8x34 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

_';SJ;‘EAD' 6 PLY, FARM LUGTYPE [SOUTHERN TIRE MART [FIRESTONE | $8.00 | $1,231.49 |[DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE |[FIRESTONE | 5.5| 1500
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

BIAS TIRES
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR [ BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY [DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $1,300.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
20.8x38 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $8.00 $1,300.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
_';SJ;‘EAD' 6 PLY, FARM LUG TYPE [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  |FIRESTONE $8.00 $1,281.33 [DOWLESS SERVICE I[STARMAXX |  $8.00 | $1,300.00
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
23.1x26 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
12 PLY, TURF TIRE LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  [PETLAS | $550 | $1,220.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART [FIRESTONE | $8.00 [ $1,531.14
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $130.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
25/1000x12 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $130.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
6 PLY, ATV LUG TYPE |DOWLESS SERVICE $2.90 $130.00 |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE |OTR |  $290 | $160.00
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
25x11x12 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
6 PLY, UTV LUG TYPE [DIRECT DISCOUNTTIRE  [CARLISLE | $2.90 | $210.00 MR, EEhuE CEINE
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
28x10x12 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
8 PLY, UTV LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE [DEESTONE | $2.90 | $140.00 ’ =
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

BIAS TIRES
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR | BRAND | WASTE FEE [ AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $2.90 $135.00
750x16 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $2.90 $135.00
6 PLY, TRIRIB LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |ATF $2.90 $105.00 |SOUTHERN TIRE MART  |REGENCY $8.00 $113.66
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY [DIRECT DISCOUNTTIRE |V-RUBBER |  $2.90 $295.00
900x20 ALL TERRAIN NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TUBE TYPE LUGTYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNTTIRE |V-RUBBER |  $2.90 $295.00 MRS (A0S0 12
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS STARMAXX $2.90 $218.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
1000x16 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS STARMAXX $2.90 $218.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
8 PLY, TRIRIB LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE |V RUBBER $2.90 $140.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  |REGENCY | $800 | $177.37
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $2.90 $226.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
1100x16 ALL TERRAIN [DOWLESS SERVICE STARMAXX $2.90 $226.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
8 PLY, TRIRIB LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE |SAMSON $2.90 $170.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE [STARMAXX | 35290 | $226.00
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE $5.50 $575.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
1400x24 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE $5.50 $575.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
g;;\:m 12PLY, LUG TYPE |DOWLESS SERVICE $5.50 $575.00 [SOUTHERN TIRE MART  [FIRESTONE | $8.00 [ $679.63
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
TIRES

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRES

BIAS TIRES
TIRE SIZE TIRE TYPE LOWEST BIDDER SECOND LOWEST BIDDER
VENDOR | BRAND [ WASTEFEE | AMOUNT VENDOR | BRAND | WASTEFEE | AMOUNT
HIGHWAY |DOWLESS SERVICE $5.50 $1,025.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
1400X24 ALL TERRAIN |DOWLESS SERVICE $5.50 $1,025.00 NO BID, PHONE QUOTE
G2 ECONOMY LUG TYPE |DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE  |westiake/apvance]  $5.50 $875.00 |DOWLESS SERVICE | |  $550 | $1,025.00
MUD & SNOW NO BID, PHONE QUOTE NO BID, PHONE QUOTE

TIRES
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRE SERVICE

T3 TIRE & WELDING

SERVICE CALLS

BASE CHARGE $65.00

AFTER HOURS $100.00

PER MILE $2.50

DELAY CHARGE/HOUR $50.00

RADIALS
TIRE SERVICE

TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
9Rx22.5 $45.00 NB NB $45.00
10Rx22.5 $45.00 NB NB $45.00
11Rx22.5 $45.00 NB NB $45.00
11Rx24.5 $45.00 NB NB $45.00
17.5Rx25 $45.00 NB NB $45.00
750Rx16 $15.00 NB NB $25.00
900Rx20 NB NB NB NB
1000Rx20 $45.00 NB NB $45.00
1400Rx24 *ONE $45.00 NB NB $45.00
ST205 75Rx15 $10.00 NB NB $25.00
215 60Rx16 $10.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
215 75Rx17.5 $30.00 NB NB $45.00
215 85Rx16 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
225 60VRx16 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
225 60VRx18 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
225 65Rx17 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
225 70Rx19.5 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
ST225 75Rx15 $10.00 NB NB $25.00
225 75Rx16 NB NB NB NB
LT225 75Rx17 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
235 50Rx18 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
235 55Rx17 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
235 70Rx16 NB NB NB NB
LT235 75Rx15 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
P235 75Rx15 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
235 75Rx17 NB NB NB NB
235 80Rx16 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
235 80Rx17 10 PLY $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
235 80Rx17 14 PLY NB NB NB NB
235 80Rx18 NB NB NB NB
235 85Rx16 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
245 55Rx18 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
245 60Rx18 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
245 70Rx17 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
245 75Rx16 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
245 75Rx17 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
255 70Rx22.5 $35.00 NB NB $45.00
265 60VRx17 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
P265 65Rx18 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
265 70Rx17 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
P265 70Rx17 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00
265 75Rx16 $15.00 NB $5.00 $25.00

TIRE SERVICE - T3 TIRE WELDING
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRE SERVICE

RADIALS
TIRE SERVICE
TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
275 65Rx18 NB NB NB NB
275 70Rx18 NB NB NB NB
280 85R24 NB NB NB NB
285 70Rx17 NB NB NB NB
285 75Rx16 NB NB NB NB
285 75Rx24.5 NB NB NB NB
295 75Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
315 80Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
340 85Rx24 NB NB NB NB
380 85Rx24 NB NB NB NB
460 85Rx34 NB NB NB NB
480 85Rx34 NB NB NB NB
BIAS
TIRE SERVICE
TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
11Lx15 NB NB NB NB
11LX16 NB NB NB NB
12.4x24 NB NB NB NB
12.5/80x18 NB NB NB NB
12x16 NB NB NB NB
12x16.5 NB NB NB NB
13.6x24 NB NB NB NB
13.6x28 NB NB NB NB
14x17.5 NB NB NB NB
16.9x34 NB NB NB NB
17.5x24 NB NB NB NB
17.5x25 G2 NB NB NB NB
17.5x25 ROCKLUG NB NB NB NB
18.4x30 NB NB NB NB
18.4x34 NB NB NB NB
18.4x38 NB NB NB NB
19.5x24 NB NB NB NB
20.5x25 L2 NB NB NB NB
20.5x25 G2 NB NB NB NB
20.8x34 NB NB NB NB
20.8x38 NB NB NB NB
23.1x26 NB NB NB NB
25/1000x12 NB NB NB NB
25x11x12 NB NB NB NB
28x10x12 NB NB NB NB
750x16 NB NB NB NB
900x20 NB NB NB NB
1000x16 NB NB NB NB
1100x16 NB NB NB NB
1400x24 G2 PREMIUM NB NB NB NB
1400x24 L2 PREMIUM NB NB NB NB

TIRE SERVICE - T3 TIRE WELDING
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRE SERVICE

OK TIRE & AUTO

SERVICE CALLS

BASE CHARGE $75.00

AFTER HOURS $150.00

PER MILE $4.00

DELAY CHARGE $100.00

RADIALS
TIRE SERVICE

TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
9Rx22.5 $45.00 $55.00 NB $45.00
10Rx22.5 $45.00 $55.00 NB $45.00
11Rx22.5 $45.00 $55.00 NB $45.00
11Rx24.5 $45.00 $55.00 NB $45.00
17.5Rx25 $95.00 $115.00 NB $95.00
750Rx16 $20.00 $30.00 NB $20.00
900Rx20 $45.00 $55.00 NB $45.00
1000Rx20 $45.00 $55.00 NB $45.00
1400Rx24 *ONE $95.00 $115.00 NB $95.00
ST205 75Rx15 $15.00 $25.00 NB $20.00
215 60Rx16 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
215 75Rx17.5 $30.00 $40.00 NB $30.00
215 85Rx16 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
225 60VRx16 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
225 60VRx18 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
225 65Rx17 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
225 70Rx19.5 $30.00 $40.00 $20.00 $30.00
ST225 75Rx15 $15.00 $25.00 NB $20.00
225 75Rx16 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
LT225 75Rx17 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
235 50Rx18 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
235 55Rx17 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
235 70Rx16 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
LT235 75Rx15 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
P235 75Rx15 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
235 75Rx17 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
235 80Rx16 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
235 80Rx17 10 PLY $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
235 80Rx17 14 PLY $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
235 80Rx18 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
235 85Rx16 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
245 55Rx18 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
245 60Rx18 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
245 70Rx17 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
245 75Rx16 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
245 75Rx17 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
255 70Rx22.5 $45.00 $55.00 $30.00 $45.00
265 60VRx17 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
P265 65Rx18 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
265 70Rx17 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
P265 70Rx17 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
265 75Rx16 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00

TIRE SERVICE - OK TIRE AUTO
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRE SERVICE

RADIALS
TIRE SERVICE
TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
275 65Rx18 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
275 70Rx18 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
280 85R24 $50.00 $60.00 NB $50.00
285 70Rx17 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
285 75Rx16 $20.00 $30.00 $20.00 $20.00
285 75Rx24.5 $45.00 $55.00 $30.00 $45.00
295 75Rx22.5 $45.00 $55.00 $30.00 $45.00
315 80Rx22.5 $60.00 $70.00 $30.00 $60.00
340 85Rx24 $50.00 $60.00 NB $50.00
380 85Rx24 $50.00 $60.00 NB $50.00
460 85Rx34 $60.00 $70.00 $60.00 NB
480 85Rx34 NB NB NB NB
BIAS
TIRE SERVICE
TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
11Lx15 $20.00 $30.00 NB $20.00
11LX16 $20.00 $30.00 NB $20.00
12.4x24 $50.00 $60.00 NB $50.00
12.5/80x18 $45.00 $55.00 NB $45.00
12x16 $40.00 $50.00 NB $40.00
12x16.5 $40.00 $50.00 NB $40.00
13.6x24 $50.00 $60.00 NB $50.00
13.6x28 $55.00 $65.00 NB $55.00
14x17.5 $50.00 $60.00 NB $50.00
16.9x34 $60.00 $70.00 NB $60.00
17.5x24 $95.00 $115.00 NB $95.00
17.5x25 G2 $95.00 $115.00 NB $95.00
17.5x25 ROCKLUG $95.00 $115.00 NB $95.00
18.4x30 $60.00 $70.00 NB $60.00
18.4x34 $60.00 $70.00 NB $60.00
18.4x38 $70.00 $80.00 NB $70.00
19.5x24 $50.00 $60.00 NB $50.00
20.5x25 L2 $95.00 $115.00 NB $95.00
20.5x25 G2 $95.00 $115.00 NB $95.00
20.8x34 $70.00 $80.00 NB $70.00
20.8x38 $80.00 $90.00 NB $80.00
23.1x26 $95.00 $115.00 NB $95.00
25/1000x12 $15.00 $20.00 NB $20.00
25x11x12 $15.00 $20.00 NB $20.00
28x10x12 $15.00 $20.00 NB $15.00
750x16 $20.00 $30.00 NB $20.00
900x20 $45.00 $55.00 NB $45.00
1000x16 $20.00 $30.00 NB $20.00
1100x16 $20.00 $30.00 NB $20.00
1400x24 G2 PREMIUM $95.00 $115.00 NB $95.00
1400x24 L2 PREMIUM $95.00 $115.00 NB $95.00

TIRE SERVICE - OK TIRE AUTO
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



T&W TIRE

SERVICE CALLS

BASE CHARGE $130.00

AFTER HOURS $275.00

PER MILE $2.50

DELAY CHARGE $100.00

RADIALS
TIRE SERVICE

TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
9Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
10Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
11Rx22.5 $50.00 NB $40.00 $55.00
11Rx24.5 $50.00 NB $40.00 $55.00
17.5Rx25 NB NB NB NB
750Rx16 NB NB NB NB
900Rx20 NB NB NB NB
1000Rx20 NB NB NB NB
1400Rx24 *ONE NB NB NB NB
ST205 75Rx15 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
215 60Rx16 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
215 75Rx17.5 $50.00 NB $40.00 $55.00
215 85Rx16 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
225 60VRx16 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
225 60VRx18 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
225 65Rx17 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
225 70Rx19.5 $50.00 NB $40.00 $55.00
ST225 75Rx15 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
225 75Rx16 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
LT225 75Rx17 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
235 50Rx18 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
235 55Rx17 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
235 70Rx16 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
LT235 75Rx15 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
P235 75Rx15 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
235 75Rx17 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
235 80Rx16 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
235 80Rx17 10 PLY $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
235 80Rx17 14 PLY $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
235 80Rx18 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
235 85Rx16 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
245 55Rx18 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
245 60Rx18 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
245 70Rx17 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
245 75Rx16 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
245 75Rx17 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
255 70Rx22.5 $50.00 NB $40.00 $55.00
265 60VRx17 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
P265 65Rx18 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
265 70Rx17 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
P265 70Rx17 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
265 75Rx16 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00

TIRE SERVICE - T W TIRE
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



RADIALS

TIRE SERVICE
TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
275 65Rx18 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
275 70Rx18 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
280 85R24 NB NB NB NB
285 70Rx17 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
285 75Rx16 $10.00 NB $20.00 $25.00
285 75Rx24.5 $50.00 NB $40.00 $55.00
295 75Rx22.5 $50.00 NB $40.00 $55.00
315 80Rx22.5 $50.00 NB $40.00 $55.00
340 85Rx24 NB NB NB NB
380 85Rx24 NB NB NB NB
460 85Rx34 NB NB NB NB
480 85Rx34 NB NB NB NB
BIAS
TIRE SERVICE
TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
11Lx15 NB NB NB NB
11LX16 NB NB NB NB
12.4x24 NB NB NB NB
12.5/80x18 NB NB NB NB
12x16 NB NB NB NB
12x16.5 NB NB NB NB
13.6x24 NB NB NB NB
13.6x28 NB NB NB NB
14x17.5 NB NB NB NB
16.9x34 NB NB NB NB
17.5x24 NB NB NB NB
17.5x25 G2 NB NB NB NB
17.5x25 ROCKLUG NB NB NB NB
18.4x30 NB NB NB NB
18.4x34 NB NB NB NB
18.4x38 NB NB NB NB
19.5x24 NB NB NB NB
20.5x25 L2 NB NB NB NB
20.5x25 G2 NB NB NB NB
20.8x34 NB NB NB NB
20.8x38 NB NB NB NB
23.1x26 NB NB NB NB
25/1000x12 NB NB NB NB
25x11x12 NB NB NB NB
28x10x12 NB NB NB NB
750x16 NB NB NB NB
900x20 NB NB NB NB
1000x16 NB NB NB NB
1100x16 NB NB NB NB
1400x24 G2 PREMIUM NB NB NB NB
1400x24 L2 PREMIUM NB NB NB NB

TIRE SERVICE - T W TIRE

1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026




TIRE SERVICE

DOWLESS

SERVICE CALLS

BASE CHARGE $65.00

AFTER HOURS $95.00

PER MILE $3.00

DELAY CHARGE/HOUR $110.00

RADIALS
TIRE SERVICE

TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
9Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
10Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
11Rx22.5 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
11Rx24.5 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
17.5Rx25 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
750Rx16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
900Rx20 NB $65.00 NB NB
1000Rx20 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
1400Rx24 *ONE NB NB NB NB
ST205 75Rx15 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
215 60Rx16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
215 75Rx17.5 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
215 85Rx16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
225 60VRx16 NB NB NB NB
225 60VRx18 NB NB NB NB
225 65Rx17 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
225 70Rx19.5 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
ST225 75Rx15 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
225 75Rx16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
LT225 75Rx17 NB NB NB NB
235 50Rx18 NB NB NB NB
235 55Rx17 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
235 70Rx16 NB NB NB NB
LT235 75Rx15 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
P235 75Rx15 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
235 75Rx17 NB NB NB NB
235 80Rx16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
235 80Rx17 10 PLY $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
235 80Rx17 14 PLY NB NB NB NB
235 80Rx18 NB NB NB NB
235 85Rx16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
245 55Rx18 NB NB NB NB
245 60Rx18 NB NB NB NB
245 70Rx17 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
245 75Rx16 NB NB NB NB
245 75Rx17 NB NB NB NB
255 70Rx22.5 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
265 60VRx17 NB NB NB NB
P265 65Rx18 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
265 70Rx17 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
P265 70Rx17 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
265 75Rx16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00

TIRE SERVICE - DOWLESS SERVICE
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRE SERVICE

RADIALS
TIRE SERVICE
TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
275 65Rx18 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
275 70Rx18 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
280 85R24 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
285 70Rx17 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
285 75Rx16 NB NB NB NB
285 75Rx24.5 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
295 75Rx22.5 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
315 80Rx22.5 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
340 85Rx24 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
380 85Rx24 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
460 85Rx34 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
480 85Rx34 NB NB NB NB
BIAS
TIRE SERVICE
TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
11Lx15 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
11LX16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
12.4x24 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
12.5/80x18 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
12x16 NB NB NB NB
12x16.5 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
13.6x24 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
13.6x28 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
14x17.5 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
16.9x34 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
17.5x24 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
17.5x25 G2 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
17.5x25 ROCKLUG NB NB NB NB
18.4x30 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
18.4x34 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
18.4x38 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
19.5x24 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
20.5x25 L2 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
20.5x25 G2 NB NB NB NB
20.8x34 NB NB NB NB
20.8x38 $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
23.1x26 NB NB NB NB
25/1000x12 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
25x11x12 NB NB NB NB
28x10x12 NB NB NB NB
750x16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
900x20 NB NB NB NB
1000x16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
1100x16 $25.00 $25.00 NB $25.00
1400x24 G2 PREMIUM $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00
1400x24 L2 PREMIUM $65.00 $65.00 NB $65.00

TIRE SERVICE - DOWLESS SERVICE
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRE SERVICE

SOUTHERN TIRE MART

SERVICE CALLS

BASE CHARGE $85.00

AFTER HOURS $135.00

PER MILE $1.00

DELAY CHARGE $75.00 REGULAR HRS. $135.00 AFTER HOURS

RADIALS
TIRE SERVICE

TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
9Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
10Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
11Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
11Rx24.5 NB NB NB NB
17.5Rx25 NB NB NB NB
750Rx16 NB NB NB NB
900Rx20 NB NB NB NB
1000Rx20 NB NB NB NB
1400Rx24 *ONE NB NB NB NB
ST205 75Rx15 NB NB NB NB
215 60Rx16 NB NB NB NB
215 75Rx17.5 NB NB NB NB
215 85Rx16 NB NB NB NB
225 60VRx16 NB NB NB NB
225 60VRx18 NB NB NB NB
225 65Rx17 NB NB NB NB
225 70Rx19.5 NB NB NB NB
ST225 75Rx15 NB NB NB NB
225 75Rx16 NB NB NB NB
LT225 75Rx17 NB NB NB NB
235 50Rx18 NB NB NB NB
235 55Rx17 NB NB NB NB
235 70Rx16 NB NB NB NB
LT235 75Rx15 NB NB NB NB
P235 75Rx15 NB NB NB NB
235 75Rx17 NB NB NB NB
235 80Rx16 NB NB NB NB
235 80Rx17 10 PLY NB NB NB NB
235 80Rx17 14 PLY NB NB NB NB
235 80Rx18 NB NB NB NB
235 85Rx16 NB NB NB NB
245 55Rx18 NB NB NB NB
245 60Rx18 NB NB NB NB
245 70Rx17 NB NB NB NB
245 75Rx16 NB NB NB NB
245 75Rx17 NB NB NB NB
255 70Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
265 60VRx17 NB NB NB NB
P265 65Rx18 NB NB NB NB
265 70Rx17 NB NB NB NB
P265 70Rx17 NB NB NB NB
265 75Rx16 NB NB NB NB

TIRE SERVICE - SOUTHERN TIRE MART
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026



TIRE SERVICE

RADIALS
TIRE SERVICE
TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
275 65Rx18 NB NB NB NB
275 70Rx18 NB NB NB NB
280 85R24 NB NB NB NB
285 70Rx17 NB NB NB NB
285 75Rx16 NB NB NB NB
285 75Rx24.5 NB NB NB NB
295 75Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
315 80Rx22.5 NB NB NB NB
340 85Rx24 NB NB NB NB
380 85Rx24 NB NB NB NB
460 85Rx34 NB NB NB NB
480 85Rx34 NB NB NB NB
BIAS
TIRE SERVICE
TIRE SIZE MOUNT CHANGE BALANCE FLAT REPAIR
11Lx15 NB NB NB NB
11LX16 NB NB NB NB
12.4x24 NB NB NB NB
12.5/80x18 NB NB NB NB
12x16 NB NB NB NB
12x16.5 NB NB NB NB
13.6x24 NB NB NB NB
13.6x28 NB NB NB NB
14x17.5 NB NB NB NB
16.9x34 NB NB NB NB
17.5x24 NB NB NB NB
17.5x25 G2 NB NB NB NB
17.5x25 ROCKLUG NB NB NB NB
18.4x30 NB NB NB NB
18.4x34 NB NB NB NB
18.4x38 NB NB NB NB
19.5x24 NB NB NB NB
20.5x25 L2 NB NB NB NB
20.5x25 G2 NB NB NB NB
20.8x34 NB NB NB NB
20.8x38 NB NB NB NB
23.1x26 NB NB NB NB
25/1000x12 NB NB NB NB
25x11x12 NB NB NB NB
28x10x12 NB NB NB NB
750x16 NB NB NB NB
900x20 NB NB NB NB
1000x16 NB NB NB NB
1100x16 NB NB NB NB
1400x24 G2 PREMIUM NB NB NB NB
1400x24 L2 PREMIUM NB NB NB NB

TIRE SERVICE - SOUTHERN TIRE MART
1/1/2026 - 6/30/2026
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