PITTSBURG COUNTY
SIXMONTH BIDS

Crushed Stone
Asphalt Sand
Road Qils
Asphalt
Concrete
Grader Blades
Spiral Pipe
Arch Pipe
Plastic Pipe
Used Steel Pipe
New & Used Steel
Petroleum Products
Tires & Service
Hauling
Equipment Rentals
Copy Paper
Structural Gear (aka Bunker Gear)
Fire Hose
Wildland Gear

January 1, 2020
Through

June 30, 2020

Only awarded bidders are listed. If they cannot fulfill their obligation, please
contact the Commissioners Office or the Purchasing Office
for the next lowest bidder or in some circumstances a phone quote.



CRUSHED STONE

District #1
South of Crowder-Blocker Road - Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)
North of Crowder-Blocker Road - Stigler Stone
All Chips awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)
District #2
All Materials awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)
District #3
All Materials awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)

All Chips awarded to Dolese (F.O.B. - Hartshorne)

1" 467 $ 11.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 11.45 |DOLESE

11/2" #57 $ 10.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 10.60 |DOLESE

11/2" ODOT BASE TYPE A $ 9.50 [STIGLER STONE
$ 10.40 |DOLESE

11/2" ODOT BASE TYPE B $ 9.50 [STIGLER STONE

Crushed Stone 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



CRUSHED STONE

I' CRUSHER RUN $ 8.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 9.25 |DOLESE

11/2° CRUSHER RUN $ 8.00 [STIGLER STONE
$ 8.80 |DOLESE

512 CRUSHER RUN $ 8.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 8.80 |DOLESE

8" GABION STONE

SHOT DOWN ROCK

6" to 8" RIP RAP

3' SURGE $ 9.50 [STIGLER STONE
$ 10.95 [DOLESE

8" SURGE $ 10.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 10.60 |DOLESE

12" SELECT RIP RAP $ 18.00 [STIGLER STONE
$ 20.25 |DOLESE

18" SELECT RIP RAP $ 16.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 20.25 |DOLESE

Crushed Stone

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




CRUSHED STONE

24" SELECT RIP RAP

30" SELECT RIP RAP

$ 16.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 20.25 |DOLESE
$ 16.00 |STIGLER STONE
$ 20.25 |DOLESE

QUARRY RUN RIP RAP $ 9.00 [STIGLER STONE
NON SPEC MIXED STONE NOT AWARDED

Decomposed Screened Granite

QOilfield Rock (aka1to11/2" Decomposed
Screened Granite)

Crushed Stone

$ 3.35 INTNSM, LLC

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



ASPHALT SAND

Asphalt Sand $ 8.00 [MUSKOGEE SAND

STATE CONTRACT SW670

Asphalt Sand 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



ROAD OILS

5159 [ERGON
CRS 2 (FOB) S
MC-30 $ 2.28 |ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY

MC-3000
AC-20 ASPHALT BINDER (TON)

$ 70.00 ERGON
PUMP CHARGE $ 75.00 ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
$ 75.00 COASTAL ENERGY

$ 70.00 ERGON
DEMURRAGE $ 75.00 ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
$ 75.00 COASTAL ENERGY

N/A ERGON
N/A ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
$ 42500 COASTAL ENERGY

MINIMUM LOAD FEE
(CHARGE FOR LOADS UNDER 5,500 GAL.)

PLEASE NOTE:
THE LOWEST BIDDER MUST BE USED UNLESS UNAVAILABLE

STATEWIDE CONTRACT #SW690 MAY ALSO BE USED

Road Oils 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



ASPHALT

PRICE PER TON

HOT MIX/HOT LAY, TYPE B $ 62.00 |APAC CENTRAL/ARKHOLA
HOT MIX/HOT LAY, TYPE C $ 64.00 [APAC CENTRAIL/ARKHOLA

HOT MIX/HOT LAY S-4 $ 54.80 |CUMMINS CONSTRUCTION

HOT MIX/HOT LAY S-5 $ 59.00 [JOB CONSTRUCTION

HOT MIX/COLD LAY (AT‘PLANT) $ 85.00 TULSA ASPHALT, LLC
(Delivered) $ 112.00

HM/CL (50 LB. BAG)MIN. 50 BAGS $ 10.50 |[LOGAN COUNTY ASPHALT

STATE CONTRACT SWO081

Asphalt 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



CONCRETE

3000 PSI

TYPE A $ 121.00 | DOLESE
3500 PSI

TYPE A $ 116.00 [DOLESE
4000 PSI

TYPE A $ 119.00 | DOLESE

If Dolese will not delivered you must get a phone quote through Purchasing.

Concrete

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



GRADER BLADES

5/8" BOLT HOLE
5/8'X6"XT7 $ 53.41 |NOBLES EQUIP.
5/8" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 75.04 [NOBLES EQUIP.
3/4" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 87.01 |NOBLES EQUIP.
3/4" X 8" X 7' (NON CARBON) $ 95.00 |DUB ROSS

3/4" BOLT HOLE
5/8'X6"XT7 $ 53.41 |NOBLES EQUIP.
5/8" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 75.04 [NOBLES EQUIP.
3/4" X 8" X 7' (HIGH CARBON) $ 87.01 [NOBLES EQUIP.
3/4" X 8" X 7' (NON CARBON) $ 95.00 |DUB ROSS

STATE CONTRACT SW501

GRADER BLADES

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



SPIRAL PIPE

16 GA. 2.66" (PRICE PER FOOT)

12 $ 7.68 |KC FARM MACHINERY
15 $ 0.54 |KC FARM MACHINERY
18" $ 11.45 |KC FARM MACHINERY
21 $ 13.12 [KC FARM MACHINERY
24" $ 14.94 |KC FARM MACHINERY
30" $ 18.75 |KC FARM MACHINERY
36" $ 22.24 |KC FARM MACHINERY
42" $ 25.96 |KC FARM MACHINERY
48’ $ 30.40 [KC FARM MACHINERY

16 GA. 3.1"
36" $ 26.21 |KC FARM MACHINERY
42" $ 32.62 |KC FARM MACHINERY
48" $ 37.12 |KC FARM MACHINERY
54" $ 39.95 [KC FARM MACHINERY
60" $ 43.17 |KC FARM MACHINERY
66" $ 46.21 |KC FARM MACHINERY
72" $ 50.71 |KC FARM MACHINERY
78" $ 60.84 |WILSON CULVERTS
84" $ 59.71 |KC FARM MACHINERY
90" $ 63.84 |KC FARM MACHINERY

14 GA. 2.6"
12" $ 0.60 |WILSON CULVERTS
15 $ 11.58 |KC FARM MACHINERY
18" $ 13.76 |KC FARM MACHINERY
21" $ 16.00 |KC FARM MACHINERY
24" $ 18.56 |KC FARM MACHINERY
30" $ 23.32 |KC FARM MACHINERY
36" $ 27.86 |KC FARM MACHINERY
42" $ 32.48 |KC FARM MACHINERY
48" $ 36.71 [KC FARM MACHINERY
54" $ 40.92 |KC FARM MACHINERY
60" $ 45.47 |KC FARM MACHINERY

14 GA.3.1"
42" NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
48" $ 41.48 |KC FARM MACHINERY
54" $ 47.87 |KC FARM MACHINERY
60" $ 56.06 [WILSON CULVERTS
66" $ 60.87 |KC FARM MACHINERY
72 $ 64.00 |KC FARM MACHINERY
78’ $ 72.54 |WILSON CULVERTS
84" $ 74.33 |KC FARM MACHINERY
90" $ 79.57 |KC FARM MACHINERY
96" $ 85.18 |KC FARM MACHINERY
102" $ 89.71 |KC FARM MACHINERY
108’ $ 100.10 |WILSON CULVERTS
114" $ 106.02 [WILSON CULVERTS

STATE CONTRACT SW0094

Spiral Pipe 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



ARCH PIPE

16 GA. 2.6" (PRICE PER FOOT)

15 $ 10.15 |KC FARM MACHINERY
18" $ 12.05 |KC FARM MACHINERY
21" $ 12.29 [KC FARM MACHINERY
24" $ 16.22 |KC FARM MACHINERY
30" $ 20.37 |KC FARM MACHINERY
36" $ 2418 |KC FARM MACHINERY
42" $ 28.16 |KC FARM MACHINERY

14 GA.2.6"
15 $ 11.58 |KC FARM MACHINERY
18" $ 13.76 |KC FARM MACHINERY
21" $ 16.00 |KC FARM MACHINERY
24" $ 18.56 |KC FARM MACHINERY
30" $ 23.32 |KC FARM MACHINERY
36" $ 27.86 |KC FARM MACHINERY
42" $ 32.48 |KC FARM MACHINERY
48" $ 36.71 |KC FARM MACHINERY

12 GA. 3/1"
84" NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)

14 GA. 3.1"
42" NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
48" $ 47.00 [WILSON CULVERTS
54" $ 53.02 |WILSON CULVERTS
60" $ 57.56 |WILSON CULVERTS
66" $ 63.36 |WILSON CULVERTS
72 $ 69.28 |WILSON CULVERTS
78" $ 74.88 [WILSON CULVERTS

Arch Pipe 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



PLASTIC PIPE

BLACK
12 $ 5.02 |FENSCO
15 $ 7.03 |FENSCO
18" $ 9.48 [FENSCO
21" NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
24" $ 15.79 |FENSCO
30" $ 23.23 [FENSCO
36" $ 30.89 [FENSCO
42" $ 38.13 |FENSCO
48’ $ 49.19 |FENSCO
60" $ 76.29 |FENSCO
GREY
12" $ 5.89 |FENSCO
15" $ 8.89 |FENSCO
18" $ 11.11 [FENSCO
21" $ 16.98 |FENSCO
24" $ 18.03 |EENSCO
30" $ 28.97 |FENSCO
36" $ 33.78 [FENSCO
42’ $ 40.62 |FENSCO
48" $ 54.47 |FENSCO
60" $ 79.79 |FENSCO
STATE CONTRACT SW0094

Plastic Pipe

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER USED STEEL PIPE

LOWEST BIDDER
12 $ 10.50 | SUNBELT EQUIP.

5 80.84 | ALFORD METALS
o |5 96.52 | ALFORD METALS
5 11591 | ALFORD METALS

235.00 | SUNBELT EQUIP.
235.00 RAILROAD YARD

o |$ 23500 ] RAILROADYARD |

If unavailable, drop to the next lowest bidder

Used Steel Pipe 7/1/2019 - 12/31/2019



NEXT LOWEST BIDDER USED STEEL PIPE

NEXT LOWEST BIDDER
12 $ 10.90 | RAILROAD YARD

0 1§ 16900 SUNBELTEQUIP. |
s | NONEXTLOWESTBIDDER |
o T NOBID(PHONEQUOTE) |

If unavailable, must be phone quoted

Used Steel Pipe 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



NEW AND USED STEEL

STEEL BEAMS
NEW $ 0.5140 |SUNBELT EQUIP.
USED $ 0.3150 |RAILROAD YARD
HI-PILE
NEW $ 0.5190 |RAILROAD YARD
USED $ 0.35 [RAILROAD YARD
HEAVY WALL PIPE PILING
6" - NEW $ 9.75 [SUNBELT EQUIP.
6" - USED $ 9.50 | SUNBELT EQUIP.
7" - USED NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
8" - NEW $ 13.50 | SUNBELT EQUIP.
8" - USED $ 10.50 | SUNBELT EQUIP.
9" - NEW $ 16.95 |RAILROAD YARD
9" - USED $ 15.90 [SUNBELT EQUIP.
DECKING
24 GAUGE NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
22 GAUGE (NEW) $ 1.36 [RAILROAD YARD
STRUCTURAL STEEL (NEW) $ 05090 [SUNBELT EQUIP.
(USED) $ 03500 [RAILROAD YARD
SECONDARY STRUCTURAL STEEL (NEW) $ 0.4890 |SUNBELT EQUIP.
PLATE (NEW) $ 0.4690 [SUNBELT EQUIP.
(USED) $ 0.35 |[RAILROAD YARD
$ 0.35 |SUNBELT EQUIP.
GRADE 60 REBAR
1/2" (NEW) $ 0.2800 [SUNBELT EQUIP.
5/8" (NEW) $ 0.4600 [SUNBELT EQUIP.
GUARD RAIL
NEW $ 6.95 | RAILROAD YARD
$ 6.95 | SUNBELT EQUIP.
USED $ 2.83 | FENSCO
USED TANK CARS
1/2 TANK CAR (PER FT.) $ 245.00 | RAILROAD YARD
FULL TANK CAR (PER FT.) $  235.00 | RAILROAD YARD
$  235.00 [SUNBELT EQUIP.

New Used Steel

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




PETROLEUM PRODUCTS

ENGINE OIL, DIESEL OIL
HD-11, SAE 30 SF/CC, CD

1 GALLON CAN $ 116599 [HOOTEN OIL
1 QT/12 CASE $ 35.17 |HOOTEN OIL
55 GALLON DRUM $ 607.17 |HOOTEN OIL

J.D. PLUS 50 SUPREME
5 GALLON CONTAINER $ 78.51 | YELLOWHOUSE

DELO 400 (MULTI-GRADE)
SAE 40 - 1 GALLON CAN $ 12.95 [OK TIRE & AUTO

SAE 30 - 1 GALLON CAN $ 12.95 |OK TIRE & AUTO
15W40 1 GALLON CAN $ 12.95 |[OK TIRE & AUTO
SAE 40 BULK/GALLON $ 12.85 | OKTIRE & AUTO
SAE 30 BULK/GALLON $ 12.85 | OKTIRE & AUTO
DELO 400
15W40 BULK/GALLON $ 12.85 |[OK TIRE & AUTO
OIL EQUIVALENT TO PENZOIL

SAE 30/ GALLON $ 42.95 |[OKTIRE & AUTO
SAE30/1QT./12 CASE $ 34.98 | HOOTEN OIL

ENGINE OIL - GASOLINE ENGINE (MULTI-GRADE)
SAE 30 1QT/12 CASE $ 33.50 [OK TIRE & AUTO
55 GAL. DRUM SE, SF/CC $ 35239 |OK TIRE & AUTO
15W40 1QT/12 CASE $ 35.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
I5W40 - 1 GALLON CAN $ 12.95 |[OK TIRE & AUTO
$
5

5W20 - 1QT./12 CASE 35.17 |HOOTEN OIL
5W30 - 1QT./12 CASE 35.17 |HOOTEN OIL

QUAKER STATE
10W30 - 1QT./12 CASE $ 41.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
5W30-1QT./12 CASE $ 41.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO

SYNTHETIC BLEND - GASOLINE

S5W20 -1QT./12 CASE $ 32.50 |OK TIRE & AUTO

SW30-1QT./12 CASE $ 3250 |OKTIRE & AUTO
DEXOS FULL SYNTHETIC

1 QT./12 CASE $ 48.50 |[OK TIRE & AUTO

MOTORCRAFT FULL SYNTHETIC

1 QT./12 CASE $ 84.00 [OK TIRE & AUTO
CLEANING SOLVENT
55 GALLON DRUM NON-STAIN $ 316.25 [HOOTEN OIL

Petroleum Products 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



PETROLEUM PRODUCTS

LIFT OIL (TRUCK & EQUIPMENT)
55 GALLON DRUM SERIES 3 SAE-10WT. $ 675.00 [OKTIRE & AUTO

HYDRAULIC OILS ANTI-WEAR TYPER & O
TRANS-DIFF HYD

5 GALLON CAN $ 29.95 |OKTIRE & AUTO
55 GALLON DRUM $ 345.00 [OKTIRE & AUTO
BULK/GALLON $ 6.2500 [OKTIRE & AUTO

HYDRAULIC OIL TRANSMISSION (303)

5 GALLON CAN $ 29.95 |OK TIRE & AUTO
SUPER HYDRO 32
55 GALLON DRUM $ 35050 [OKTIRE & AUTO

JOHN DEERE HY-GUARD
5 GALLON CONTAINER $ 48.65 | HOOTEN OIL

T04 SPEC OIL (CAT HYDRAULIC)
TRANSMISSION OIL - 30 WT.

1 GALLON CAN NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
5 GALLON CONTAINER $ 52.60 [HOOTEN OIL
55 GALLON DRUM $ 519.08 |OK TIRE & AUTO

DRIVE TRAIN OIL - 50 WT.

1 GALLON CAN NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
5 GALLON CONTAINER $ 68.95 | OKTIRE & AUTO
55 GALLON DRUM $ 519.08 | OK TIRE & AUTO
... |
CAT HYDRAULIC OIL
10 WT.
1 GALLON CAN NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
5 GALLON CONTAINER $ 52.67 {HOOTEN OIL
55 GALLON DRUM $ 469.58 |[OKTIRE & AUTO

CG-4 ENGINE OIL

15W40
1 GALLON CAN $ 11.7865 [HOOTEN OIL
5 GALLON CONTAINER $ 52.41 |HOOTEN OIL
55 GALLON DRUM $ 576.59 [HOOTEN OIL

AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID, TYPE F
DRIVE TRAIN OIL
30 WT. -5 GALLON CONTAINER $ 52.60 |HOOTEN OIL
30 WT. - 55 GALLON DRUM $ 506.51 |OK TIRE & AUTO

Petroleum Products 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

If tire is unavailable, drop to the next bidder.

LOWEST BIDDER
ST205/75Rx15 HY Special Trailer
Tire $43.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00{T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

ST225/75Rx15 HY Special Trailer

Tire $52.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

215/60Rx16 H/T Special Trailer

Tire $49.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

215/85Rx16 A/T RADIALLT

Tire $83.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

225/75Rx16 A/P RADIALLT

Tire $72.01
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

225/60VRx16 A/S POLICE PURSUIT

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $73.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00{T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

225/60VRx18 A/S POLICE PURSUIT

Tire $114.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $15.00

265/60VRx17 A/S POLICE PURSUIT

Tire $119.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

LT225/75Rx17 A/T LT STEEL RADIAL

Tire $112.18

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00(JET TIRE SERVICE

Wheel Balancing $10.00

Flat Repair $15.00

Tire $112.18

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change N/B|BEALE TIRE

Wheel Balancing $15.00

Flat Repair $15.00

.
235/50Rx18 A/S POLICE PURSUIT

Tire $84.00

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE

Wheel Balancing $10.00

Flat Repair $10.00

P235/75Rx15 A/S STEEL RADIAL

T &BTIRE

Tire $59.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

1 T235/75Rx15 HY LT Steel Radial

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $80.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

T & BTIRE

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

1 T235/75Rx15 M&S LT STEEL RADIAL

Tire $84 .30
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $15.00

235/70Rx16 HY STEEL RADIAL
Tire $75.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Change $10.00|T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/70Rx16 A/T STEEL RADIAL

Tire $75.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/80Rx16 A/P SPECIAL TRAILER

T & BTIRE

Tire $65.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/85Rx16 H/T RADIALLT

Tire $90.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

T & BTIRE

235/85Rx16 A/T RADIAL LT

Tire $99.00
Tire Mount $10.00

$10.00
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

T & BTIRE

235/85Rx16 M&S HD CUT & CHIP

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $111.80
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

OK TIRE & AUTO

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

235/85Rx16 LUG - MAX TRACTION RDL

Tire $115.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

T & BTIRE

235/55Rx17 HY STEEL RADIAL

Tire $67.00
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

OK TIRE & AUTO

235/75R17 AT Radial
Tire $105.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel B $10.00
$10.00

235/80Rx17 HY Radial (10-E PLY)

Tire $102.00|T & BTIRE
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change ' $10.00 T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/80Rx17 HY Radial (14-G PLY)

Tire $137.00 DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change . NB BEALE TIRE

Wheel Balancing $15.00

Flat Repair $15.00

Tire Mount $12.00

Tire Change . $12.00 OK TIRE & AUTO

Wheel Balancing $8.00

Flat Repair $10.00

245/75Rx16 H/T Radial LT

Tire $88.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

245/75Rx16 A/T Radial Lt

Tire $90.53
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/75Rx16 LUG Max Traction Radial

Tire $100.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $112.00

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00

Flat Repair $10.00
I

245/75Rx17 H/T Radial LT

Tire $94.00

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00{T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00

Flat Repair $10.00

245/75Rx17 A/T Radial LT

Tire $99.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/75Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $125.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/55Rx18 HY Steel Radial

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $112.79
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $12.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

265/75Rx16 H/T Radial LT

Tire $95.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/75Rx16 A/T Radial LT

Tire $99.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/75Rx16 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $115.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/70Rx17 A/T Radial "P" Metric
Tire $91.73
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $15.00

265/70Rx17 A/T Radial LT

Tire $99.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $120.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/65Rx18 A/P Radial "P" Metric

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $92.50
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $12.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

275/65Rx18 A/P Radial
Tire $124.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

275/70Rx18 H/T Radial LT

Tire $118.59
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $12.00

285/75Rx16 H/T RADIAL
Tire $117.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

285/70Rx16 LUG - MAX TRACTION RDL

Tire $123.00

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00

Flat Repair $10.00
.

245/70R17 A/T Radial

Tire $110.00

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00

Flat Repair $10.00

285/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $134.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

215/75Rx17.5 HY LPT Radial TBL

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $133.93
Tire Mount $15.00
Tire Change $15.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $15.00
Flat Repair $20.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

225/70Rx19.5 HY Radial
Tire $160.00
Tire Mount $30.00
Tire Change $30.00|T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing N/A
Flat Repair $20.00
Tire $160.00
Tire Mount $25.00
Tire Change $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $20.00
Flat Repair $25.00
...
225/70Rx19.5 M/S Radial
Tire $170.00
Tire Mount $20.00
Tire Change $20.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $20.00
Flat Repair $20.00
Tire $170.00
Tire Mount $25.00
Tire Change $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $20.00
Flat Repair $25.00

255/70Rx22.5 HY LPT Radial TBL

Tire $195.78
T?re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00

285/75Rx24.5 HY Radial

Tire $220.00
T}re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

285/75Rx24.5 LUG Radial
Tire $229.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
) $25.00|BEALE TIRE
Hire Mount $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00{OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $17.95|JET TIRE SERVICE
FLAT REPAIR $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

295/75Rx22.5 LUG Radial Tubeless

Tire $228.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $25.00|BEALE TIRE

Tire Mount $25.00

Tire Change $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $25.00

315/80Rx22.5 HY Steering Radial

Tire $288.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE

Tire Mount $35.00

Tire Change $35.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $35.00

Tire Mount $25.00

Tire Change N/B|BEALE TIRE

Flat Repair $30.00

.
315/80Rx22.5 M/S RADIAL

Tire $335.00

T%re Mount $35.00 OK TIRE & AUTO

Tire Change $35.00

Flat Repair $35.00

25/1000x12 A/T ATV

Tire $60.00
T?re Mount $10.00 T & BTIRE
Tire Change $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

25x11x12 A/T UTV

Tire $69.00
T?re Mount $12.00 T & BTIRE
Tire Change $12.00
Flat Repair $12.00

28x10x12 A/TUTV

Tire $97.00
T}re Mount $10.00 T & BTIRE
Tire Change $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

ORx22.5 HY Radial Tubeless

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $185.00(DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $30.00

Tire Change $30.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $30.00

Tire Mount $30.00

Tire Change $30.00{JET TIRE SERVICE

Flat Repair $30.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




LOWEST BIDDER TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

10R22.5 HY Radial
Tire $240.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $25.00
Tire Change $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair $25.00
JEE
10Rx22.5 LUG Radial
Tire $334.00
T?re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00

111.x15 F-3 Industrial TBL

Tire $120.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE

Flat Repair $10.00

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $10.00

111.x16 F-3 Industrial TBL

Tire $121.00(DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $10.00

.
11Rx22.5 LUG Drive LUG

Tire $237.00[{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE

Tire Mount $25.00|BEALE TIRE

Tire Mount $25.00

Tire Change $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $25.00

11Rx22.5 Radial - HY

Tire $220.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $25.00|BEALE TIRE

Tire Mount $25.00

Tire Change $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $25.00

11Rx22.5 HY Premium Steering

Tire $252.70
T?re Mount $30.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $30.00
Flat Repair $30.00

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

11Rx22.5 M&S Max Traction RDL

Tire $289.84

Lire Mount 53000} £ TR E SERVICE

Tire Change $30.00

Flat Repair $30.00

1
11Rx24.5 LUG Drive LUG

Tire $256.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE

Tire Mount $25.00|BEALE TIRE

Tire Mount $25.00

Tire Change $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $25.00

11Rx24.5 M&S Max Traction RDL

Tire $293.99
T}re Mount $30.00 JET TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $30.00
Flat Repair $30.00

11Rx24.5 HY Premium Steering

Tire $270.42

T}re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO

Tire Change $25.00

Flat Repair $25.00

I
12x16 Skid Steer

Tire $115.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE

Tire Mount $15.00

Tire Change $15.00|T & B TIRE

Flat Repair $15.00

Tire Mount $15.00

Tire Change $15.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $15.00

12x16.5 NHS Front Backhoe

Tire $115.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $15.00
Tire Change $15.00|T & B TIRE
Flat Repair $15.00
$15.00
$15.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
$15.00

12.4 X 24 Tubeless Radial R-1

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $229.40
T?re Mount $45.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $45.00
Flat Repair $45.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

12.5/80X18 R-4 Backhoe

Tire $180.18| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $25.00

Tire Change N/B|BEALE TIRE

Flat Repair $30.00

Tire Mount $25.00

Tire Change $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $25.00

13.6x28 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $250.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $35.00{OK TIRE & AUTO

Tire Change $35.00

Flat Repair $35.00

14x17.5 NHS SupTrac Duplex

Tire $213.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $25.00

Tire Change N/B|BEALE TIRE

Flat Repair $30.00

16.9x34 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $407.78|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $40.00

Tire Change $40.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $40.00

17.51.24 R-4 Ind. LUG Tubeless

Tire $317.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $45.00

Tire Change $45.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $45.00

340/85Rx24 RI1 Front Tractor

Tire $380.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $45.00

Tire Change $45.00/OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $45.00

17.5x25 G-2 Grader Loader TBL

Tire $460.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $75.00

Tire Change $75.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $75.00

17.5x25 RL Loader Rocklug TBL

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

Tire $460.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $80.00

Tire Change $80.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $80.00

17.5Rx25 LUG Radial TBL LUG

Tire $740.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $85.00
Tire Change $85.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair $85.00
20.5x25 1.2 Radial
Tire $685.72
Tire Mount $90.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $90.00
Flat Repair $90.00

18.4x30 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $440.00( DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $35.00

Tire Change $35.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $35.00

18.4x34 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $480.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $40.00

Tire Change $40.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $40.00

460/85Rx34 R-1 Rear Tractor

Tire $793.55
Tire Mount $45.00
Tire Change $45.00
Flat Repair $45.00

OK TIRE & AUTO

18.4x38 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $505.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $45.00

Tire Change $45.00/OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $45.00

19.5x24 R-4 Backhoe IND LUG TBL

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

Tire $385.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $50.00

Tire Change $50.00{JET TIRE SERVICE

Flat Repair $50.00

Tire Mount $50.00

Tire Change $50.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $50.00

20.8x34 R-1 Tractor

Tire $770.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $75.00

Tire Change $75.00(JET TIRE SERVICE

Flat Repair $75.00

Tire Mount $75.00

Tire Change $75.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $75.00

20.8x38 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $745.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $65.00

Tire Change $65.00(JET TIRE SERVICE

Flat Repair $65.00

23.1x26 HF-1 Turf Tire

Tire $750.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $100.00

Tire Change $100.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $100.00

750x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless

Tire $79.00
T?re Mount $10.00 T & B TIRE
Tire Change $10.00

$10.00

750Rx16 HY Trailer

Tire $85.00
T?re Mount $10.00 T & B TIRE
Tire Change $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

900x20 HW Tube Type
Tire $175.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $25.00
Tire Change $25.00{OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair $25.00

900x20 LUG Tube Type

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

Tire $225.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE

Tire Mount $25.00

Tire Change $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $25.00

.

900Rx20 HY Radial

Tire $277.97

T}re Mount $30.00 OK TIRE & AUTO

Tire Change $30.00

Flat Repair $30.00

I
900Rx20 M&S Radial

Tire $305.00(DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE

Tire Mount $30.00

Tire Change $30.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $30.00

O900Rx20 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $305.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $30.00

Tire Change $30.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $30.00

1000x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless

Tire $115.00
T?re Mount $10.00 T & B TIRE
Tire Change $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

1100x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless

Tire $140.00
T?re Mount $15.00 T & B TIRE
Tire Change $15.00
Flat Repair $15.00

1000Rx20 HY Radial Tube Type

Tire $320.00
T?re Mount $30.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $30.00
Flat Repair $30.00

1000Rx20 M&S Radial Tube Type

Tire $335.00| DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $30.00

Tire Change $30.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $30.00

1400x24 G-2 TBL Premium 181 lbs.
Tire $335.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

Tire Mount $45.00
Tire Change $45.00/OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair $45.00

1400x24 G-2 TBL Economy 137 Ibs.

Tire $335.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $45.00

Tire Change $45.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $45.00

1400x24 G-2/1.-2 Radial Tubeless

Tire $690.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $45.00
Tire Change $45.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair $45.00
RECAPPED WITH CORE
11Rx22.5 $165.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
11Rx24.5 $167.00|BEALE TIRE
1400x24 (RADIAL)CG-3 $775.00|BEALE TIRE

State Contract SW024

SERVICE CALLS

$ 40.00 |JET TIRE SERVICE

$ 40.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO

$ 90.00 |[BEALE TIRE

$ 100.00 |BEALE TIRE (GRADER/LOADER)
2 HR MIN.

BASE CHARGE

$ 75.00 |JET TIRE SERVICE
AFTER HOURS $ 75.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO
$ 100.00 [BEALE TIRE

$ 2.00 |JET TIRE SERVICE
PER MILE $ 2.00 |OKTIRE & AUTO
$ 2.00 |BEALE TIRE

$ 65.00 [JET TIRE SERVICE
DELAY CHARGE PER HOUR $ 60.00 |OK TIRE & AUTO

$ 75.00 |BEALE TIRE

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

If tire is unavailable, drop to the next bidder.

NEXT LOWEST BIDDER
ST205/75Rx15 HY Special Trailer
Tire $51.75
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

ST225/75Rx15 HY Special Trailer

Tire $61.90
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

215/60Rx16 H/T Special Trailer

Tire $50.93
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

215/85Rx16 A/T RADIALLT

Tire $84 .36
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

225/75Rx16 A/P RADIALLT

Tire $73.99
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $15.00

225/60VRx16 A/S POLICE PURSUIT

Tire $75.35
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $15.00

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

225/60VRx18 A/S POLICE PURSUIT

Tire $115.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/60VRx17 A/S POLICE PURSUIT

Tire $120.18
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $15.00

LT225/75Rx17 A/T LT STEEL RADIAL

Tire $140.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/50Rx18 A/S POLICE PURSUIT

Tire $95.81
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00(JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $15.00

P235/75Rx15 A/S STEEL RADIAL

Tire $62.21
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change N/B|BEALE TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $15.00

[ T235/75Rx15 HY LT Steel Radial

Tire $95.91
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|JET TIRE SERVICE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $15.00

L T235/75Rx15 M&S LT STEEL RADIAL

T & BTIRE

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $85.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

235/70Rx16 HY STEEL RADIAL

Tire $77.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT
Tire Mount $8.00

Change , $8.00) 3 TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00

Flat Repair $10.00

235/70Rx16 A/T STEEL RADIAL

Tire $75.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $8.00

Change : 58.00) 5 TIRE & AUTO

Wheel Balancing $8.00

Flat Repair $10.00

235/80Rx16 A/P SPECIAL TRAILER

Tire $74.65
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/85Rx16 H/T RADIAL LT

Tire $99.99
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/85Rx16 A/T RADIALLT

Tire $99.24
Tire Mount $8.00
$8.00/OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/85Rx16 M&S HD CUT & CHIP

Tire $115.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

T &BTIRE

235/85Rx16 LUG - MAX TRACTION RDL

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $121.43
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

OK TIRE & AUTO

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




LOWEST BIDDER TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

235/55Rx17 HY STEEL RADIAL

Tire $67.95
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/75R17 AT Radial
Tire $135.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change ‘ $10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/80Rx17 HY Radial (10-E PLY)

Tire $115.00
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

235/80Rx17 HY Radial (14-G PLY)
CONTACT PURCHASING FOR PHONE QUOTE

245/75Rx16 H/T Radial LT

Tire $88.80
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/75Rx16 A/T Radial Lt

Tire $92.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/75Rx16 LUG Max Traction Radial

Tire $107.22
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

245/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $130.13
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $7.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/75Rx17 H/T Radial LT

Tire $96.79
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $7.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/75Rx17 A/T Radial LT

Tire $113.43
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $7.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/75Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $131.99
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $7.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/55Rx18 HY Steel Radial

Tire $114.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & B TIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/75Rx16 H/T Radial LT

Tire $99 41
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $7.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/75Rx16 A/T Radial LT

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $103.26
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $7.00
Flat Repair $10.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

265/75Rx16 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $122.79
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $7.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/70Rx17 A/T Radial "P" Metric
Tire $98.07
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/70Rx17 A/T Radial LT

Tire $113.70
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $121.86
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

265/65Rx18 A/P Radial "P" Metric

Tire $93.76

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00|JET TIRE SERVICE

Wheel Balancing $10.00

Flat Repair $15.00

e
275/65Rx18 A/P Radial

Tire $126.38

Tire Mount $10.00

Tire Change $10.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Wheel Balancing $10.00

Flat Repair $12.00

275/70Rx18 H/T Radial LT

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $125.00
Tire Mount $10.00
Tire Change $10.00|T & BTIRE
Wheel Balancing $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

285/75Rx16 H/T RADIAL
Tire $120.22
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $7.00
Flat Repair $10.00

285/70Rx16 LUG - MAX TRACTION RDL

Tire $129.37
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $7.00
Flat Repair $10.00

245/70R17 A/T Radial
Tire $110.74
Tire Mount $8.00
Tire Change $8.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $8.00
Flat Repair $10.00

285/70Rx17 LUG Max Traction RDL

Tire $141.14
Tire Mount $7.00
Tire Change $7.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Wheel Balancing $7.00
Flat Repair $10.00

215/75Rx17.5 HY LPT Radial TBL

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $148.00

Tire Mount $15.00|T & BTIRE

Tire Change $15.00

Wheel Balancing $17.95|JET TIRE SERVICE

Flat Repair $20.00|T & B TIRE

...
225/70Rx19.5 HY Radial

Tire $178.90

Tire Mount $30.00

Tire Change $30.00|JET TIRE SERVICE

Wheel Balancing $17.95

Flat Repair $30.00

...
225/70Rx19.5 M/S Radial

Tire $179.90

Tire Mount $30.00

Tire Change $30.00|JET TIRE SERVICE

Wheel Balancing $17.95

Flat Repair $30.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

255/70Rx22.5 HY LPT Radial TBL

Tire $210.78
T?re Mount $30.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $30.00
Flat Repair $30.00

285/75Rx24.5 HY Radial

Tire $239.65

1ire Mount 23000) T TIRE SERVICE

Tire Change $30.00

Flat Repair $30.00

...
285/75Rx24.5 LUG Radial

Tire $277.88

Tire Mount $25.00{OK TIRE & AUTO

Tire Change $25.00

Wheel Balancing $17.95|JET TIRE SERVICE

FLAT REPAIR $25.00{OK TIRE & AUTO

295/75Rx22.5 LUG Radial Tubeless

Tire $268.49
T}re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Mount $25.00
Tire Change $25.00

315/80Rx22.5 HY Steering Radial

Tire $208.24
T?re Mount $35.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $35.00
Flat Repair $35.00

315/80Rx22.5 M/S RADIAL
Tire $349.90
T?re Mount $40.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $40.00
Flat Repair $40.00

25/1000x12 A/T ATV

Tire $63.00
T?re Mount $10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

25x11x12 A/T UTV

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $71.65
T}re Mount $10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

28x10x12 A/T UTV

Tire $106.45
T?re Mount $10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

ORx22.5 HY Radial Tubeless

Tire $199.00

T?re Mount $30.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $30.00

Flat Repair $30.00

10R22.5 HY Radial

Tire $243.88

T?re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00

Flat Repair $25.00

10Rx22.5 LUG Radial

Tire $348.39

Lire Mount $30.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $30.00

Flat Repair $30.00

111.x15 F-3 Industrial TBL

Tire $125.00

T?re Mount $10.00 T & BTIRE

Tire Change $10.00

Flat Repair $10.00

Tire $125.00

Tire Mount S10.00 o TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $10.00

Flat Repair $10.00

11L.x16 F-3 Industrial TBL

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $123.44

T}re Mount $10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $10.00

Flat Repair $10.00

11Rx22.5 LUG Drive LUG

Tire $256.46

Tire Mount $30.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $30.00

Flat Repair $30.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

11Rx22.5 Radial - HY

Tire $257.84
T?re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00

11Rx22.5 HY Premium Steering

Tire $259.11
T}re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00

11Rx22.5 M&S Max Traction RDL

Tire $353.82
T?re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00
11Rx24.5 LUG Drive LUG
Tire $283.89
T?re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00

11Rx24.5 M&S Max Traction RDL

Tire $295.18
T%re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00

11Rx24.5 HY Premium Steering

Tire $277.85
Tire Mount $30.00
Tire Change $30.00
Flat Repair $30.00

12x16 Skid Steer
Tire $130.00
T}re Mount $15.00 T & B TIRE
Tire Change $15.00
Flat Repair $15.00

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

12x16.5 NHS Front Backhoe
Tire $130.00
T?re Mount $15.00 T & B TIRE
Tire Change $15.00
Flat Repair $15.00

JET TIRE SERVICE

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

12.4 X 24 Tubeless Radial R-1

Tire $280.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $25.00

Tire Change $25.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $25.00

12.5/80X18 R-4 Backhoe

Tire $223.00
T?re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00

13.6x28 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $275.06
T?re Mount $35.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $35.00
Flat Repair $35.00

14x17.5 NHS SupTrac Duplex

Tire $233.00
T?re Mount $30.00 T & B TIRE
Tire Change $30.00
Flat Repair $30.00

16.9x34 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $449.67
T?re Mount $40.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $40.00
Flat Repair $40.00

17.51.24 R-4 Ind. LUG Tubeless

Tire $355.05
T?re Mount $50.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $50.00
Flat Repair $50.00

340/85Rx24 RI1 Front Tractor

Tire $396.18
Tire Mount 53000} 1 1R E SERVICE
Tire Change $50.00
Flat Repair $50.00

17.5x25 G-2 Grader Loader TBL

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $476.30
T}re Mount $75.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $75.00
Flat Repair $75.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

17.5x25 RL Loader Rocklug TBL

Tire $484.11
T?re Mount $80.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $80.00
Flat Repair $80.00

17.5Rx25 LUG Radial TBL LUG

Tire $967.35
Lire Mount 59000} TR E SERVICE
Tire Change $90.00
Flat Repair $90.00
20.5x25 .2 Radial
Tire $1,062.00{DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $85.00
Tire Change $85.00|OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair $85.00

18.4x30 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $473.81
T?re Mount $35.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $35.00
Flat Repair $35.00

18.4x34 R-1Farm Tube Type

Tire $495.29
T?re Mount $40.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $40.00
Flat Repair $40.00

460/85Rx34 R-1 Rear Tractor

Tire $824.99
Tire Mount $50.00
Tire Change $50.00
Flat Repair $50.00

JET TIRE SERVICE

18.4x38 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $556.31
T}re Mount $45.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $45.00
Flat Repair $45.00

19.5x24 R-4 Backhoe IND LUG TBL

Tire $422.57
Tire Mount $50.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $50.00
Flat Repair $50.00

TIED BID. SEE NEXT PAGE

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

Tire $422.57
T}re Mount $50.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $50.00
Flat Repair $50.00

20.8x34 R-1 Tractor

Tire $798.23
T}re Mount $75.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $75.00
Flat Repair $75.00
$798.23
Tire Mount 575001 £ 1 TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $75.00
Flat Repair $75.00

20.8x38 R-1 Farm Tube Type

Tire $799.86
Lire Mount 56500} 1 TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $65.00
Flat Repair $65.00

23.1x26 HF-1 Turf Tire

Tire $796.86
T?re Mount $110.00 JET TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $110.00
Flat Repair $110.00

750x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless

—— $85.00
Tire Mount S10.001 e AT E TIRE
Tire Change N/B

$10.00

750Rx16 HY Trailer

Tire $115.78
T?re Mount $10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00
900x20 HW Tube Type
Tire $195.00
T}re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

900x20 LUG Tube Type
Tire $225.55
T?re Mount $25.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $25.00
Flat Repair $25.00
I
O00Rx20 HY Radial
Tire $280.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $30.00
Tire Change $30.00{OK TIRE & AUTO
Flat Repair $30.00

900Rx20 M&S Radial
CONTACT PURCHASING FOR PHONE QUOTE

900Rx20 LUG Max Traction RDL
CONTACT PURCHASING FOR PHONE QUOTE

1000x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless

Tire $126.00
T}re Mount $10.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $10.00
Flat Repair $10.00

1100x16 TRIRIB Farm Tubeless

Tire $142.95
T?re Mount $15.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $15.00
Flat Repair $15.00

1000Rx20 HY Radial Tube Type

Tire $325.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
Tire Mount $30.00

Tire Change $30.00|OK TIRE & AUTO

Flat Repair $30.00

1000Rx20 M&S Radial Tube Type

Tire $353.80
T?re Mount $30.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $30.00
Flat Repair $30.00

1400x24 G-2 TBL Premium 181 lbs.

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES

Tire $356.01
T}re Mount $45.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $45.00
Flat Repair $45.00

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




LOWEST BIDDER TIRES / TIRE SERVICES

1400x24 G-2 TBL Economy 137 Ibs.

Tire $350.01
T?re Mount $45.00 OK TIRE & AUTO
Tire Change $45.00
Flat Repair $45.00

1400x24 G-2/1.-2 Radial Tubeless

Tire $945.73
Lire Mount 58500} kT TIRE SERVICE
Tire Change $85.00
Flat Repair $85.00
RECAPPED WITH CORE
11Rx22.5 $167.00|BEALE TIRE
11Rx24.5 $185.00|DIRECT DISCOUNT TIRE
1400x24 (RADIAL)CGS CALL PURCHASE FOR PHONE QUOTE
State Contract SW024

TIRES/TIRE SERVICES 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



LOWEST BIDDER

HAULING

LOWEST BIDDER
10 WHEELER
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 50 MILES $ 3.90 |PARROTT TRUCKING
51-70 MILES $ 3.70 |PARROTT TRUCKING
71-90 MILES $ 3.70 [PARROTT TRUCKING
90 - 100 MILES $ 3.70 |PARROTT TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES $ 3.70 [PARROTT TRUCKING
TRI-AXLE
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 50 MILES $ 420 |PARROTT TRUCKING
51-70 MILES $ 4.15 [PARROTT TRUCKING
71-90 MILES $ 4.05 |[PARROTT TRUCKING
90 - 100 MILES $ 3.70 |PARROTT TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES $ 3.70 |PARROTT TRUCKING
18 WHEELER (BELLY DUMP)
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 5.48 |B & L TRANSPORT
26 - 50 MILES $ 4.50 |B & L TRANSPORT
$ 4.50 [JB SERVICES
51-70 MILES $ 4.00 [B & L TRANSPORT
21~ 90 MILES $ 3.65 |B & L TRANSPORT
$ 3.65 |JB SERVICES
90 - 100 MILES $ 3.65 [JB SERVICES
OVER 100 MILES $ 3.65 |JB SERVICES
.
18 WHEELER (END DUMP)
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 5.00 |CMC EXPRESS
26 - 50 MILES $ 4.15 |PARROTT TRUCKING
51-70 MILES $ 3.95 |PARROTT TRUCKING
21~ 90 MILES $ 3.60 |PARROTT TRUCKING
$ 3.60 |PHILLIPS TRUCKING
90 - 100 MILES $ 3.60 |[PARROTT TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES $ 3.60 |[PARROTT TRUCKING

Hauling

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




LOWEST BIDDER

HAULING

NEXT LOWEST BIDDER
10 WHEELER
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 50 MILES $ 6.00 |JUSTIN NIMROD
51-70 MILES $ 6.00 [JUSTIN NIMROD
71-90 MILES $ 6.00 [JUSTIN NIMROD
90 - 100 MILES $ 6.00 [JUSTIN NIMROD
OVER 100 MILES $ 6.00 [JUSTIN NIMROD
TRI-AXLE
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 50 MILES $ 5.20 [JUSTIN NIMROD
51-70 MILES $ 4.33 |JUSTIN NIMROD
71-90 MILES $ 4.00 |JUSTIN NIMROD
90 - 100 MILES $ 3.69 |JUSTIN NIMROD
OVER 100 MILES $ 3.93 [JUSTIN NIMROD
18 WHEELER (BELLY DUMP)
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 5.89|JUSTIN NIMROD
26 - 50 MILES $ 4.82 |JUSTIN NIMROD
51-70 MILES $ 4.04 |JUSTIN NIMROD
71-90 MILES $ 4.00 [JUSTIN NIMROD
90 - 100 MILES $ 4.00 |JUSTIN NIMROD
OVER 100 MILES $ 3.70 |B& L TRANSPORT
...
18 WHEELER (END DUMP)
PER LOADED MILE
0 - 25 MILES $ 5.15 [PARROTT TRUCKING
26 - 50 MILES $ 430 [CMC EXPRESS
$ 4.00 [JUSTIN NIMROD
51-70 MILES $ 4.00 |PHILLIPS TRUCKING
$ 4.00 |CMC EXPRESS
71- 90 MILES $ 3.65 [JB SERVICES
90 - 100 MILES $ 3.65 |JB SERVICES
$ 3.65 [PHILLIPS TRUCKING
OVER 100 MILES $ 3.65 |JB SERVICES
$ 3.65 [PHILLIPS TRUCKING

Hauling

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




EQUIPMENT RENTALS

VIBRATORY COMPACTOR
67" SINGLE SMOOTH DRUM PADFOOT COMBINATION
WEEKLY $ 1,000.00 |YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY $ 2,200.00 [KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY $ 3,000.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
...
DOUBLE DRUM ROLLER
DOUBLE DRUM ROLLER WITH WET KIT
WEEKLY $ 1,000.00 [NOBLES EQUIPMENT
BI-WEEKLY $ 3,300.00 [KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY $ 3,000.00 [NOBLES EQUIPMENT
...
80 HP 4WD BACKHOE
80 HP 4WD BACKHOE WITH 36" BACK BUCKET
DAILY $ 300.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
WEEKLY $ 900.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
MONTHLY $ 2,700.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
... |
70 HP BACKHOE
with 550' LB. ROCK HAMMER
DAILY $  490.00 |KIRBY SMITH
WEEKLY $ 1,000.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY $ 3,100.00 KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY $ 3,000.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
.
MOTORGRADER
185 HP W/REAR RIPPER & SCARIFIER
WEEKLY $ 2,500.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
$ 2,500.00 |[KIRBY SMITH
BI-WEEKLY $ 5,300.00 [KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY $ 7,000.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
.
90 HP CRAWLER
WITH 6 WAY DOZER
WEEKLY $ 1,200.00 |[KIRBY SMITH
BI-WEEKLY $ 2,900.00 [KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY $ 3,800.00 |[KIRBY SMITH
.
140 HP EXCAVATOR
45,000 LB. CLASS EXACATOR
WEEKLY $ 1,700.00 |[KIRBY SMITH
BI-WEEKLY $ 3,400.00 [KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY $ 5,000.00 [KIRBY SMITH
.
130 HP LOADER
25,000 LB. CLASS 3 YARD LOADER
WEEKLY $ 1,400.00 [KIRBY SMITH
BI-WEEKLY $ 3,500.00 [KIRBY SMITH

Hauling

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




EQUIPMENT RENTALS

MONTHLY $ 4,400.00 [KIRBY SMITH

9 WHEEL PNEUMATIC ROLLER
WEEKLY $ 1,000.00 NOBLES EQUIPMENT
BI-WEEKLY NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)

MONTHLY $ 3,000.00 ‘NOBLES EQUIPMENT

17,000 LB. BULLDOZER

WEEKLY $ 1,000.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
MONTHLY $ 3,000.00 [YELLOWHOUSE

20,000 LB. BULLDOZER

WEEKLY $ 1300.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
BI-WEEKLY NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
MONTHLY $ 3,500.00 [YELLOWHOUSE
ROAD BROOM
WEEKLY $ 000.00 |KIRBY SMITH
BI-WEEKLY $ 1,800.00 |[KIRBY SMITH
MONTHLY $ 2,500.00 [KIRBY SMITH
State Contract SWO0185

Hauling

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



COPY PAPER

WHITE 92, 20 LB.
81/2x11 $ 32.70 |ADA PAPER CO.
81/2x14 $ 46.50 [ADA PAPER CO.
1x17 $ 46.00 [ADA PAPER CO.
81/2 x14 CANARY YELLOW $ 66.00 |ADA PAPER CO.
81/2 x14 GREEN $ 66.00 |ADA PAPER CO.
Copy Paper 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



STRUCTURAL GEAR (AKA BUNKER GEAR)
JACKET $ 107100 |CASCOINDUSTRIES
DUAL RADIO POCKET INCL.  |CASCO INDUSTRIES
FLASHLIGHT HOLDER INCL.  |CASCO INDUSTRIES
AMERICAN FLAG INCL.  |CASCO INDUSTRIES
DEPT. LETTERING INCL.  |CASCO INDUSTRIES
FIREFIGHTER NAME INCL.  |CASCO INDUSTRIES
TROUSERS $  770.00 |CASCO INDUSTRIES

State Contract SW0241

Structural Gear (aka Bunker Gear) 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



FIRE HOSE

EPDM RUBBER LINED DOUBLE JACKET

11/2' $96.00 CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
13/4 $108.00 |CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
2 $145.00 |CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
212 $149.00  |CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
3! $205.00 |CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
Dept. Name INCL. CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
SERIAL NUMBER STAMPED (PER LENGTH $5.00 CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY

LDH SUPPLY LINE
4" - 100 FT. $490.00 |CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
5" - 100 FT. $570.00 |CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
6" - 100FT. $1,080.00 |CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
STENCILING INCL. CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY

SMALL DIAMETER SUPPLY LINE RUBBER COVERED

50 FT.
' $109.00 |CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
112 $127.00 CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
13/4" $145.00 |CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
2' $175.00 CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
21/2 $185.00 CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
3 $235.00 |CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
DEPT. NAME INCL. CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
COUPLING SERIAL# STAMPED $5.00 CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY

BOOSTER HOSE

100 FT.
3/4"' PER FOOT NO BID
1" PER FOOT NO BID

State Contract SW0241

Fire Hose 1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



WILDLAND GEAR

TWO PIECE SUIT

INDURA 9 OZ. COAT

S-XL $ 193.00 |CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL $  212.00 |CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL $ 231.00 |{CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL $ 250.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
DEPT. NAME OF SHOULDER $ 20.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
INDURA 9 OZ. PANT
SHORT - XLONG
S-XL $ 198.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL $ 218.00 |CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL $  238.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL $  257.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XLONG (36" INSEAM)
S-XL $ 218.00 |CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL $ 240.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL $ 261.00 |CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL $ 283.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
WILDLAND SUSPENDERS $ 35.00 |CASCO INDUSTRIES
ADVANCE 7.0 OZ COAT
S -XL $  306.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL $ 337.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL $ 368.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL $ 398.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
DEPT. NAME ON SHOULDER $ 20.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
ADVANCE 7.0 OZ. PANT
SHORT - XLONG
S-XL $ 302.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL $  332.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL $ 362.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL $  392.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XLONG (36" INSEAM)
S-XL $  332.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL $  365.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL $ 398.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL $  432.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
WILDLAND SUSPENDERS $35.00|CASCO INDUSTRIES
INDURA 9.00z COVERALL
S-XL $310.00{CASCO INDUSTRIES
2XL $340.00|CASCO INDUSTRIES
3XL $372.00|{CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL $402.00|CASCO INDUSTRIES
DEPT. NAME ON SHOULDER $20.00|{CASCO INDUSTRIES

Wildland Gear

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020




WILDLAND GEAR

TWO PIECE SUIT
NOMEX 7.5 0Z. COAT
S- XL
XL
3XL
T NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
DEPT. NAME OF SHOULDER (2)
3)
NOMEX 7.5 OZ. PANT
SHORT - XLONG
S- XL
22l NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
3XL
4XL
2XLONG (36" INSEAM)
S- XL
2XL
3XL NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
4XL
WILDLAND SUSPENDERS
TWO PIECE SUIT
NOMEX 6.0 0Z. COAT
S- XL $ 23100
XL $  254.00
3XL $  277.00 | CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL $  300.00
DEPT. NAME OF SHOULDER $  20.00
NOMEX 6.0 OZ. PANT
SHORT - XLONG
S- XL $  235.00
22l b 25800 | 45O INDUSTRIES
3XL $  282.00
4XL $  305.00
2XLONG (36" INSEAM)
S- XL $ 25800
2XL $  284.00
3XL $  310.00 [CASCO INDUSTRIES
4XL $  336.00
WILDLAND SUSPENDERS $ 3500
NOMEX 7.5 0Z. COVERAL
S-XL
2XL
3XL NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
4XL
DEPT. NAME OF SHOULDER

Wildland Gear

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020



WILDLAND GEAR

INDURA DOUBLE DUTY PANT
SHORT - XLONG

S-XL
2L NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
3IXL
4XL

2XLONG (36" INSEAM)
S-XL
2XL NO BID (PHONE QUOTE)
3IXL
4XL

State Contract SW0241

Wildland Gear

1/1/2020 - 6/30/2020
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