PITTSBURG COTUINTY COMMISSIONERS
JUNE 4, 20112
Minutes

The Board of County Commissioners, Pittsbarg County, met in regular session on June 4,
2012 at 904 AN, Meeting held in Couniy Commissioners Conference Room, aller proper
notice and agenda were posted indicating time and date. Asenda was posted at 8:21 a.m.
June 1, 2012,

ROLL CALE: The meeting was called 10 oréer by Chatman Ropers. Koll was called.

Kevin Smith Present
Cicue Rogors Present
Runnje Y oung Present

1L APPROVAL OF AGENDA: Smith made a motion to approve agenda; sceonded by Young,

AYE: Gene Rogers
Ronme Young
FKevin Smith

MAY: None

Iloalion Passed.

2. CONSIDERATION OF MINUTES: The minutes rom the previous meeting, May 2%, 2012
eewular meeting and the May 30, 20102 gpectul meeting wers read. Youno made a motion 0
aceepl mimutes as read; scconded hy Smith.

AYE:  (Gene Rowsers
Ronnte Young
Kewm Smith

MNAY:  Nonco

Relesliom Puassed.
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3 APPROVAL OF CLAIMS-FISCAL TRANSACTIONS: Smith made a motton Lo approve
purchase orders for payment upon review and signature; seconded by Young,

AYT Gene Ropers
Ronmie Young,
[evin Bnith

MAY: Whone

molion Passed.

A APPROVAL OF BLANKET PURCHASL ORDERS:

DEPT ro | AMOUNT | vENDOR
: DISTRICT 41 9563 2004 PIKEPASS
i DISTRICT #2 9564 ] 20.00 PIKEPASS
ANIMAL SHELTER | 9563 IR FUELMAN
[ ANIMAL SHELTER | 9566 o 100.00 MISTY VALLEY
DISTRICT #2 9567 N 200.00 MISTY VALLEY
DISTRICT 21 9568 201300 ALDERSON
| . _ : LANDIIL
DISTRICT #2 L 9369 C 200,00 ALDERSON
| : LANDFILL ;
DINTRICT #3987 2000 i ALDERSON i
_ . o : _ LANDEILL i
DESTRICT #3 9571 . 2000.00 | JETTIRE ;
| GENERAL FIIND 9575 40000 MISTY VALLLY
GLNERAL FUND 9576 | 40000 UNIFIRST
m TNERALFUND 9577 104,00 SUDS
- SHERIEEF
i b[lLRH’F ) L9378 200000 TFUELMAN
STIERIFE L 9579 300,00 PIKLPASS
SHERIFF 9580 _ 120,00 CMISTY VALLEY |
SHERIFF 9581 L 200000 PUCLMAN
SHERIIF | 9582 10000 i PIKEPASS
_ALDERSONFD 9583 TOG0.00 | FUELMAN
“STTADY GROVE D [ 9384 000 | COM DATA
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Sntth made a motion Lo approve e blanket purchase orders; seconded by Young,

AYE: Gens Roguers
Ronnie Young
Foewin Smath

MNAY:D None.

Mation Passed.

B. WEEKLY FUEL BIDS: Tl Following luct hids were recerved.

TWENDOR | UNLEADED T LOWS. TIGETS, PROPANE
NON DILSLL DIESEL g
EFLIANOL ; ‘
Ram Inc. | 2.8680 2574 8T 1174 B
lvoten . 2.9590 2 89(K] 2.8935 No Bid
Fenlress ~io Bad | o Id No Bid o 3 .
Hopkins 2.8%00 29300 29500 P 7400

Smith made 4 motion to award vnleaded, bizh aud Jow sulphar dicsel 1o Ram and propane 1o
Ram & Topkins: sceonded by Rogers.

AYE:  Gene Rogers
Ronnie Young
Koyvin Smuth

NAYT None.

Ilation Passed.
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4. NEW BUSINESS: None.

5. COUNTY BUSINESS:

A APPROVE OR DISAPPROVE MEMORANDUM OF UNDERSEANDING BEI'WEEN
PITTSRIURG COUNTY AND THFE CITY OF MCALESTER REGARDING CLIFF
PITNER, FLLOODPLAIN ADMINISTRATION: Smith made a metion to approve; seconded
by Young,

AYE: Gone Rogers
Ronnie Young
Kevin Smith

SNAYD MNone.

Motion Passad.

B. APPROVE OR DISAPPROVE JUVENILE DETENTION SERVICES CONTRACT
BETWEEN PITTSBURG COUNTY AND TEXAS COUNTY JUVENILE DETENTIOMN
CENTER: Smith stated it was $29.36 per child per day, Snilh made a motion to approve;
seennded by Younp.

AYE: Gene Rogers
Romnie Young
Kevin Smith

MAY:  Wone.

Motion Passed,
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. APPROVE OR DISATPROVE JUVENILE DETENTION SERVICES CONTRACT
BETWEEN PITTSRBURG COUNTY AND CANADIAN COUNTY JUVENILE
DETENTION CENTER: Rogers stated $319.31 per day. Rogers made a motion to approve:
seconded by Bmith.

AN Gene Rogers
Ronnie Young
Kevin Smith

™NAY: MNone,

Motion Passed,

. APPROVE OR DISAPPROVE COUNTY FREASURER'S TRANSCRIFT OT
PROCEEDINGS OF SALE ON COUNTY OWNLED PROYERTY ACQUIRED AT
RESALE FOR APPROVAL OF THE COUNTY COMMISSTIONERS, RESOEUTION
FOR COMMEISSIONERS SALL AND APPROVE AND SIGN COUNTY DEED-
TREASURER: Smith made a moton w approve: seconded by Young,

AYE: {Jene Roocers
Fonnme Young
Kevin Snuth

MAY:  INone

Motion Passed.
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E. RESOLUTION TO DEPOSIT CIIECK-GENERAL FUND: Rogers made a motion 1o
deposiz check from Southeastern Public Library System of OR; sceonded by Young,

AYLE Gene Ropers
Fonnie Youngz
Fivin Smith

NAY:  MNone.

M olion Pessed.

9. ADJOURNMENT/RECESS: Rooers miade a motion 1o recess until 10000, seconded by
Young.

AYLE: Gene Rogers
Konnie Young
Eevin Smith

MNAY:  None

hotion Passed.

ROLL CALL: The mesting was called bacl 1o orider by Chatrman Rogers, Roll was called.

Kevin Snuith Present
Ciene Ropers Tesant
Ronnie Youny Present
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F. 13:00-OPEN SEALED SIX MONTH BIDS-COMMISSIONERS:

CRUSHIED STONE

STIGLER STOXNL
DOLLESE
YOUNGMAN ROCK

ASPHALT

GLOVER & ASSOC,

JOB CONSTRELCTTION
CONCRLETE

TWIN CITIES READY MIX

MID CONTINENT

ROAD O11LS

ERGON ASPHALT & EMULOTONS
COASTAL ENERGY

GARY WILLIAMS-NO BID

ASPHALT FLEL & STHPFLY
VANCLE BROTHERS

IAVLING ROAD MATERIALS

PARROGTT TRU.CKENG
B&S CONSTRUCTION
GULSS TRUCKING
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LAYDOWN MACIIINE

SMITH PAVING

EOQUIPMENT KENTAL

WARREN CAT
YELTOWHOUSE MACHINERY

GRADER BLADLS

KIERY SaITH
YELLOWHOUSE MACHINERY

SPTRAL PIFE

WILSON CLULVERTS
KEY FQUIPMENT

USED STEEL PIPE

THE RAILROAD YARD
ALFORD MITTAL
SUNBLELT LQUIPMENT

NEM & TISKED STEE]L

SUNBLELT CQUIPMENT
THEE BAILRGAT YARD
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TIRES
OR TIELS

JET-TIRE
HERCULES TIRES

FIRE SERVICE

JET TIRE
Ok TIRE:

PETROLEUM PRODUCTS

O TIRE
KIRBY SMITH- NO BID
YELLOWIHOTUSE MACHINERY

PET FOOD

TRACTOR SLPPLY

MICRO CIIEPS

AV IDENTIFICATHONS
PET HEAT. TH SERVICES T.5A

Smith made a motion te accept as opened and table for review; seconded by Ropers,
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AYL: Gene Rogers
Ronnie Young
Eewvin Snuth

MAY:  None.

hlotion Pagsed.

6. DNFINISIIED BUSINESS: vone.

7. REPORT OF THE CLERK: [Tope Trammull, Deputy County Clerk stated that Dana Dugan
and Fiffany Weiher are the receiving officers for the 2012 Reap Gran #F-60836, Red
(red/Lishtning C Roads and Roy Tocker is the receiving oflicer for the 2002 Reap Grant 78
6037, Blaoca alse Neil Johnson is the reeeiving officer for Lthe 2012 Reap Grant #K-6038, Wuost
Flerctord Lane and Iighway No. 9 Corununity Conter fov the 20H 2 Reap Grant receving
aflcers are Dena Sponsler, Carolyn Wood and Larry Bover.

8. REPORT OR COMMENTS OF THE COMMISSIONERS: Nane,

9, ADJOURNMENT/RECESS: There being ne lurther bushiess brought helore the board;
Rogers mads a motion to sign all approved clams and adjourn; scconded by Svuth.

AYE: Gens Rogers
Romauie ¥ ounyg
Kevin Smith

NAY:  MNone.

Motion Passed. Meeung adjourncd,




Fiscal Year:
212

pa Mo, Woarrant Mo, Wendor ™ume
ANTMAL SHELTER MAINTENANCE & OPERATHINS
As-1I3

10 A3 VAR PLULT, MICIIELE E
94593 B30 HEFLEY, SANTDEA L

AS-MO
7344 557 A DNV ANTAGE TRUCK BOLN
SO0 553 IMPRLES
G134 Ba% TRACTOR SUPPLY
W2iT Ral WALMART COMMUNLLY BRC
Q245 B4l IMAPRLSS
G24mn gal ROW WL SUPPLY
G377 Gh3 ALLEGIANCE COMMUNICATIO
AL and EALGHLIN, BOBBRY &G
2390 Bad DR MARK FERRELL

CIVIL DEFENSE

T2
D474 o 5 CELEULAR
U] 1015 GLOGBAL STAR

ETRE DEPARTMENTS SAILES TAX
FD-ASHLD-2

QA 1552 ANMEWER SERVICE O MEALE

FD-BLMNC(R-2

DA07 1553 LS CLLEULAR

FI»BLLE-2

05av L34 PITELIC SERMICE U0 O OKLA
FO-CANDN-2

3873 LEes NOBLE INDUSTRIAL SUPPLY

120 15546 LEARS GARAUGE

G473 1327 ORLA MATLURAL GAS COMPAT

0474 1338 ANSWER SERVICLE OF MOALE
F-CANSH-2

AL 559 RLEAL WATER DGIST v

YU 1560 AMNSWLR SERVICT OF MOALE
FD-CRWDH-1R

03 L5 UACMPSON, BLAKE
FDO-IIGTIT.-2

ERLE, ey ATET
FIH(HIL-3

BEs | 20T FIRLE SAFTTY T08A

T | 563 FIRE SAFTEY LEA
FD-11W ART-2

Q442 1563 ALANMICH] FLECTREC (0602,

Purchase Orders by Account

Approved

Trom: 6:4:2012
Ta: f=2012

Furpose

MEALS
TRAYEL
Tatal

WINLOHW TTNT
RECTREFT BOORS
FLPPY FOOD

KLENMEL SUTPLIES
TAOST & FOUNE CARLDYS
YET SUFPPLIES
RECHMTIILY SERVICE
KTEIWVRIUVREEMENT
VETERIMNARY SLRVICLE

Totel:

RCOHTHLY SLERYICE
MONTHLY SERVICE

Total:

AONTHLY STRVICE

Tatal-

MUMTIILY SERVICE

Tsaal:

BAOWTHLY SERVICL

Total

WATER ALDITIVE
TIRES ETL.
ROWUTILY SERWEICE
RCMTLILY SERYICE

Tzl

sIONTHLY SERVICL
MONTITY SERVICE

Talal:

TRANEL

Tl

RONTHLY SERVICE

Total:

BUNEER GEAR
BLNRER GLEAR COATT

Total:

RN THEY SERY LY

Armaour]

521.08

519595

21705

SR0.00
$23i).1]
S146.00
S140.98
$116.76
$237.30)
$107.95

511,60
S600.00
$1,694.70

s14sT7
253,42
521917

519800
$198.00

SI09.92
Sina.al

56681

$60.51

SA0THIR
Slov.9%
S123.74

$4,635.49
S25.00
S160.00
S185.00

318222
5182.22

__S%0.46
SH0. 40

$1,520,00
T L
$2.000.00

RSt 11



PO o

Fisenl Year:
MT-E02

FI-KIOWA-2
Ga0d

FI-MCAL-3
BA26

FD-PTERG-2
G37E
a:54
09335

FD-SLIGRY-1B
Q529

FO-SHOGRY-2
AT
Q530
o

(]
iaa Ll

A

FO-TANHL-2

H32d

FR-LNCIHTP-2
s

CGENERAL

E-1B
Wity
0559
ERNIY,
Gaal

Warraml Mo

1366

[ 567

508
il ]

1270

Exf

575

KRS

3535

Purchase Orders by Account

Nendar Name

s CELLULAR

1COR AWERICA

BLNLIS THC.
LS CELLULAR
PITTSBURG PLRLIC WORES Al

JAMES. GREG

T AY [N EXPRESS
BURAL WATER THET. #42
L8 CLLETULAR

STANDARD WVACHINL & WELT

RICALES TER WELLING SUPP

CanTRELL, RAVID

ERMONS, LALIELL

CAWEN GRLEGORY 1
CARTLER, ML

STAPLES CREIHT PT.AN
STAPLER CREDIL PLAN
GUARDIAN SECURTTY =Y 5T
Uy OF MCATESTER

IMPRESS
1MPELSSE

HANMNES. CATHY L.

THE HERITAGE i

TRIPLE AAs PLUMBING
HEWS CArEral & DEMOCRAT

Brrpose

MONTEEY SERVICE

RADIOS FETO

TRUCK PARTS
MM THLY SLRVICE
MIONTHLY SERVICE

TRAYLL

LOLGING
MONTLEY SERVICE
WONTHLY SERVICE

RETAL

ACETALENE BOYTELES

TRAVEL

TRAV LT

TRAVEL
TRAVI.

U ATIPTPLIES
GQEFTICE SUPPLIES
ALARM MOMITORTNG
ALARM LICENEE

HWIFTARY SLAL
OFFICE SUPPLILS

TRAVIL

LD NG

FLLWEBLNG REFATRS
PTIBLICATIOMN

ol

Toal:

Total:

Tatat:

Torl:

latals

Toatzl:

Total.

Tl

Tatal:

Fotal;

Tl

Toalal:

l'ctal:

Approved
Frop: 6/42012
To: BAZ012

Arnount

30200

S100.10.
S1{M0 T

$10.81062
S10.510.62

S374.00
Fas5.53
54325

551278

514902
Sla9.02

S154.00
5383
51217

S204.47T

XAT.RO
824786

S80.00
$50.00

230747
S909.01
SEOW.72
5612.73

5260502

541600
513353
£2.0.95
S10.00

S586.57
$27.94
549,80
%7274

$273.08
§273.08
%6200

F62.00

STLED
Sy )

$620.40




Fiscal Year:

1a017

PO Np.
50-18
U653
GETS
9465
2466
9417
9163

HIEALTH
*D-1B
9514
Fx15
R R

MT»-2
SULs
U164
YK
02a]
ba9g

MO-3
BUTZ
9311

ITIGHWAY
T-24]

4536
A5
e85
Talz
T3
Taa0
2EER
2axl
BAE0
sol
BOAT
Bail
2481z
813
a7
G134
G151
Qa2

CA
Q172
9351
DEEL
Gl
ar7s

Warrant Mo

CAS1

.
Lot

Lo

=

LA
pery

o

LIE T % R 'Y B WY R P )
LA

IR UPE T N I S S T )
=]

Lel
_h

A10
4171
412
413
i

213

416

4347
4:34%
4349
4350
4357
4332

P =Y
LI I

LAt

LA oal e

4
o

o
iR

[P T IR VP T I
LA
1

PO U I LI 9
oh
)

4361

Purchase Orders by Account

WVendor Mame

CANIGLIA, METINDA A
MOODY, ELIZARETH K.
SANDLERS, SIIAWNA T
WOODD, LARRY R
SNERRELL, GEOROL K
FLENDLEER, RICKEY

KR

HEMEY, FAlA
Lev L, KARLITA
ITARRIS, D EARLENE

CHANNING BETE COMPANY
VWALMART COMMUNITY BRC
CCHELEE. MECHALL

PACE AT & AR

WARREM CLINIC

BANE OF ORTAHOMA MA
DaAK OF ORKLAHOMA

LB, CONSTRECTTON

L0, COMETREUCT IO

JET TIRE SERMECE

T B, CONSTRUCTIORN
CLOVER & ARROCIATES
SO, CONETRITCTION
TLOVER & ASSOCIATES
L0 COMSTRUC TN

TR, COMNSTRUCTION

LOB. CONSTRRCTION
WARTEN CAT

ALDERSON REGIONAL LANIT
DAYIS TRAILER & TRUCH EG
KIERY 3kITH IMC.

STIGLER BTONE

FIOHPPIING PROPANE

AR TN

ZEL MLEDICAL SUTTLY

HAPA

KIREBY SMETL INC.

RAN 1N

STANDARD MACLHHME & WTILT
RART THC

BALIDWIRNE WARTELTY

Turmss

TRAVIEL
TRANVEL
TRAYEL
TRAVEL
TRAVEL
TRAVEL

MLMBERSHIr DLILES

TEAVEL
TRAVEL
TRAVEL

CIR TRATNING SLIPPLIES

OFLICE SUPTLIES
FREIGHT

A RETATR

XN EAY SERVICLS

LEASLE PAYMENT
BOMID TRUSTELE FEE

LIUETL ASTTIALT
HnAHL ASELALT
TIRLS LTE,

TINEATT. ASPHALTY
ArEL ASPIHALY
ITWLHTL ASPHALT
1IMAAL ARPHALL
UMALIL ASTTTALT
EMHL ASPIIALT
HMEIL ASPLALT
FILTERS

LANLYILL CILARGES
[TOTS8T
COMPRESROR

12" CRUCSTTRR BEA
FLUIL

FLAEL

FIRET ATD SUUPRLILS
SIECE SLPRPLIES

A0 THOSE

LUEL

Y DIRALUTETC HIOSE
FLitL

OFFICE =U¥TLIES

Approved
From: &:420172
T 0edl2012

Arnoant

$692.64
SET4.88
$637.14
$574.98
S591.08
. 5708.18

Total: o L3 R7R.O0

Toral: $1.596.00

122089
22600
522311
S670.00

Taral:

161147
RNz
STR.ER
Z145.50
S105.00

£2,074.08

Taml:

2004271
S600.00

Tatal: 1064271

571136
303562
S1.475.m0
S1,521.60
Sl.61614
S1,750.55
5816.20
51,792.85
51.555.28
S1.ETAD
7435714
=37.01
S1,1480.00
51,151.53
51,968, 14
&2.517.50
§£3.309.5%
STe6.93
bt
S37TT AL
S4,0488.24
56176
F35T3GT
S131.86



Frseal Yonr:

a2z

P Mo,
143
2315
9319
9320
Q5G]
0305
PR
SEN
9336
9337

T-2 42
|
391
247

T-I4H3
LA
G913
gaa
A%AE
G R4
EaAT
G153
9154
Q178
Q1T
A
D227
0254
Q324
Q3746
AT

T-i%3
541E

Warrans M.

o
Lad as ek
=1 =1 I

i UL P
I I R
[ TS I Ry

F
Taa Lad Lao Lkl X s
1

-l -t

i VR LI L 3
(Y]
]
)

45384
4383
4380
4387
4308
A3EQ
4350
410
1303
4303
1394
4305
434064
4547
4505
4 355

200

Purchase Orders by Account

Wendior Sume

TIMIFIRST

AP

STAMDARD MACHINE & WELD
YELLOW TIOUSE WACTE NI
NAILEYYNLE WATER DLV
iS5 ULELLULAR

ETANICH] RLECTRIC COOF,
AL

CROSS TELEPHOKE CC,
CROSS TELEPHONE C0

ALDERSGEN BREGHNAL LANDE
L5, CRLIULAR
60 COMMUNICATIONS

ST TIRE SERVICE

EIREY SAITH 1N,

BN FSR

DOLESLE

FHOMAR INBLSTRITS

KIREY EMITH tNC.

ZEP SALES & SERVICLE

ADA PAPER COMTANY
ADAME THUL YALUE
KIaATICHT AUTOMOTEYLE WAR
KIRTEY 23TTH 1M,

AN TNE

YLELLOW BLOUSTE MACHINE
WEL LN PARTS WO
ALLLEGLANCLE COMMIINICATIO
115 CELLLULAR

JI T A e 3

JAIL MAINTENANCE & OPERATIONS

JATL-3A
ERRY,
G2
gaan
ERRl
03z
Al
B30
G346
Q307
G308
CRI

9322

RLEAY GRANT
WG-KG3E

1247
1265
1205
1270
12
1272
£273
T4
1375
1370

1277

1270

MCALESTER REGIOGNAL TILEAL
BADICLOGY ASSOCIATION OF
SOUTHEASTER™ MEDICAL LA
MCALESTER RLGLHONAL LIOST
DHALG WARETICNIRE

DRUG WARLITOUSE

SACATESTER REGIONAL TTEAT,
MICALGSTRER REGIONAL HEAL
MUALESTER REGIONAL JHLEAL
MUALLESTER REGEHYNAL BEAL
MUALESTER REGIONAL TIEAL
DR UG W ARETTOUSE

Appraved

Frimm: 44724172
Tao: 6320170

Purpase
UNIFORM S SERVICE

AT PARTS
HyDRAULIC FITTIMNGS
HY DRALLLIS CIL
MORTITLY SERVICE
MONTHLY SERVICE
WONTHLY SERWVICL
RFGESTRA LGN TTES
MCGHTILY SERVICE
MONTHLY SERVICE

Tatal:
LANTIFILL CHARGES
RN TIILY SEREVICLE
MOMNTHLY SCEVICE

Tota

TIRES

GRADER BLADLES

1 172" CRUSHEE 1IN

T3 SCRERSINGS
PTOETASER

GASKET ETC

1] P

CUTS & TOWELS
CHAEMSAM SUPPLILS LT
HY DRALULIC 03T BT
FinIr PARTS

FLUEL.

EGUIPTPARTS

PIPE

O TLLY SERVICE
MONTHLY SERVICE

Toatul:

1" CRIISHER RN
Total:

I adATLE MEDRICAL
IHAWATT WETCAL
[MNMATE MEDICAL
[NMATL MEDIC AL
INMATE PRESCRIPTTONS
INMATE PREESCRIFTIONS
IMKA L MTETHC AT,
ISMAATE MENCAL
MNWIATE MEDICAL
ISMATE MEDECAL
AAATTE MDA
[HAATE PRESCRIPTIONS
Totyl:

Amanand
£343.41
S116.74

52234

STLED
20376
5213537

S49.07
1000

53087

23536

§33.419.25

7302
512758

_§39.95
LI41.55

21396014
$1,168.90
$3,145.59
S66(.53
£2,142.27
$217.56
L3060
SI82.16
$295.49
$2163.83
$364.61
£4.478.77
$558.36
§29.50
$59.95
$135.21

1483271

T1.483 71

S4,462.50
S192.00
S2O0
6.0
£57.00
$04.40
$1.062.76
$877.98
803,25
$1.529.75
5200.25
525.7¢
9,598,089

515,345,847



Tiacal Yearn
mi-2012

POF NG, Woarrant Mo
E0G 28
tHERIFF SERVILE FEE
Bd-2
DEXY 1254
L35 1253
U263 1256
AT 1257
ezl L2358
G434 L2454
G4-2AA
B0z 1261
Bd-JALL-2
Q20 1261
PR 262
9237 [ 2653
9264 1264
9303 265
4519 L2668
3141 el
9345 L2648
9453 Taw
Bd-1AI1L-3
S300 1270

Purchase Orders by Account

Vendor SName
TIOT FRE

C REELLY AUTO PARTS
MARVEL PHOTT [N,
O RENLY AUTO PARTS
TERRYS LUBE & (1L
Lo CLELLULAR

115 CRLLULAR

BEN F. EITH FOCH

MESAS] SERYICE DIVISION
GRAINGTER

LW LS

IMPRLESS

BEM R KRITH FOOL
L{WES

Liowlis

CRELLLY AUTO FARTS
1.5 CELLULAR

LOWES

Approved

From: 62352012

To: 6472012
Thurposg ATLoie
S COWER CHIPS S7.035T0
Tatal: 87,035.70
AL PARTS 133089
I'ILM E2RG.12
Ol & FELTERS $117.3%
WIPER BLADES Si9.54
MONTIILY SERVICE S7TO3.20
[MNTERET AR CARDS 510270
Total: 51.630.13
IWNMATE GROCERIES $2.336.2%
Total:  $2,336.2%

REPAIR YWISITATCHN FITONES
PIUMEBING PARTS

SHOP SUPPLIES
LN LR OPLES

KITCHEN SUPPLIES
MAINTENANCE SUPPLILS
WLER G TR

TILLEE PARTS

MG THLY SLERVICE

Tl

AR COMPEESSCHL

ot

$595,33
$10%.54
$21.50
5146.33
5432.02
$35.68
§44.62
S233.90
A4 AY
£2,355.91

S499.00
549,00



