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PITTSBURG COUNTY COMMISSIONER
JANUARY 24, 2022
MEETING MINUTES

The Board of County Commissioners, Pittsburg County, met in regular session on January
24,2022 at 9:00 A.M., Meeting held in the County Commissioners Conference Room, after
proper notice and agenda were posted indicating time and date. Agenda was posted at 8:58
A.M., January 21, 2022,

1. CALL MEETING TO ORDER: The meeting was called to order by Chairman Smith.

2. ROLL CALL: Roll was called.

Kevin Smith Present
Charlie Rogers Present
Ross Selman Present

3. APPROVAL OF AGENDA: Rogers made a motion to approve the agenda with corrections
to the approval of minutes to read January 19, 2022 and January 21, 2022; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

4. APPROVE/DISAPPROVE MINUTES FROM:

A. SPECIAL MEETING MINUTES FROM JANUARY 19, 2022: The minutes from the
previous meeting, January 19, 2022 special meeting were read. Smith made a motion to approve
the minutes; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.
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B. SPECIAL MEETING MINUTES FROM JANUARY 21, 2022: The minutes from the

previous meeting, January 21, 2022 special meeting were read. Smith made a motion to approve
the minutes; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

5. RECOGNITION OF GUESTS/PUBLIC COMMENTS: Leesha Case with Congressman
Mullin’s office stated that she will be leaving the office and that the new field person will be in
in the new few weeks.

6. OFFICIALS — DEPARTMENT REPORTS:
A. COUNTY CLERK:

i. LETTER CHANGING REQUISITIONING OFFICER - SHADY GROVE VFD: Smith
read a letter from Shady Grove Fire Chief changing the requisitioning officer.

ii. LETTER CHANGING REQUISITIONING/RECEIVING OFFICERS -
HAYWOOD/ARPELAR VFD: Smith read a letter from Haywood/Arpelar Fire Chief changing
the requisitioning and receiving officers.

iii. LETTER CHANGING REQUISITIONING/RECEIVING OFFICERS —
HAILEYVILLE VFD: Smith read a letter from Haileyville Fire Chief changing the
requisitioning and receiving officers.

iv. MINUTES CHANGING REQUISITIONING OFFICERS - FIREFIGHTERS
ASSOCIATION: Smith read a letter from Chairman of the Firefighters Association changing
the requisitioning officer.
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7. FISCAL TRANSACTIONS:

A. CLAIMS AND PURCHASE ORDERS: Smith made a motion to approve the purchase
orders for payment after review and signature; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

B. TRANFERS: Smith made a motion to approve all transfers; seconded by Rogers.
AYE: Kevin Smith

Charlie Rogers

Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

C. MONTHLY REPORTS: None.

D. BLANKET PURCHASE ORDERS:

DEPT PO AMOUNT VENDOR

Jail 6222 $ 300.00 Locke Supply

Jail 6223 $ 300.00 Walmart

District #1 6224 $ 500.00 O’Reilly’s

District #1 6225 $1,000.00 Rinker’s Automotive
District #2 6227 $1,500.00 Kiamichi Automotive
District #3 6228 $2,200.00 Cintas

District #3 6229 $1,000.00 Kiamichi Automotive

Smith made a motion to approve the blanket purchase orders; seconded by Selman,
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AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

E. FUEL BIDS: The Following fuel bids were received.

VENDOR UNLEADED UNDYED DYED PROPANE
NON LOW LOW
ETHANOL S. DIESEL S. DIESEL
RAM INC. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
HOOTEN 2.85104 2.95554 2.94904 No Bid
HOPKINS 2.7500 2.8600 2.8600 2.7900

Rogers made a motion to award unleaded, undyed low sulfur diesel and dyed low sulfur diesel
and propane to Hopkins with the stipulation that if the fuel cannot be delivered to move to the
next lowest bidder; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith

Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

8. UNFINISHED BUSINESS:

A. AWARD/REJECT BID NO. 12, ONE (1) 2021 OR NEWER, CHEVROLET
TRAILBOSS OR EQUIVALENT, LEASE PURCHASE WITH FINANCING
INCLUDED: Smith read a letter from Sheriff Morris requesting that the bid be awarded to
Toliver Chevrolet since Vance cannot currently produce the vehicle that they bid. Smith made a
motion to award the bid to Toliver Chevrolet; seconded by Rogers.
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AYE: Ross Selman
Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

B. AWARD/REJECT BID NO. 13, EXTRICATION TOOLS FOR KIOWA VFD: Smith
read a letter from Kiowa Fire Chief requesting that the bid be awarded to Municipal Emergency
Services as the lowest bidder. Smith made a motion to award the bid to Municipal Emergency
Services; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

9. AGENDA ITEMS:

A. ACCEPT/DENY APPLICATION FOR CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY TO
LOCATE OF ESTABLISH A CEMETERY - DISTRICT 3: Smith made a motion to
approve the application; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.
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B. APPROVE/DISAPPROVE PUBLIC HEARING NOTICE REGARDING THE
ESTABLISHMENT OF A PRIVATE CEMETERY — DISTRICT 3: Smith made a motion to
approve the public hearing notice; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

C. APPROVE/DISAPPROVE CUSTOMER SERVICE AGREEMENT BETWEEN
PITTSUBRG COUNTY AND UNIFIRST CORPORATION: Rogers asked when the service
would be implemented. Smith stated that it will take approximately 60 days from the time they
place the orders. Smith made a motion to approve the customer service agreement; seconded by
Rogers.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.
Motion Passed.
D. RESOLUTION 22-179 TO DEPOSIT CHECK — DISTRICT 2: Smith read the resolution.
Smith made a motion to approve the resolution; seconded by Selman.
AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.



Pittsburg County Commissioners Minutes
January 24,2022
Page 7

E. RESOLUTION 22-180 TO ACCEPT DONATIONS — ANIMAL SHELTER: Smith read
the resolution. Smith made a motion to approve the resolution; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

F. RESOLUTION 22-181 TO RE-ADVERTISE FOR SIX MONTH BIDS ON
PETROLEUM PRODUCTS: Smith made a motion to approve the resolution; seconded by
Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

G. EXECUTIVE SESSION:

i. TO CONDUCT THE PERSONNEL PERFORMANCE EVALUATION OF EDDIE
JONES, ASPHALT PLANT SUPERVISOR, PURSUANT TO OKLAHOMA STATUTES
TITLE 25 § 307(B)(1):

ii. TO CONDUCT THE PERSONNEL PERFORMANCE EVALUATION OF JASON
MORRIS, COURTHOUSE HOUSEKEEPING EMPLOYEE, PURSUANT TO
OKLAHOMA STATUTES TITLE 25 § 307(B)(1):

iii. TO CONDUCT THE PERSONNEL PERFORMANCE EVALUATION OF LIZZIE
STRAIN, COURTHOUSE HOUSEKEEPING EMPLOYEE, PURSUANT TO
OKLAHOMA STATUTES TITLE 25 § 307(B)(1):
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iv. TO CONDUCT THE PERSONNEL PERFORMANCE EVALUATION OF ADAM
LAWSON, COURTHOUSE MAINTENANCE SUPERVISOR, PURSUANT TO
OKLAHOMA STATUTES TITLE 25 § 307(B)(1):

v. TO CONDUCT THE PERSONNEL PERFORMANCE EVALUATION OF TAWANNA
CATHEY, FLOODPLAIN ADMINISTRATOR, PURSUANT TO OKLAHOMA
STATUTES TITLE 25 § 307(B)(1):

Smith made a motion to enter into executive session; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.

1. CALL MEETING TO ORDER: The meeting was called back to order by Chairman Smith.

2. ROLL CALL: Roll was called.

Kevin Smith Present
Charlie Rogers Present
Ross Selman Present

10. ROAD CROSSING PERMIT: None.

11.10:00 A.M. - BID OPENINGS:

A. BID NO. 10, OUTDOOR FACILITIES AT THE PITTSBURG COUNTY EXPO
CENTER PROJECT: The following bid was received.

VENDOR AMOUNT

Arrowhead Construction $428,570.00
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Smith made a motion to accept the bid as opened and table for review; seconded by Selman.

AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed.
12.10:00 A.M. - PUBLIC HEARINGS: None.
14. ADJOURNMENT/RECESS: There being no further business brought before the board;
Smith made a motion to sign all approved claims and adjourn; seconded by Selman.
AYE: Kevin Smith
Charlie Rogers
Ross Selman

NAY: None.

Motion Passed. Meeting Adjourned.



PITTSBURG COUNTY CLERK

HOPE TRAMMELL
Purchase Orders By Account
Fiscal Year : 2021-2022
Date Range: 01/24/2022 to 01/24/2022
PO Warrant No. Vendor Name Purpose

Animal Shelter

1316-1-8020-2005

005893 000401
006069 000402
006104 000403
006105 000404
006132 000405
006158 000406
006184 000407
Donations

1235-1-8020-2202
006183 000019

Drug Court

7206-1-1900-2005
006142 000104
006143 000105

Econ Dev Trust

7603-4-0500-2005

005160 000190
006171 000191
006172 000192
006218 000193

Emergency Mgmt

ZOETIS US LLC
ADA PAPER COMPANY

VET SUPPLIES
JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

PUBLIC SERVICE CO. OF OKLAHOMA MONTHLY SERVICE
MILLER OFFICE EQUIPMENT COPY OVERAGES
H & P MECHANICAL ANNUAL MAINTENANCE (
FUSION MONTHLY SERVICE
ATWOODS KENNEL SUPPLIES
Total: $ 3,321.48
ATWOODS DOG TREATS
Total: $ 184.85
REDWOOD TOXICOLOGY LABORATOR LAB FEES
MILLER OFFICE EQUIPMENT COPIER MAINTENANCE
Total: $ 809.94
STANDARD MACHINE & WELDING PARTS
ALEXANDER S REFRIGERATION LABOR AND PARTS
BEMAC SUPPLY PARTS
LINGO COMMUNICATIONS MONTHLY SERVICE
Total:  $ 3,240.06

Printed 8:52am
01/28/2022

Amount

$ 42432
$211.83
$ 880.04
$ 26.01
$513.50
$68.48
$1,197.30

$ 184.85

$ 731.53
$ 78.41

$38.15
$1,260.00
$1,794.97
$ 146.94
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PO Warrant No. Vendor Name

Emergency Mgmt

1212-2-2700-2005

006178 000178
006179 000179
General

0001-1-0100-2005
006201 002231

0001-1-1000-2005
006139 002232

0001-1-3300-2005

Purpose

CENTER POINT ENERGY ARKLA MONTHLY SERVICE
PUBLIC SERVICE CO. OF OKLAHOMA MONTHLY SERVICE

Total: $ 2,569.99
EVANS, KRISTY TRANSCRIPTS

Total: $ 192.50
MILLER OFFICE EQUIPMENT COPIER MAINTENANCE

Total: $ 141.65

BIZ-TEL AUDIO SYSTEM REPAIRS

MCALESTER NEWS CAPITAL & DEM.
CENTER POINT ENERGY ARKLA
PUBLIC SERVICE CO. OF OKLAHOMA

PUBLICATION
MONTHLY SERVICE
MONTHLY SERVICE

006037 002233
006070 002234
006161 002235
006162 002236
006163 002237

0001-2-0400-2012

006085 002238
006101 002239
006148 002240
006187 002241
006217 002242

0001-5-0900-1110
006166 002243

0001-5-0900-2005

006164 002244
006165 002245
006192 002246

CINTAS CORPORATION # 618 JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

Total: $1,052.39
US FOODS INMATE GROCERIES
PERFORMANCE FOODSERVICE - LITT  INMATE GROCERIES
US FOODS INMATE GROCERIES
PERFORMANCE FOODSERVICE - LITT  INMATE GROCERIES
LITTLE CEASARS INMATE GROCERIES

Total: $4,123.58
OSU COOPERATIVE EXTENSIVE SER.  PERSONAL SERVICES

Total: $17,333.33
US POSTMASTER BULK MAIL PERMIT
OSU COOPERATIVE EXTENSIVE SER.  POSTAGE EQUIPMENT
FUSION MONTHLY SERVICE

Total: $1,027.27

Amount

$ 1,362.40
$ 1,207.59

$ 192,50

$141.65

$ 190.00
$ 303.15
$ 265.25
$252.91

$41.08

$1,075.85
$1,048.79
$ 1,390.11
$ 183.08
$425.75

$17,333.33

$ 265.00
$ 600.00
$ 162.27
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PO Warrant No. Vendor Name

General

0001-6-0800-2005
005656 002247

Health

1216-3-5000-2005

005439 000189
006035 000190
006130 000191
Highway

1102-6-4300-2005
001336 001432
005659 001433
005705 001434
005980 001435
005982 001436
005999 001437
006000 001438
006031 001439
006077 001440
006082 001441
006084 001442
006106 001443
006112 001444
006167 001445
Hwy-ST

1313-6-8040-2005
004848 001664
005660 001665
005687 001666
005830 001667
005994 001668
006009 001669
006038 001670

STAPLES ADVANTAGE

MERCK ORDER MANAGEMENT
WEDDLE SIGNS
VIP VOICE SERVICES LLC

VAN KEPPLE CO.

BEMAC SUPPLY

TULSA ASPHALT LLC

ALL ABOUT U PLUMBING
RINKERS AUTO

W.E. ALLFORD PROPANE
STANDARD MACHINE & WELDING
FLEET PRIDE

PREMIER TRUCK GROUP
VYVE BROADBAND
HIDDEN HILLS EQUIPMENT
WELDON PARTS INC.
FLEET PRIDE

PATRIOT AUTO GROUP

CINTAS CORPORATION # 618
DOLESE

IBT INC.

DOLESE

ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
ASPHALT & FUEL SUPPLY
RAM INC

Purpose Amount
OFFICE SUPPLIES $ 359.11
Total: $ 359.11
VACCINE $ 2,959.35
SIGNS $745.76
MONTHLY SERVICE $ 3,544.85
Total: $7,249.96
PARTS $4,174.07
SHOP SUPPLIES $11.13
HOT MIX/COLD LAY $2,135.11
SHOP EQUIP. REPAIRS $ 450.00
DEF $ 775.00
PROPANE $90.68
SHOP EQUIP. REPAIRS $ 406.40
TARP PARTS $ 203.86
EQUIPMENT REPAIR $212.75
INTERNET SERVICE $110.95
GRADER BLADES $1,568.40
SHOP EQUIP. REPAIRS 53115
PARTS $78.38
EQUIPMENT REPAIR $ 135.00
Total: $ 10,382.88
UNIFORM MAINTENANCE $42.66
3/8" #2 COVER CHIPS $ 7,398.37
PARTS $1,026.42
3/8" #2 COVER CHIPS $ 7,386.67
PG 64-22 $ 13,486.50
PG 64-22 $ 13,059.15
FUEL $10,493.73
Total: $ 52,893.50
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PO Warrant No. Vendor Name Purpose

Hwy-ST

1313-6-8041-2005

005541 001671 STIGLER STONE 1" CRUSHER RUN
005543 001672 RINKERS AUTO PARTS & SHOP SUPPLIE
005567 001673 KIAMICHI AUTOMOTIVE WAREHOUSE ~ PARTS & SHOP SUPPLIE
005722 001674 STIGLER STONE 1" CRUSHER RUN
005832 001675 O REILLY AUTO PARTS PARTS

005841 001676 STIGLER STONE 1" CRUSHER RUN
005873 001677 CORE & MAIN PLASTIC PIPE
005983 001678 BRUCKNER TRUCK SALES INC FILTERS

005997 001679 BRUCKNER TRUCK SALES INC PARTS

006014 001680 ATWOODS SHOP SUPPLIES
006034 001681 O REILLY AUTO PARTS PARTS & SHOP SUPPLIE
006074 001682 AIRGAS WELDING SUPPLIES
006090 001683 FREEDOM FORD PARTS

006131 001684 T & W TIRE TIRES & SERVICES

Total: $ 24,383.32

1313-6-8041-4130

006193 001685 CATERPILLAR FINANCIAL LEASE PAYMENT
Total:
1313-6-8042-2005
001541 001686 OKLAHOMA TAX COMMISSION TAG & TITLE
002813 001687 BIZ-TEL LABOR
005958 001688 P & K EQUIPMENT CHAINSAW CHAINS
005992 001689 P & K EQUIPMENT PARTS
006015 001890 CANAM ROAD SERVICES LABOR
006061 001691 TRUCKPRO-FORT SMITH PARTS
006083 001692 FUGATES ROCK LLC RED GRAVEL
Total:
1313-6-8043-2005
005123 001693 CINTAS CORPORATION # 618 UNIFORM MAINTENANCE
005886 001694 STAPLES ADVANTAGE OFFICE SUPPLIES
006133 001695 KIAMICHI AUTOMOTIVE WAREHOUSE PARTS
006168 001696 RAM INC FUEL
006185 001697 FUSION MONTHLY SERVICE
Total:
Jail-ST

$2,981.97

$ 3,807.78

$ 7,899.51

Amount

$ 4,228.50
$ 955.00
$ 430.21

$4,213.03
$ 390.84

$4,233.26
$8,327.40
$ 281.92
$7.92
$319.95
$ 205.22
$ 24545
$ 59.59

$ 485.03

$2,981.97

$51.00

$ 285.00
$82.98

$ 136.84
$132.00
$2,130.96
$ 989.00

$ 1,998.84
$401.83

$ 685.94
$4,742.68
$70.22
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PO Warrant No. Vendor Name

Jail-ST

1315-2-8034-2005
005897 000484
005907 000485
006150 000486

1315-2-8034-2011
006067 000487

Rural Fire-ST

1321-2-8201-2005
004014 000561

1321-2-8204-4130
006205 000562

1321-2-8205-4130
006204 000563

1321-2-8207-2005

000974 000564
001523 000565
004565 000566

1321-2-8207-4130
006206 000567

1321-2-8210-2005
006123 000568

1321-2-8212-2005
006141 000569

Purpose

LOCKE HEATING & COOLING SUPPLY  JAIL MAINTENANCE SUP
LOCKE HEATING & COOLING SUPPLY JAIL MAINTENANCE SUP

PUBLIC SERVICE CO. OF OKLAHOMA

CARING HANDS HEALTHCARE CENTE

VICARS POWERSPORTS

WELCH STATE BANK

ARMSTRONG BANK

CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY

OKLAHOMA STATE BANK

THE BURROWS AGENCY

CITY OF MCALESTER

MONTHLY SERVICE

Total:

Total:

UTV REPAIR
Total:

LEASE PAYMENT
Total:

LEASE PAYMENT
Total:

PIKE POLES
HOSES ETC
WILDLAND BOOTS

Total:

LEASE PAYMENT
Total:

INSURANCE
Total:

MONTHLY SERVICE

$ 5,353.70

INMATE PRESCRIPTIONS

$4.00

$ 800.00

$1,018.50

$ 723.53

$ 4,409.00

$2,675.35

$ 10,542.00

Amount

$191.64
$ 354.90
$4,807.16

$4.00

$ 800.00

$1,018.50

$ 723.53

$ 252.00
$ 3,902.00
$ 255.00

$ 2,675.35

$10,542.00

$82.02
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PO Warrant No. Vendor Name

Rural Fire-ST

1321-2-8212-2005

1321-2-8214-2005
006144 000570

1321-2-8215-2005
006140 000571

1321-2-8216-2005
006007 000572
006202 000573

1321-2-8218-2005
006182 000574

1321-2-8219-2005

005498 000575
006157 000576
006170 000577

1321-2-8219-4130
006207 000578

1321-2-8225-2005

000089 000579
004636 000580
006134 000581
006135 000582

1321-2-8225-4110
001354 000583
001355 000584

ADT SECURITY SERVICES

PUBLIC SERVICE CO. OF OKLAHOMA

HOPKINS PROPANE
PUBLIC SERVICE CO. OF OKLAHOMA

OKLA. NATURAL GAS COMPANY

CASCO INDUSTRIES
FOMBY & SONS TOWING TRUCK & TIR
MCALESTER NEWS CAPITAL & DEM.

WELCH STATE BANK

O REILLY AUTO PARTS
COMDATA

RURAL WATER DIST #18

OKLA. NATURAL GAS COMPANY

CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY
CHIEF FIRE & SAFETY

Purpose

Total: $ 82.02

MONTHLY SERVICE

Total: $ 186.09

MONTHLY SERVICE

Total: $ 280.43

PROPANE
MONTHLY SERVICE

Total: $ 578.22

MONTHLY SERVICE

Total: $ 108.85

SCBA MASK
TOWING
PUBLICATION

Total: $ 2,004.85

LEASE PAYMENT

Total: $ 1,255.55

AUTO PARTS ETC.
FUEL
MONTHLY SERVICE
MONTHLY SERVICE

Total: $ 711.02

BUNKER GEAR
BED COVER

Amount

$ 186.09

$ 280.43

$461.60
$ 116.62

$ 108.85

$1,515.00
$ 450.00
$39.85

$1,255.55

$ 88.71
$ 27843
$ 200.00
$ 143.88

$ 11,400.00
$ 1,375.00
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PO Warrant No. Vendor Name

Rural Fire-ST

1321-2-8225-4110

1321-2-8225-4130
006197 000585
006208 000586

1321-2-8227-4130
006209 000587

SH Commissary

1223-2-0400-2005

001361 000172
005971 000173
005998 000174
006066 000175
006086 000176
006149 000177
006212 000178
SH Forf

1225-2-0400-2005
006109 000004

SH Svc Fee

1226-2-0400-2005

004804 000938
004871 000939
006100 000940
006107 000941
006156 000942
006189 000943

WELCH STATE BANK

K & B GENERAL CONSTRUCTION INC.

WELCH STATE BANK

GALLS LLC

COMMISSARY EXPRESS
CUSTOM TECHNOLOGIES LLC
COMMISSARY EXPRESS

US FOODS

GALLS LLC

OKLAHOMA TAX COMMISSION

US CELLULAR

AIRGAS

PEPSI-COLA BOTTLING CO.

T &WTIRE

PUBLIC SERVICE CO. OF OKLAHOMA
GALLS LLC

BUCK WILSON BODY SHOP

Purpose

Total: $12,775.00

LEASE PAYOFF
LEASE PAYMENT

Total: $ 5,362.50

LEASE PAYMENT

Total: $ 690.08

DEPT. BOOTS
INMATE COMMISSARY
INHOUSE COMMISSARY
KIOSK FEES
INHOUSE COMMISSARY
BADGE
INHOUSE COMMISSARY

Total: $10,578.70

MONTHLY SERVICE

Total: $97.25

WELDING SUPPLIES
INMATE WORK CREW
TIRE REPAIR
ELECTRIC/ JAIL STORAG
BADGE
AUTO REPAIR

Total: $ 6,451.25

Amount

$ 3,987.31
$1,375.19

$ 690.08

$2,878.00
$ 3,784.31
$2,135.76
$94.25
$179.54
$ 125.75
$1,381.09

$97.25

$132.09
$ 132.00
$ 60.00
$3.70

$ 109.57
$6,013.89
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PO

Warrant No. Vendor Name

SH Svc Fee

1226-2-3400-2005
003969 000944
003970 000945
004496 000946
004821 000947
006062 000948
006087 000949
006088 000950
006093 000951
006098 000952
006108 000953
006129 000954
006151 000955
006152 000956
006153 000957
006154 000958
006160 000959

1226-2-3400-2030

006068
006147
006155

000960
000961
000962

GALLS LLC

GALLS LLC

GALLS LLC

ON TARGET AMMUNITION
O REILLY AUTO PARTS

US FOODS

US FOODS

JAMESCO ENTERPRISES LLC
T&WTIRE

PEPSI-COLA BOTTLING CO.
W.E. ALLFORD PROPANE
GALLS LLC

GALLS LLC

GALLS LLC

GALLS LLC

GALLS LLC

COMMISSARY EXPRESS
MILLER OFFICE EQUIPMENT
PUBLIC SERVICE CO. OF OKLAHOMA

Purpose

BADGE

BADGE HOLDERS

BOOTS

AMMUNITION

AUTO & SHOP SUPPLIES
KITCHEN MAINTENANCE
JAIL KITCHEN SUPPLIES
JAIL MAINTENANCE SUP

TIRES

INMATE WORK CREW

BADGE
UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS
UNIFORMS

JAILERS UNIFORM BOOT

Total:

$ 6,202.19

DEBIT PHONE TIME FEE
COPIER MAINTENANCE

UTILITIES/OUTDOOR LIG
Total: $ 804.80
Grand Total: $ 217,649.95

Amount

$454.27
$144.24
$ 225.00
$ 2,342.69
$ 81.65
$ 205.55
$176.96
$ 268.28
$558.11
$ 120.00
$ 14.00
$105.57
$ 640.00
$ 390.00
$310.00
$ 165.87

$ 166.00
$ 536,62
$103.18
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SA&I 1-4046 (1982)
VENDOR TELEPHONE QUOTE SHEET

QUOTE GOODFOR ____DAYS

QUOTE GOOD FOR DAYS

QUOTE GOOD FOR DAYS

QUOTE GOOD UNTIL (DATE)

QUOTE GOOD UNTIL (DATE)

QUOTE GOOD UNTIL (DATE)

1124120227 venooR RAM vewor  |HOOTEN vewor  |HOPKINS
L15€ 10 OBTAIN BIDS FIR [TEMS GOSTING UNDER $750 NOT ON 6 MONTHS BDLIST represeNaTVE - |RONNIE represeNaTVE | DAVID OR repReSENATIVE| DONALD
DEPARTMENT BUYER OBTAINING QUOTE DELIVERY DATE CHARLIE OR ||psuvery pate STEVE DELIVERY DATE

P.O. NUMBER CLINT P.O. NUMBER P.O. NUMBER
HIGHWAY PURCHASING pronenumeer | 423-3121 pHone numeer | 800-256-4590 | |prone numeer 800-637-2412
PRICE PRICE PRICE

LINE NO UNITNO. |QuANITY|SUPPLIESISERVICES DESC. UNIT TOTAL UNIIT TOTAL UNIIT TOTAL

UNLEADED NON ETHANOL 2.85104 2.7500

UNDYED LOW SULPHUR DIESEL

2.94554

2.8600

DYED LOW SULPHUR DIESEL

2.94904

2.8600

PROPANE

2.7900
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